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Purchasing Division S
2019 Washington Street East Solicitation Response

Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

o

Proc Folder: 1704952
Solicitation Description: Addendum 1 Stone&Agg Mat. & Delivery to Non-Estab.Location

Proc Type: Agency Master Agreement
Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version
2025-07-16 10:30 SR 0803 ESR07152500000000223 1
VENDOR
000000100174

APPALACHIAN AGGREGATES LLC

Solicitation Number: ARFQ 0803 DOT2500000068
Total Bid: 0 Response Date: 2025-07-15
Comments:

Response Time: 22:16:22

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Jeromie F Lanham

304-720-7383

jeromie.f.lanham@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X FEIN#

DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Date Printed:  Jul 16, 2025 Page: 1

FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Class 1 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price
2 Class 1 Aggregate -LSGS

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

0.00000 TON 0.000000

0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification
11111600

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
3 Class 1 Aggregate -Slag 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
4 Class 2 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

5 Class 2 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000

Ln Total Or Contract Amount
0.00

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification
11111600

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 16, 2025 Page: 2

FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
6 Class 2 Aggregate -Slag 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
7 Class 10 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
8 AASHTO #1 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
9 AASHTO #1 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

10 AASHTO #3 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 0.000000

0.00

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification
11111600

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 16, 2025 Page: 3

FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
11 AASHTO #3 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
12 AASHTO #4 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
13 AASHTO #467 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
14 AASHTO #57 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

15 AASHTO #57 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000

0.00

Comm Code
11111600

Manufacturer Specification

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 16, 2025

Page: 4

FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
16 AASHTO #67 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
17 AASHTO #67 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
18 AASHTO #7 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
19 AASHTO #7 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

20 AASHTO #8 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 0.000000

0.00

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification
11111600

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 16, 2025 Page: 5

FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
21 AASHTO #8 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
22 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
23 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
24 AASHTO #9 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
25 AASHTO #9 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 16, 2025

Page: 6 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
26 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
27 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
28 AASHTO #10 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600
Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
29 Stone for Gabions -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
30 Stone for Gabions -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 16, 2025

Page: 7 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
31 Fine Aggregate (PCC or Mortar Sand) -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600
Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
32 Trail Surface Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600
Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
33 Limestone Standard Abrasives -Limestone 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00
Only
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
34 Limestone Standard Abrasives -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
35 Sandstone Standard Abrasives -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 16, 2025 Page: 8 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
36 Steel Slag for SRIC 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
37 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives -Limestone 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00
Only
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
38 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
39 Sandstone Modified Abrasives -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600
Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
40 Cinders 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 16, 2025 Page: 9 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
41 Pea Gravel -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
42 #11 Limestone Abrasives -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
43 Quarry Waste -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
44 Rip Rap -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
45 Shot Rock -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 16, 2025 Page: 10 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
46 Shot Rock -LSGS 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
47 Imbricated Stone 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
48 Spreading Surcharge/Tailgating 0.00000 TON 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

78121601

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
49 Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract Items 1-43) 0.00000 MILE 0.000000 0.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
78121601
Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
50 Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract Items 0.00000 MILE 0.000000 0.00
1-43)
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
78121601

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 16, 2025 Page: 11 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
51 Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract ltems 44-47) 0.00000 MILE 0.000000 0.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
78121601
Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
52 Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract Items 0.00000 MILE 0.000000 0.00
44-47)
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
78121601

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 16, 2025 Page: 12 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05



State of West Virginia
Agency Request for Quote

Highways
Proc Folder: 1704952 Reason for Modification:
Doc Description: Addendum 1 Stone&Agg Mat. & Delivery to Non-Estab.Location ADDENDUM 01
TO ATTACH RESPONSES TO
QUESTIONS FROM VENDORS
Proc Type: Agency Master Agreement
Date Issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation No Version
2025-07-01 20250716  10:30 ARFQ 0803 DOT2500000068 2

PROCUREMENT DiVISION
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

BLDG 6 RM 340A

1900 KANAWHA BLVD E
CHARLESTON WV 25305
us

VENDOR

Vendor CustomerCode: O 0 000 [0 17

Vendor Name : 4/?“/‘64"‘“# ,433'?9""4"

Address : 2/07 {
Street : m;‘,( lavet Tra:l W

City: [eeis éara
State Wl/ Country : vs Zip: 2 4yQ ey

Principal Contact: A ps Ay Clovinger / Doy Corterbrrs,

Vendor Contact Phone: 3 ¢ M-392- 5§72 Extension:

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Jeromie F Lanham

304-720-7383
jeromie.f.lanham@wv.gov

Vend ;
S?gnnaci)::lrex MZ&,/—— FEIN¢ O /- G4 0503 DATE 7’ 15-25"

All offers subject to 4l terms*and conditions contained in this solicitation
Date Printed: Jul 1, 2025 Page 1 FORM ID: WV-PRC-ARFQ-002 2020/05




R R T Do L L Ao A e
ADDIFIONALINEORMATION D e

ADDENDUM 1 1S ISSUED FOR THE FOLLOWING REASONS:
1. Attachment of the responses to questions.

2. Modify bid opening date.

NO OTHER CHANGES

INVOICETE : LSBT

VARIOUS AGENCY VARIOUS AGENCY

LOCATIONS LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

No City WV No City Wv

us us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
1 Class 1 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

iINVoICETONT _, Gl [SHipE i

VARIOUS AGENCY VARICUS AGENC

LOCATIONS LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY CRDER

No City Wwv No City Wy

us ' us

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
2 Class 1 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jun 12, 2024 Page 2 FORM ID: WV-PRC-ARFQ-002 2020/05




ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM
SOLICITATION NO.: ARFQ DOT2500000068

Instructions: Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by
completing this addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum
received and sign below. Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification.

Acknowledgment: I hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the
necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc.

Addendum Numbers Received:
(Check the box next to each addendum received)

Addendum No. 1 - [[]Addendum No. 6
[ ] Addendum No. 2 [] Addendum No. 7
[] Addendum No. 3 [ 1 Addendum No. 8
[] Addendum No. 4 [L] Addendum No. 9
[[] Addendum No. 5 [] Addendum No. 10

I understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid.
I further understand that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral
discussion held between Vendor’s representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only
the information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is

binding.

4,0/4/4::4-'@4 /i{g_g r*zjyfe_:(

Comﬁaﬁy
% e

Authorized Signature

77525

Date

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite
document processing.

Revised 11/1/2022




DESIGNATED CONTACT: Vendor appoints the individual identified in this Section as
the Contract Administrator and the initial point of contact for matters relating to this
Contract.

Andy Clevinger / Sales Manager

(Printed Name and Title)
21071 Midland Trail W, Lewisburg WV 24201

(Address)
304-392-5872 / 304-392-5828

(Phone Number) / (Fax Number)

andy.clevinger@appaggwy.com

(E-mail address)

CERTIFICATION AND SIGNATURE: By signing below, or submitting documentation
through wvOASIS, I certify that I have reviewed this Solicitation in its entirety; that I understand
the requirements, terms and conditions, and other information contained herein; that this bid,
offer or proposal constitutes an offer to the State that cannot be unilaterally withdrawn; that the
product or service proposed meets the mandatory requirements contained in the Solicitation for
that product or service, unless otherwise stated herein; that the Vendor accepts the terms and
conditions contained in the Solicitation, unless otherwise stated herein; that I am submitting this
bid, offer or proposal for review and consideration; ; that this bid or offer was made without prior
understanding, agreement, or connection with any entity submitting a bid or offer for the same
material, supplies, equipment or services; that this bid or offer is in all respects fair and without
collusion or fraud; that this Contract is accepted or entered into without any prior understanding,
agreement, or connection to any other entity that could be considered a violation of law; that {am
authorized by the Vendor to execute and submit this bid, offer, or proposal, o any dociments
related thereto on Vendor’s behalf; that I am authorized to bind the vendor in a contractual
relationship; and that to the best of my knowledge, the Vendor has properly registered with any
State agency that may require registration.

By signing below, I further certify that I understand this Contract is subjeci to the
provisions of West Vireinia Code § 54-3-62, which automatically voids certain contract
clauses that violate State law.

Appalachian Aggregates
(Company)

Cnts 4

(Signature of Authorized Representative)

Andy Clevinger / Sales Manager
(Printed Name and Title of Authorized Representative)

06/21/24

(Date)

304-392-5872 | 304-392-5828
(Phone Number) {(Fax Number)

Revised 8/24/2023




REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
Stone & Aggregate, Delivery to Non-Established Locations

8.3

84

8.5

Vendor Name Change: It is the Vendor’s responsibility to notify the WVDOH of
name changes or acquisition by another company during the term of the contract.
The WVDOH must be notified in writing of the change/acquisition and intention
for the contract’s ownership within 10 days of the change. Failure to do so may
result in payment delays.

Reports: Vendor shall provide the Agency with quarterly reports, annual
summaries, and/or monthly reports as requested by the Agency and/or the West
Virginia Purchasing Division showing quantities, total dollar value of the Contract
Items purchased, ordered, shipped & invoiced with dates in spreadsheet format as
defined by the Agency. Failure to supply such reports may be grounds for
cancellation of this Contract.

Contract Manager: During its performance of this Contract, Vendor must
designate and maintain a primary Contract Manager responsible for overseeing
Vendor’s responsibilities under this Contract. The Contract Manager must be
available during normal business hours to address any customer service or other
issues related to this Contract. Vendor should list its Contract Manager and his or
her contact information below.

Contract Manager: 4{\(0& c [ EViNM gar
Telephone Number: Rou- 292- 3582722
Fax Number: 304~ 392 - 5F25

Email Address: awoly, ¢ {ﬁg.',.rg“@ QLLan ¢ WAL Can
Vendor shall inform the Agency in writing of any changes to the information

provided above within 10 calendar days of such changes. Failure to comply may
be grounds for cancellation of this contract.

Form Revised 10/27/2014 19 AMA 6625C020




Stone Aggregate Delivery to Non-Established Locations
Attachment A (ATT A) Pricing Pages
VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: Vendor shall provide their Source Plant address and bid pricing for the Contract Item listed
below. Failure to provide Source Plant locations will result in the disqualification of the entire bid. If Vendor needs
additional space to list their plants, please use the Supplemental to ATT A. This is a multiple vendor award contract.
Vendor may bid any or all Contract ltems. All qualifying vendors meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with
a contract. The low bid vendor per project will be determined at the time of need, as per Section 4 of the Contract
Specifications. No future use of this Contract is guaranteed or implied. Estimated quantities are not available.
VENDOR NAME: Appalachian Aggregates LLC
Source Plant Names & Addresses:
(Please provide a negative (-) with the longitudes.)
NOTE: Use Supplemental attachment if additional space is needed.
Name: Appalachian Aggregates, LLC -Alta quarry Latfitude: 37.87952
Address. 21071 Midland Trail W, Lewisburg, WV 24901 Longitude: -80.55719
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude;
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: L atfitude:
Address: Longitude:
Contract - . . . oo
Ytem Description Composition* Unit of Measure Bid Price
1 Class 1 Aggregate Limestane Only Tons $10.90
2 Class 1 Aggregate LSGS Tons
3 Class 1 Aggregate Slag Tons
4 Class 2 Aggregaie Limestone Only Tons $10.90
5 Class 2 Aggregate L3GS Tons
8 Class 2 Aggregate Slag Tons
7 Class 10 Aggregate L3GS Tons $10.90
8 AASHTO #1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $14.85
9 AASHTO #1 Agaregate LSGS Tons
10 AASHTO #3 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $14.85
11 AASHTO #3 Aggregate LSGS Tons
12 AASHTO #4 Aggregate LSGS Tons $14.85
13 AASHTO #467 Aggregate LSGS Tons $16.50
14 AASHTO #57 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $16.50
15 AASHTO #57 Aggregate LSGS Tons
16 AASHTO #67 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $16.50
17 AASHTO #67 Aggregate LSGS Tons
18 AASHTO #7 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons
19 AASHTOC #7 Aggregate LSGS Tons
20 AASHTO #8 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $16.85
21 AASHTO #8 Aggregate LSGS Tons
22 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons $16.85
23 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED LSGS Tons
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Stone Aggregate Delivery to Non-Established Locations
Attachment A (ATT A} Pricing Pages
VENDOR NAME: Appalachian Aggregates LLC
Source Plani Names & Addresses:
(Please provide a negative (-) with the longitudes.)
NOTE: Use Supplemental attachment if additional space is needed.
Name: Appalachian Aggregates, LLC -Alta quarry Latitude: 37.87952
Address: 21071 Midland Trail W, Lewisburg, WV 24801 Longitude: -80.55719
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Contract sl ioe . . .
Ttem Description Composition* Unit of Measure Bid Price
24 AASHTO #9 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $18.50
25 AASHTO #9 Aggregate LSGS Tons
26 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons $18.50
27 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED LSGS Tons
28 AASHTO #10 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $18.00
29 Stone for Gabions Limestone Only Tons $14.85
30 Stone for Gabions LSGS Tons
31 Fine Aggregate (PCC or Mortar Sand) LSGS Tons $19.85
32 Trail Surface Aggregate LSGS Tons $10.90
33 Limestone Standard Abrasives Limestone Only Tons $18.00
34 Limestone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons
35 Sandstone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons
36 Steel Slag for SRIC Slag Tons
37 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives Limestone Only Tons $10.50
38 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Tons
39 Sandstone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Tons
40 Cinders Cinders Tons
41 Pea Gravel LSGS Tons
42 #11 Limestone Abrasives LSGS Tons
43 Quarry Waste LSGS Tons $13.50
44 Rip Rap LSGS Tons $23.00
45 Shot Rock Limestone Only Tons $23.00
46 Shot Rock LSGS Tons
47 Imbricated Stone LSGS Tons
48 Spreading Surcharge/Tailgating Tons $0.30
49 Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract ltems 1-43) Mile $1.60
50 Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract ltems 1-43) Mile $0.40
51 Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract tems 44-47) Mile $2.25
52 Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract ltems 44-47) Mile $0.50
*LSGS: Limestone, Sandstone, Gravel or Sand
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Stone Aggregate Delivery to Non-Established Locations
Attachment A (ATT A) Pricing Pages
VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: Vendor shall provide their Source Plant address and bid pricing for the Contract ltem listed
below. Failure to provide Source Plant locations will result in the disqualification of the entire bid. If Vendor needs
additional space to list their plants, please use the Supplemental to ATT A. This is a multiple vendor award contract.
Vendor may bid any or all Contract ltems. All qualifying vendors meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with
a confract. The low bid vendor per project will be determined at the time of need, as per Section 4 of the Contract
Specifications. No future use of this Contract is guaranteed or implied. Estimated quantities are not available.
VENDOR NAME: Appalachian Aggregates LLC
Source Plant Names & Addresses:
{Please provide a negative (-) with the longitudes.)
NOTE: Use Supplemental attachment if additional space is needed.
Name: Appalachian Aggregates, LLC -Milf Point quarry Latitude: 38.16257
Address: 400 Stamping Creek Rd, Hillsboro, WV 24946 Longitude: -80.18476
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address:. Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Contract . L . . .
Ttem Description Coniposition Unit of Measure Bid Price
1 Class 1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $14.75
2 Class 1 Aggregate LSGS Tons
3 Class 1 Aggregate Slag Tons
4 Class 2 Agaregate Limestone Only Tons $14.75
5 Class 2 Agaregate LSGS Tons
9] Class 2 Aggregate Slag Tons
7 Class 10 Aggregate LSGS Tons $14.75
8 AASHTO #1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $17.15
9 AASHTO #1 Aggregate LSGS Tons
10 AASHTO #3 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $17.15
11 AASHTO #3 Aggregate LSGS Tons
12 AASHTO #4 Aggregate LSGS Tons $17.75
13 AASHTO #467 Aggregate LSGS Tons $17.75
14 AASHTO #57 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $17.50
15 AASHTO #57 Aggregate LSGS Tons
16 AASHTO #67 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $17.75
17 AASHTO #67 Aggregate LSGS Tons
18 AASHTO #7 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons I~
19 AASHTO #7 Aggregate LSGS Tons
20 AASHTO #8 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $19.50
21 AASHTO #8 Aggregate LSGS Tons
22 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons $19.50
23 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED LSGS Tons =
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Stone Agaregate Delivery to Non-Established Locations
Attachment A (ATT A) Pricing Pages
VENDOR NAME: Appalachian Aggregates LLC
Source Plant Names & Addresses:
{Please provide a negative (-) with the longitudes.)
NOTE: Use Supplemental attachment if additional space is needed.
Name: Appalachian Aggregates, LLC -Mill Point quarry Latitude: 38.16257
Address. 400 Stamping Creek Rd, Hillsboro, WV 24946 Longitude: -80.18476
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
" Contract o e . N T o .
Ttem Description Composition™ Unit of Measure . Bid Price
24 AASHTO #9 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $20.50
25 AASHTO #9 Aggregate LSGS Tons
26 AASHTO #9 MOBIFIED Limestone Only Tons $20.50
27 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED LSGS Tons
28 AASHTO #10 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $18.00
29 Stone for Gahions Limestone Cnly Tons $17.15
30 Stone for Gabions LSGS Tons
31 Fine Aggregate (PCC or Mortar Sand) LSGS Tons
32 Trail Surface Aggregate LSGS Tons $14.75
33 Limestone Standard Abrasives Limestone Only Tons $18.00
34 Limestone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons
39 Sandstone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons
36 Sieel Slag for SRIC Slag Tons
37 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives Limestone Only Tons $19.00
38 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Tons
39 Sandstone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Tons
40 Cinders Cinders Tons
41 Pea Gravel LSGS Tons
42 #11 Limestone Abrasives LSGS Tons
43 Quarry Waste LSGS Tons $15.00
44 Rip Rap LSGS Tons $24.00
45 Shot Rock Limestone Only Tons $24.00
46 Shot Rack LSGS Tons
47 Imbricated Stone LSGS Tons
48 Spreading Surcharge/Tailgating Tons $0.30
49 Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract items 1-43) Mile $1.60 B
50 Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract ltems 1-43) Mile $0.40
51 Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract [tems 44-47) Mile $2.25
52 Haul, Additional Ton-Mile {Contract ltems 44-47) Mile $0.50
*LSGS: Limestone, Sandstone, Gravel or Sand
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Stone Aggregate Delivery to Non-Established Locations
Attachment A (ATT A) Pricing Pages
VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: Vendor shall provide their Source Plant address and bid pricing for the Contract ltem listed
below. Failure to provide Source Plant locations will result in the disqualification of the entire bid. If Vendor needs
additional space to list their plants, please use the Supplemental to ATT A. This is a multiple vendor award contract.
Vendor may bid any or all Contract ltems. All qualifying vendors meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with
a contract. The low bid vendor per project will be determined at the time of need, as per Section 4 of the Contract
Specifications. No future use of this Contract is guaranteed or implied. Estimated guantities are not available.
VENDOR NAME: Appalachian Agg_!'_t.a_gates LLC
Source Plant Names & Addresses:
(Please provide a negative {-) with the longitudes.)
NOTE: Use Supplemental attachment if additional space is needed.
Name: _Appalachian Aggregates, LLC -Beckley quarry Latitude: 37.85859
Address: 1700 North Sandbranch Rd Mt.Hope, WV 25880 Longitude: -81.24846
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name; Latitude:
Address; Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: " longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Contract - ' T I . .
Ttem . ~ Description ~Composition* | Unit of Measure Bid Price
1 Class 1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons
2 Class 1 Aggregate LSGS Tons $21.00
3 Class 1 Aggregate Slag Tons
4 Class 2 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons
5 Class 2 Aggregate LSGS Tons $21.00
6 Class 2 Aggregate Slag Tons
7 Class 10 Aggregate LSGS Tons $21.00
8 AASHTO #1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons
9 AASHTO #1 Aggregate LSGS Tons
10 AASHTO #3 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons
11 AASHTO #3 Aggregate LSGS Tons $23.00
12 AASHTO #4 Aggregate LSGS Tons $24.00
13 AASHTO #487 Aggregate LSGS Tons
14 AASHTO #57 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons
15 AASHTO #57 Aggregate LSGS Tons $24.50
16 AASHTO #67 Aagregate Limestone Only Tons
17 AASHTO #67 Aggregate LSGS Tons
18 |AASHTO #7 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons B
19 AASHTO #7 Aggregate LSGS Tons
20 AASHTO #8 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons
21 AASHTO #8 Aggregate LSGS Tons $25.50
22 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons
23 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED LSGS Tons $25.50 =
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Stone Aggregate Delivery to Non-Established Locations
Attachment A (ATT A) Pricing Pages
VENDOR NAME: Appalachian Aggregates LLC
Source Plant Names & Addresses:
{Please provide a negative (-) with the longitudes.)
NOTE: Use Supplemental attachment if additional space is needed.
Name: Appalachian Aggregates, LLC -Beckley quarry Latitude: 37.85859
Address: 1700 North Sandbranch Rd Mt.Hope, WV 25880 Longitude: -31.24846
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Contract " s . . .
Ttem Description Composition* Unit of Measure Bid Price
24 AASHTO #9 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons
25 AASHTO #9 Aggregate LSGS Tons
26 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons
27 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED LSGS Tons
28 AASHTO #10 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons
29 Stone for Gabions Limestone Only Tons
30 Stone for Gahions LSGS Tons $24.50
31 Fine Aggregate (PCC or Mortar Sand) LSGS Tons
32 Trail Surface Aggregate LSGS Tons
33 Limestone Standard Abrasives Limestone Only Tons
34 Limestone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons
35 Sandstone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons $24.50
36 Steel Slag for SRIC Slag Tons
37 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives Limestone Only Tons
38 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Tons
39 Sandstone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Tons $25.50
40 Cinders Cinders Tons
41 Pea Gravel LSGS Tons
42 #11 Limestone Abrasives LSGS Tons
43 Quairy Waste LSGS Tons $20.00
44 Rip Rap LSGS Tons $24.00
45 Shot Rock Limestone Only Tons $24.00
46 Shot Rock LSGS Tons
47 Imbricated Stone LSGS Tons
43 Spreading Surcharge/Tailgating Tons $0.30
49 Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract ltems 1-43) Mile $1.60
50 Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract Items 1-43) Mile $0.40
51 Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract ltems 44-47) Mile $2.25
b2 Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract ltems 44-47) Mile $0.50
*LSGS: Limestone, Sandstone, Gravel or Sand
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Stone Aggregate Delivery to Non-Established Locations
Attachment A (ATT A) Pricing Pages
VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: Vendor shall provide their Source Plant address and bid pricing for the Contract ltem listed
below. Failure to provide Source Plant locations will result in the disqualification of the entire bid. If Vendor needs
additional space to list their plants, please use the Supplemental to ATT A. This is a multiple vendor award contract.
Vendor may bid any or all Contract Items. All qualifying vendors meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with
a contract. The low bid vendor per project will be determined at the time of need, as per Section 4 of the Contract
Specifications. No future use of this Contract is guaranteed or implied. Estimated quantities are not available.
VENDOR NAME: Appalachian Agg_;_regates LLC
Source Plant Names & Addresses:
{Please provide a negative (-) with the longitudes.)
NOTE: Use Supplemental attachment if additional space is needed.
Name: Appalachian Aggregates, LLC - Elkins quarry Latitude: 38.89669
Address: 5908 Chenoweth Creek Rd, Elkins, WV 2641 LongLitude: -79.77177
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name; Latitude:
Address:; Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Contract . . . . .
Ttem Description Composition* Unit of Measure Bid Price
1 Class 1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $11.25
2 Class 1 Aggregate LSGS Tons
3 Class 1 Aggregate Slag Tons
4 Class 2 Aggregaie Limestone Only Tons $11.25
5 Class 2 Aggregate L8GS Tons
6 Class 2 Aggregate Slag Tons
7 Class 10 Aggregate LSGS Tons $11.25
8 AASHTO #1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $16.45
9 AASHTO #1 Aggregate LSGS Tons
10 AASHTO #3 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $16.45
i1 AASHTO #3 Aggregate LSGS Tons
12 |AASHTO #4 Aggregate LSGS Tons $17.35
13 AASHTO #467 Aggregate LSGS Tons $17.35
14 AASHTO #57 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $15.85
15 AASHTO #57 Aggregate LSGS Tons
16 AASHTO #67 Aagregate Limestone Only Tons
17 AASHTO #67 Aggregate LSGS Tons
18 AASHTO #7 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons
19 AASHTO #7 Aggregate LSGS Tons
20 AASHTO #8 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $18.65
21 AASHTO #8 Aggregate LSGS Tons
22 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons $18.65
23 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED LSGS Tons
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Stone Aggregate Delivery to Non-Established Locations
Attachment A (ATT A} Pricing Pages
VENDOR NAME: Appalachian Aggregates LLC
Source Plant Names & Addresses:
{Please provide a negative (-) with the longitudes.)
NOTE: Use Supplemental attachment if additional space is needed.
Name: Appalachian Aggregates, LLC - Elkins quarry Latitude: 38.89669
Address: 5908 Chenoweth Creek Rd, Elkins, WV 2641 Longitude: -79.77177
Name: Latifude:
Address: Longitude:
Nama: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Contract o i . . .
Fem Description Composition* Unit of Measure |  Bid Price
24 AASHTO #9 Aggregate Limestcne Only Tons $19.75
25 AASHTO #9 Aggregate LSGS Tons
26 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons $19.75
27 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED L3SGS Tons
28 AASHTO #10 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $16.50
29 Stone for Gabicns Limestone Only Tons $16.45
30 Stone for Gahicns LSGS Tons
31 Fine Aggregate (PCC or Mortar Sand) LSGS Tons
32 Trail Surface Aggregate LSGS Tons $14.75
33 Limestone Standard Abrasives Limestone Only Tons $18.00
34 Limestone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons
35 Sandstone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons
36 Steel Slag for SRIC Slag Tons
37 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives Limestone Only Tons $19.00
38 Limestone MODIFIED Ahrasives LSGS Tons
39 Sandstone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Tons
40 Cinders Cinders Tons
41 Pea Gravel LSGS Tons
42 #11 Limestong Abrasives LSGS Tons
43 Quarry Waste LSGS Tons $13.00
44 Rip Rap LSGS Tons $21.00
45 Shot Rock Limestona Only Tons $21.00
46 Shot Rock LSGS Tons
47 Imbricated Stone LSGS Tons
48 Spreading Surcharge/Tailgating Tons $0.30
49 Haul, First Ton-Mile {Contract Items 1-43) Mile $1.55
50 Haul, Additional Ton-Mile {Contract Items 1-43) Mile $0.38
51 Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract Items 44-47) Mile $2.25
52 Haul, Additional Ton-Mile {Contract Items 44-47) Mile $0.50
*LSGS: Limestone, Sandstone, Gravel or Sand
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Stone Aggregate Delivery to Non-Established Locations
Attachment A (ATT A) Pricing Pages

VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: Vendor shall provide their Source Plant address and bid pricing for the Contract ltem listed
below, Failure to provide Source Plant locations will result in the disqualification of the entire bid. If Vendor needs
additional space to list their plants, please use the Supplemental to ATT A. This is a multiple vendor award contract.
Vendor may bid any or all Contract ltems. All qualifying vendors meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with
a contract. The low bhid vendor per project will be determined at the time of need, as per Section 4 of the Contract
Specifications. No future use of this Contract is guaranteed or implied. Estimated quantities are not available.

VENDOR NAME:

Appalachian Aggregates, LL.C

Source Plant Names & Addresses:

{Please provide a negative (-) with the longitudes.)

NOTE: Use Supplemental attachment If additional space is needed.

Delivery to Non-Established Locations

Name: Appalachian Aggregates - Mercer Quarry
Latitude: 37.303316
Address: 1111 Blake Hollow Rd. Princeton, WV 27740 Longitude: -81.066856
Name:  Appalachian Aggregates - Bluefield Quarry
Latitude: 37.234346
Address: 171 St. Clairs Crossing Bluefield, VA 24605 Longitude: -81.320049
Name: Appalachian Aggregates -Pounding Mill Quarry
Latitude: 37.077528
Address: 121 Quarry Rd Pounding Mill , VA 24637 Longitude: -81.707447
C(;Itl:::a _Description Composition* Unit of Measure Bid Price
1 Class 1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $12.00
2 Class 1 Aggregate LSGS Tons $12.00
3 Class 1 Aggregate Slag Tons no bid
4 Class 2 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $12.00
5 Class 2 Aggregate L3SGS Tons $12.00
6 Class 2 Aggregate Slag Tons no bid
7 Class 10 Aggregaie LSGS Tons $17.00
8 AASHTO #1 Aggregatie Limestone Only Tons $17.00
9 AASHTO #1 Aggregate LSGS Tons $17.00
10 AASHTO #3 Aggregate Limestone Cnly Tons $17.00
11 AASHTO #3 Aggregate LSGS Tons $17.00
12 AASHTO #4 Aggregate LSGS Tons $17.00
13 |AASHTO #467 Aggregate LSGS Tons $17.00
14 AASHTO #57 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $17.00
15 AASHTO #57 Aggregate LSGS Tons $17.00
16 AASHTO #67 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $18.00
17 AASHTO #67 Aggregate LSGS Tons $18.00
18 |AASHTO #7 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons no bid
19 AASHTO #7 Aggregate LSGS Tons no bid
20 AASHTO #8 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $18.50
21 AASHTO #8 Aggregafe LSGS Tons $18.50
22 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons $18.50
23 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED LSGS Tons $18.50
24 AASHTO #9 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $19.75
25 AASHTO #9 Aggregate LSGS Tons $19.75
26 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED Limesfone Only Tons $19.75
27 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED LSGS Tons $19.75
28 AASHTO #10 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $17.00
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Stone Aggregate Delivery to Non-Established Locations
Attachment A (ATT A) Pricing Pages

VENDOR NAME: Appalachian Aggregates, LLC
Source Plant Names & Addresses:
(Please provide a negative {-) with the longitudes.}
NOTE: Use Supplemental attachment if additional space is needed.
Name: Appalachian Aggregates - Mercer Quarry
Latitude: 37.303316
Address: 1111 Blake Hollow Rd. Princeton, WV 27740 Longitude: -81.066856
Name: Appalachian Aggregates - Bluefield Quarry
Latitude: 37.234346
Address: 171 St. Clairs Crossing Bluefield, VA 24605 Longitude: -81.320049
Name: Appalachian Aggregates -Pounding Mill Quarry
_ Latitude: 37.077528
| _Address: 121 Quarry Rd Pounding Mill , VA 24637 Longitude: -81.707447
Contract - e . PR
Ttem Description Composition Unit of Measure Bid Price
29 Stone for Gabions Limestone Only Tons $17.00
30 Stone for Gabions LSGS Tons $17.00
31 Fine Aggregate (PCC or Mortar Sand) LSGS Tons $24.00
32 Trail Surface Aggregate LSGS Tons $13.00
33 Limestone Standard Abrasives Limestone Only Tons $18.50
34 Limestone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons $18.50
35 Sandstone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons no bid
36 Steel Slag for SRIC Siag Tons no bid
37 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives Limestone Only Tons $19.75
38 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Tons $19.75
39 Sandstone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Tons no bid
40 Cinders Cinders Tons no bid
41 Pea Gravel LSGS Tons no bid
42 #11 Limestone Abrasives L.SGS Tons no bid
43 Quarry Waste LSGS Tons $12.50
44 Rip Rap LSGS Tons $17.00
45 Shot Rock Limestone Only Tons $17.00
46 Shot Rock LSGS Tons $17.00
47 Imbricated Stone LSGS Tons no bid
48 Spreading Surcharge/Tailgating Tons $0.30
49 Haul, First Ton-Mile {Contract Items 1-43) Mile $1.60
50 Haut, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract ltems 1-43) Mile $0.40
51 Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract Items 44-47) Mile $2.25
52 Haul, Additional Ton-Mile {(Contract Items 44-47) Mile $0.50
*LSGS: Limestone, Sandstone, Gravel or Sand
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,QCORD*

CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

DATE (MMDD/YYYY)
B/23i2024

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS RC RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: [f the ceriificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy{les) must have ADGITIONAL INSURED provisicns or be endorsed.
H SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subjoct to tha torms and conditions of the policy, cortain pollcies may require an endorsament. A statement on
this corliflcate does not confer rights to the certificate halder In lieu of such endorsement(s).

PROGUCER . i Valerie Reece
Liberly Mutual Insurance Co. National Insurance East PHORE 513-067-3822 TAK
500 N 3rd St, Suite 300 LA, o, Ex): {A/C, Nol:
Wausau, Wl 54403 ADDRESS: Qldcastie.cerls@tiberiyMutusl.com
INSURER[S] AFFCRUING COVERAGE NAIC #
www LibgriyMuival.com INSURER A: _Libarly Mutual Fire Insurance Company 23035
IMjammallachian Aggregates, LLC (226-CHI) NSURERS:
PE)pDrawer 92;;19 gates. INSURERG
Chilhowie VA 24319 INSURERD :
iNSURERE:
INSURERF :

COVERAGES

CERTIFICATE NUMBER: 81545294

REVISION NUMBER:

THIS IS TQ CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURAMCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERICD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREWN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXGLUSIONS AND GONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

ADDL{SUBH]

LR TYPE OF INSURAKCE INSD ] wvp POLICY NUMBER BB OHTeY ﬁg_ﬂfﬂv% LIMITS
A | # | COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY 7 TB2-C81-004095-114 9/4/2024 |9M/2025 | EACH OCCURRENGE $2,000,000
| CLAIMS-MADE OCCUR XCU Coverage Included PREMISES {En serurroncoy | $300.000
[/ | Primany/Non-Contribuitory 9 MED EXP {Any one person) | $50,000
| v | Separation of Insured PERSONAL & ADV INJURY | $2,000,000
GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER. GENERAL AGGREGATE $2,000,000
roucy [ )58 | ]ioc PROCUCTS - COMPIOP AGG | §2,000,000
OTHER: 5
A | AvtomoBILELIABIITY v AS2-C81-D04005-124 91172024  [9/1/2025 | GIMBIEDSINGLELMIT |84 nep gog
/| ANY AuTO BODILY INJURY (Per gorson) | §
A ] owneD SCHEDULED AS2-CB1-054502-524 9172024 (94172025 -
|| AUTOS ONLY AUTOS Physical Damage anl BOBILY INJURY {Por accident)| §
NOK-OWNED ¥ ge enly: PROPERTY DAMAGE s
|t AUTOS QLY AUTOS ONLY Comprehensive Ded $18,000 | (Pat atcidant)
Collislon Dad $10,000 s
|| umerELLALIAD OCCUR EACH OCCURRENGE (3
EXCESS LIAB GLAIMS-MADE| AGGREGATE ]
DED [ | RETENTIONS - - s
WORKERS COMPENBATION
AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY vy | SForre {[EH
ANYPROPRIETORPARTNEREXECUTIVE EL. EACH AGCIDENT 3
OFFICERMEMBEREXCLUDED? NiA
{Mandstory n NH) L DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE| §
i yoa, desuribe tndar
DLLAIFTION OF DPERATIONS batow EL. DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT | 3

RE: CRFQ DOT 24* (2 Stone Pick Up,

by writtan contract.
30-day Notica of Cancellation.

DESCRIPTION OF OFERATIONS / LOCATIONS f VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Scheduls, may bu atteched If more space [n requirad)

Certificate Holder is fisted as additional insured with regards to the general lfability and automobile liability policies, where required

_CERTIFICATE HOLDER

CANCELLATION

West Virginia Department of Administratio
Purchasmﬁlesmn

n

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE GANCELLED EEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DEUVERED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

%%1 QB \.'\J'.'aiss(J 1%%ton Street East
OX
Chartestﬂn WV 25305 AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE y . ‘?
ZLiie S Hevce
1 Valerie Reace
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81545294 | 8-004035 ! 09.24~09.25 Standard GLFAL 10-2 Excess AUTO | Erin Celimg ) 8/23/2024 11:11:12 AW {COT) ! Fage § of &




