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,a{;wﬂ?%}ﬁ Department of Administration State of West Virginia

Q . Lo
Purchasing Division S
2019 Washington Street East Solicitation Response

Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

o

Proc Folder: 1704952
Solicitation Description: Addendum 1 Stone&Agg Mat. & Delivery to Non-Estab.Location

Proc Type: Agency Master Agreement
Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version
2025-07-16 10:30 SR 0803 ESR07102500000000107 1
VENDOR
VC0000096990

EAST RIVER AGGREGATES INC

Solicitation Number: ARFQ 0803 DOT2500000068
Total Bid: 0 Response Date: 2025-07-10
Comments:

Response Time: 09:57:05

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Jeromie F Lanham

304-720-7383

jeromie.f.lanham@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X FEIN#

DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Date Printed:  Jul 16, 2025 Page: 1

FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Class 1 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price
2 Class 1 Aggregate -LSGS

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

0.00000 TON 1.000000

0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification
11111600

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
3 Class 1 Aggregate -Slag 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
4 Class 2 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

5 Class 2 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 1.000000

Ln Total Or Contract Amount
0.00

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification
11111600

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 16, 2025 Page: 2

FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
6 Class 2 Aggregate -Slag 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
7 Class 10 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
8 AASHTO #1 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
9 AASHTO #1 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

10 AASHTO #3 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 1.000000

0.00

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification
11111600

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 16, 2025 Page: 3

FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
11 AASHTO #3 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
12 AASHTO #4 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
13 AASHTO #467 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
14 AASHTO #57 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

15 AASHTO #57 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 1.000000

0.00

Comm Code
11111600

Manufacturer Specification

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 16, 2025

Page: 4

FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
16 AASHTO #67 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
17 AASHTO #67 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
18 AASHTO #7 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
19 AASHTO #7 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

20 AASHTO #8 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 1.000000

0.00

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification
11111600

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 16, 2025 Page: 5

FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
21 AASHTO #8 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
22 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
23 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED -LSGS 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
24 AASHTO #9 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
25 AASHTO #9 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 16, 2025

Page: 6 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
26 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
27 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED -LSGS 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
28 AASHTO #10 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600
Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
29 Stone for Gabions -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
30 Stone for Gabions -LSGS 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 16, 2025

Page: 7 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
31 Fine Aggregate (PCC or Mortar Sand) -LSGS 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600
Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
32 Trail Surface Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600
Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
33 Limestone Standard Abrasives -Limestone 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00
Only
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
34 Limestone Standard Abrasives -LSGS 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
35 Sandstone Standard Abrasives -LSGS 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 16, 2025 Page: 8 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
36 Steel Slag for SRIC 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
37 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives -Limestone 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00
Only
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
38 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives -LSGS 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
39 Sandstone Modified Abrasives -LSGS 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600
Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
40 Cinders 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 16, 2025 Page: 9 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
41 Pea Gravel -LSGS 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
42 #11 Limestone Abrasives -LSGS 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
43 Quarry Waste -LSGS 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
44 Rip Rap -LSGS 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
45 Shot Rock -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 16, 2025 Page: 10 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
46 Shot Rock -LSGS 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
47 Imbricated Stone 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
48 Spreading Surcharge/Tailgating 0.00000 TON 1.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

78121601

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
49 Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract Items 1-43) 0.00000 MILE 1.000000 0.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
78121601
Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
50 Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract Items 0.00000 MILE 1.000000 0.00
1-43)
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
78121601

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 16, 2025 Page: 11 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
51 Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract ltems 44-47) 0.00000 MILE 1.000000 0.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
78121601
Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
52 Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract Items 0.00000 MILE 1.000000 0.00
44-47)
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
78121601

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 16, 2025 Page: 12 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05



State of West Virginia
Agency Request for Quote
Highways

Proc Folder: 1704852 Reason for Modification:
Doc Description: Stone & Agg Material & Delivery to Non-Established Locations

Proc Type: Agency Master Agreement
Date Issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation No Version
2025-06-19 2025-07-16 10:30 ARFQ 0803 DOT2500000068 1

PROCUREMENT DIVISION

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

BLDG 6 RM 340A

1900 KANAWHA BLVD E
CHARLESTON Wy 26305
us

VENDOR

Vendor Customer Code: VC0 000 © 49 70
Vendor Name: €ast River Agg ’“"j‘\%S

5
Address : PD Box 77 S

Street :

City: Trincefon

State's ‘Wi Country: US Zip: K242
Principal Contact : ¢zl on Uenke g

Vendor Contact Phone: 3, Y- > o ¥ 28 Extension:

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Jeromie F Lanham

304-720-7383
jeromie.f.lanham@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X 7( AN FEINg ¥7-A53 070 | DATE 7/ 7/95

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Date Printed: Jun 19, 2025 Page 1 FORM 1D: WV-PRC-ARFQ-002 2020/05



THE WEST VIRGINIA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION - PROCUREMENT DIVISION - SOLICITATION OF AN GPEN-
END CONTRACT OF STONE & AGGREGATE MATERIAL & DELIVERY TO NON-ESTABLISHED LOCATIONS FOR STATEWIDE
USE PER THE ATTACHED DOCUMENTS.

QUESTIONS REGARDING THE SOLICITATION MUST BE SUBMITTED IN WRITING TO
DOTPROCUREMENTTECHQUES@WV.GOV PRIOR TO THE QUESTION PERIOD DEADLINE CONTAINED IN THE
INSTRUCTIONS TO VENDORS SUBMITTING BIBS.

**itt***ﬁNOTlCEi*t**iiiﬁ
WE DO NOT ACCEPT EMAIL BIDS

MUST USE ONE THE FOLLOWING TO SUBMIT A BID:
* UPLOAD TO OASIS
* HAND DELIVERY
* MAIL IN HARD COPY
* FAX TO 304-558-0047

MAKE SURE YOU DOWNLOAD ALL INFORMATION - THE COMPLETE SOLICITATION - PRICING PAGES - SIGN THE PAGES
THAT NEED SIGNED

PLEASE NOTE THAT TO BE AWARDED THIS CONTRACT YOU WILL NEED TO BE REGISTERED WITH WV STATE
PURCHASING DIVISION, AND COMPLIANT WITH SEVERAL AGENCIES SUCH AS THE WVSDS, TAX DEPARTMENT,
WORKER'S COMPENSATION, AND UNEMPLOYMENT INSURANCE.

VARIOUS AGENCY VARIOUS AGENCY

LOCATIONS LOCATIONS

AS INDICATED BY ORDER AS INDICATED BY ORDER

N Gity wv No City W

us us

Line Comm Ln Dasc Qty Unitssue Unit Price Total Prica
1 Class 1 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Extended Description;
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jun 1%, 2025 Page 2 FORM ID: WY-PRC-ARFQ-002 2020/05




DESIGNATED CONTACT: Vendor appoints the individual identified in this Section as
the Contract Administrator and the initial point of contact for matters relating to this
Contract,

8(-@ don H@‘\}f-‘lf - Sea le 5 :’\’(MQ(;(/
(Printed Name and Title .
Rey 975 &(Mcdm, wy M 4Us
(Address) )
Yy -5~ 7729
(Phone Number) / (Fax Number)
aaapaying ond Sealing @ hed oo |, conm
(E-mail addrcss) 7 ’

CERTIFICATION AND SIGNATURE: By signing below, or submitting documentation
through wvOASIS, I certify that [ have reviewed this Solicitation in its entirety: that I understand
the requirements, terms and conditions, and other information contained herein: that this bid,
offer or proposal constitutes an offer to the State that cannot be unilaterally withdrawn: that the
product or service proposed meets the mandatory requirements contained in the Solicitation for
that product or service, unless otherwise stated herein; that the Vendor accepts the terms and
conditions contained in the Solicitation, unless otherwise stated herein: that I am submitting this
bid, offer or proposal for review and consideration: ; that this bid or offer was made without prior
understanding, agreement, or connection with any entity submitting a bid or offer for the same
material, supplies, equipment or services; that this bid or offer is in all respects fair and without
collusion or fraud: that this Contract is accepted or entered into without any prior understanding,
agreement, or connection to any other entity that could be considered a violation of law: that [ am
authorized by the Vendor to execute and submit this bid, offer, or proposal, or any documents
related thereto on Vendor’s behalf: that I am authorized to bind the vendor in a contractual
relationship; and that to the best of my knowledge, the Vendor has properly registered with any
State agency that may require registration.

By siening below. [ finther certify that 1 understand this Contract is subject to the
nrovisions of West Virginia Code § 534-3-62, which automatically voids certain contract
clauses that violate Staie law.

East Rive A?g).—(qcﬁd
(Company) .

(Signature of Authorized Representative)

Banden  Henkes — Sales Manage

(Printed Name and Title of Authorized Representative)

’?_[“>[=LS

(Datc)

? oY- Yo 5—- S3Lq
(Phone Number) (Fax Number)
Revised 8/24/2023



REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
Stone & Aggregate, Delivery to Non-Established Locations

8.3

8.4

Vendor Name Change: It is the Vendor’s responsibility to notify the WVDOH of
name changes or acquisition by another company during the term of the contract.
The WVDOH must be notified in writing of the change/acquisition and intention
for the contract’s ownership within 10 days of the change. Failure to do so may
result in payment delays.

Reports: Vendor shall provide the Agency with quarterly reports, annual
summaries, and/or monthly reports as requested by the Agency and/or the West
Virginia Purchasing Division showing quantities, total dollar value of the Contract
Items purchased, ordered, shipped & invoiced with dates in spreadsheet format as
defined by the Agency. Failure to supply such rcports may be grounds for
cancellation of this Contract.

Contract Manager: During its performance of this Contract, Vendor must
designate and maintain a primary Contract Manager responsible for overseeing
Vendor’s responsibilities under this Contract. The Contract Manager must be
available during normal business hours to address any customer service ot other
issues related to this Contract. Vendor should list its Contract Manager and his or
her contact information below.

Contract Manager: B(‘ar\cbm Wenkes
Telephone Number: _ 3 oY - M2AS - 5739
Fax Number:

Email Address: QQQF(}.\J{% ceid Secling @ hotmel comn

Vendor shall inform the Agency in writing of any changes to the information
provided above within 10 calendar days of such changes. Failure to comply may
be grounds for cancellation of this contract.

Ferm Revised 10/27/2014 19 AMA 6625C020



Stone & Aggregate (Pick Up CRFQ DOT25%75; Delivery to Established
Locations CRFQ DOT25*76; Delivery to Non-Established Locations ARFQ
DOT25*68)

Responses to Questions from Vendors

Question 1

Non-Conforming Sub-lots (Section 3.2.3.3 an the Pickup by Agency): Within the section two
different methods of price reduction is detailed... the first outlines 2 method of reducing the
number of tons to be paid at the full price, the second outlines a rmethod which reduces the cost
paid. Just curious why the necessity for both to be described and which method is actually being
used.

Answer 1

The first method described in Section 3.2.3.3 (Non-Conforming Sub-lots) determines the
total adjusted price for the specific quantity picked up from a stockpile with a single non-
conforming sub-lot. The second method described is to be used in addition to the first
method in the event there are two or more non-conforming sub-lots within the stockpile.

Example: if there are two sub-lots of non-conforming material within the stockpile, the
adjusted payment on the quantity to be picked up is 1o be determined separately for
each non-conforming sub-lot using the first method described above. Add the two
adjusted payments together and subtract from the total price to be paid befare the
adjustment for tonnage picked up.

Question 2

Section 4.4 —~ Confract Award Transition: Why was the language changed? As wriiten, the DOH
can essentially held a vendor to an indefinite amount of time.

Answer 2

Our Contract Transition language changed as it was contradictory to the Delivery Order
Limitations language in Section 3 of the Terms and Conditions. An ADO can be valid for
up to one year from the issued date.




ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM
SOLICITATION NQ.: ARFQ DOT2500000068

Instructions: Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by
completing this addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum
received and sign below. Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification.

Acknowledgment: I hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the
necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc.

Addendum Numbers Received:
(Check the box next to each addendum received)

Addendum No. 1 [J Addendum No. 6
[ Addendum No. 2 [[] Addendum No. 7
[] Addendum No. 3 [] Addendum No. 8
[] Addendum No. 4 [J Addendum No. 9
[] Addendum No. 5 [] Addendum No. 10

I understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid.
I further understand thal any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral
discussion held between Vendor’s representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only
the information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is
binding.

Casy River A;)r)rf.gc.wlﬂ ez e
Company

4/( & N

Authorized Signature

“Vrles
Date r

NOTL: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite
document processing.

Revised 11/1/2022



Stone Aggregate Delivery to Non-Established Locations
Attachment A (ATT A) Pricing Pages

VENDOR.INSTRUCTIONS: Vendor shall provide their Source Plant address and bid pricing for the Contract ltem
listed below. Failure to provide Source Plant locations will result in the disqualification of the entire bid. If
Vendor needs additional space to list their plants, please use the Supplemental to ATT A. This is a multiple vendor
award contract. Vendor may bid any or all Contract Itemns. All qualifying vendors meeting the contract specifications
will be awarded with a contract. The low hid vendor per project will be determined at the time of need, as per Section
4 of the Contract Specifications. No future use of this Contract is guaranteed or implied. Estimated quantities are not
available.

VENDOR NAME: East River Aggregates, Inc.

Source Plant Names & Addresses:
{Flease provide a negative (-) with the longitudes.)
NOTE: Use Supplemental attachment if additional space is needed.

Name: East River Aggregates, Inc. Latitude: 37.31091

Address: PO Box 975 Princeton, Wy 24739 Longitude: 81.05666
Name: Latitude:

Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:

Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:

Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:

Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:

Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:

Address: Longitude:
1 Class 1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $11.50
2 Class 1 Aggregate LSGS Tons $11.50
3 Class 1 Aggregate Slag Tons No Bid
4 Class 2 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $11.50
5 Class 2 Aggregate LSGS Tons $11.50
6 Class 2 Aggregate Slag Tons No Bid
7 Class 10 Aggregate LEGS Tons $11.50
8 AASHTO #1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $16.25
9 AASHTO #1 Aggregate LSGS Tons $16.25
10 AASHTO #3 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $16.25
11 AASHTO #3 Aggregate LSGS Tons $16.25
12 |AASHTO #4 Aggregate LSGS Tons No Bid
13 |AASHTO #467 Aggregate LSGS Tons $16.25
14 |AASHTO #57 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $16.25
15 |AASHTO #57 Aggregate LSGS Tons $16.25
18 |AASHTO #57 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons No Bid
17 AASHTO #67 Aggregate LSGS Tons No Bid
18 [AASHTO #7 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons No Bid
19 AASHTO #7 Aggregate LSGS Tons No Bid
20 AASHTO #8 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $19.25
21 AASHTO #8 Aggregate LSGS Tons $19.25
22 |AASHTO #8 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons No Bid
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Stone Aggregate Delivery to Non-Established Locations
Attachment A (ATT A) Pricing Pages

VENDOR NAME: East River Aggregates, Inc,
Source Plant Names & Addresses:
(Please provide a negative (-) with the longitudes.)
NOTE: Use Supplemental attachment if additional space is needed.
Name: East River Aggregates, Inc. Latitude: 37.31091
Address: PO Box 975 Princeton, Wv 24739 Longitude: 81,05666
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
23 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED LSGS Tons No Bid
24 |AASHTO #9 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons No Bid
25 AASHTO #9 Aggregate LSGS Tons No Bid
26 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons No Bid
27 AASHTO #90 MODIFIED LSGS Tons No Bid
28 AASHTO #10 Aggregate: Limestone Only Tons No Bid
29 Stone for Gabions Limesione Only Tons $16.50
30 Stone for Gabions LSGS Tons $16.50
31 Fine Aggregate (PCC or Mortar Sand) LSGS Tons No Bid
32 |Trail Surface Aggregate LSGS Tons No Bid
33 Limestone Standard Abrasives Limestone Only Tons No Bid
34  |Limestone Standard Abrasives LSGS ~_Tons No Bid
35 Sandstone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons No Bid
36 Steel Slag for SRIC Slag Tons No Bid
37 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives Limestone Only Tons No Bid
38 Limestone MODIFIED Abraslives LSGS Tons No Bid
39 Sandstone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Tons No Bid
40 Cinders Cinders Tons No Bid
41 Pea Gravel LSGS Tons No Bid
42  |#11 Limestone Abrasives LSGS Tons No Bid
43 Quarry Waste LSGS Tons $12.00
44 Rip Rap LSGES Tons $16.25
45 Shot Rock Limestone Only Tons $16.25
46 Shot Rock LSGS Tons $16.25
47  |Imbricated Stone LSGS Tons No Bid
48 Spreading Surcharge/Tailgating Tons $0.15
49 Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract ltems 1-43) Mile $1.50
50 Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract ltems 1-43) Mile $0.35
51 Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract itemns 44-47) Mile $2.00
52 Haul, Additional Torn-Mile (Contract lems 44-47) Mile $0.37
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Stone Aggregate Delivery to Non-Established Locations
Attachment A (ATT A) Pricing Pages

VENDOR NAME: East River Aggregates, Inc.

Source Plant Names & Addresses:
(Please provide a negative (-) with the longitudes.}
NOTE: Use Supplemental attachment if additional space is needed.

Name: East River Aggregates, Inc. Latitude: 37.31091
Address: PO Box 975 Princeton, Wv 24739 Longitude: 81.05666
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name; Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
*LSGS: Limestone, Sandstone, Gravel or Sand

Delivery to Non-Established Locations Page 3 of 3 6625C020



) il
ACORD
|

CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE .

DATE (WWDDAYYYY}
7/7/2025

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies} must be endorsed. If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subjectto
the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on this certificate does not confer rights to the
cartificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

PRODUCER HAmE.”' Joanna Conley
THORMBURS INSURANCE AGENCY INC PHORE o (304) 6977650 | %, ng); (304697-765
2519 3xd Ave AL o5: Jeonley@thornburgagency. com
P O Box 2966 INSURER(S] AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC £
Buntington WV 25728 INSURERA: Travelens Propezrty Casualty Co America | 36161
INGURED INSURERE : Evanston Insurance Company 35378
East River Aggregates, Inc. INSURER C +
INSURER D ¢
PO Box 375 NSURERE 1
Princaton WV 24740 INSURER F:
COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER:;2025-2026 REVISICN NUMEER;
THIS 18 TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN {SSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE IBSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TOALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUGCH POQLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.
iy TYPE OF INSURANCE e e POLICY NUMBER DDy | pmenoryn LoaTS
X | COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY EACH OCCURRENCE $ 1,000,000
A | cLams e E OCOUR BANAGE TORERTED : 300,000
X | cContractual ILimbilit BE=0=TRIPAS0 4= PHE =25 22842025 2/24/2026 | MED EXP (Any one peson} $ 5,000
1 PERSONAL & ADV JNJURY 1§ 1,000,000
| GENL AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: GENERA. AGGREGATE 3 2,000,000
B | |poucy R D Loc PRODUCTS - COMPIOTAGE. | $ 2,000,000
X | oTHER: potiotion tiabitiey COMOLI21800 2/24/2025 | 2/24/2026 | EnchQocurencelAggregate s 1,000,000
| AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY B ooy NOLE LM 5 1,000,000
A X | anvaure RODILY INJURY (Per parsan} | §
AL SINED SCHEDULED BI0-TRTATE16-25-26-G 2/24/2085 | 2/247202 | BODILY INJURY (Per sccidard) | §
] NON-OWNED
||t Ao PROPERTY DAMAGE )
$
{ X | UMBRELLALUE | X | ocoun EACH OGGCURRENCE 5 4,006,000
A EXCESS LIAB CLAIMS-MADE AGGREGATE s £,000,000
DED i } RETENTION % COR-7R7949EA-25~28 2/24/2025 2}24/2028 [
WORKERS ENSA PER OTH-
AND EMPLOVERS: LIABHITY YIN x | S | |8
ANY PROPRIETORIPARTNER/EXECUTIVE EL. EACH ACCIDENT $ 1,000,000
OFFICER/MEMBER EXGLUDED? NiA
A {Psandatory In NH} YB-3R9994058-2%-26-G 2/24f2028 2124/2026 | £ DSEASE -EAEMPLOYEE | 8 1,000,000
E@“ describa tnder
SCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below EL.DISEASE -PGLICYLIMIT | 3§ 1,006,000
A | Contractors Equipmsnt Floater §30~TRES68I8-TXL~25 2/24/2025 | 2/24/2026 | Renlad and Leasad Ench Unit $750,000

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS | LOCATIONS } VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Addltional Remstks Schadute, may be attached i more space is required)
Bubject to pelicy terms, conditionsg, limitations and exclusions

CERTIFICATE HOLDER

CANCELLATICN

For Evidence of Insurance

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOQF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
ACCORDANCE WATH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

AUTHORIZED REPREBENTATIVE

Ryan Wingrove/JC

G

ACORD 25 (2014/01)
INS028 (zo1401)
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