‘,;rf”{’%ﬁ?%’ Department of Administration

> Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder: 1704952

Solicitation Description: Addendum 1 Stone&Agg Mat. & Delivery to Non-Estab.Location

Proc Type: Agency Master Agreement
Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version
2025-07-16 10:30 SR 0803 ESR07142500000000145 1

VENDOR

000000201143
RBS INC

Solicitation Number: ARFQ 0803 DOT2500000068

Total Bid: 0

Comments:

Response Date: 2025-07-14

Response Time: 10:08:37

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Jeromie F Lanham

304-720-7383

jeromie.f.lanham@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X

FEIN#

DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Date Printed:  Jul 16, 2025

Page: 1

FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Class 1 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price
2 Class 1 Aggregate -LSGS

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification
11111600

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount
3 Class 1 Aggregate -Slag 0.00000 TON
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
4 Class 2 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

5 Class 2 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification
11111600

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 16, 2025 Page: 2

FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

6 Class 2 Aggregate -Slag 0.00000 TON

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification

Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

7 Class 10 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification

Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
8 AASHTO #1 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

9 AASHTO #1 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON

Comm Code
11111600

Manufacturer Specification

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

10 AASHTO #3 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification
11111600

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 16, 2025 Page: 3

FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

11 AASHTO #3 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification

Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

12 AASHTO #4 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification

Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
13 AASHTO #467 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

14 AASHTO #57 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification

Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

15 AASHTO #57 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON

Comm Code
11111600

Manufacturer Specification

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 16, 2025 Page: 4

FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

16 AASHTO #67 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification

Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

17 AASHTO #67 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification

Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
18 AASHTO #7 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

19 AASHTO #7 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON

Comm Code
11111600

Manufacturer Specification

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

20 AASHTO #8 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification
11111600

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 16, 2025 Page: 5

FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Comm Code
11111600

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
21 AASHTO #8 Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount

22 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification

Model #
11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount
23 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED -LSGS 0.00000 TON
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
24 AASHTO #9 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc
25 AASHTO #9 Aggregate -LSGS

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price
0.00000 TON

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Manufacturer Specification Model #

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 16, 2025

Page: 6 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Comm Code
11111600

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
26 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount
27 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED -LSGS

0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification

Model #
11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
28 AASHTO #10 Aggregate -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
29 Stone for Gabions -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price
0.00000 TON

Ln Total Or Contract Amount
30 Stone for Gabions -LSGS

Manufacturer Specification Model #

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 16, 2025

Page: 7 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
31 Fine Aggregate (PCC or Mortar Sand) -LSGS 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount
32 Trail Surface Aggregate -LSGS 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification

Model #
11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
33 Limestone Standard Abrasives -Limestone 0.00000 TON
Only
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount
34 Limestone Standard Abrasives -LSGS 0.00000 TON
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price
0.00000 TON

Ln Total Or Contract Amount
35 Sandstone Standard Abrasives -LSGS

Comm Code
11111600

Manufacturer Specification Model #

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 16, 2025 Page: 8 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
36 Steel Slag for SRIC 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
37 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives -Limestone 0.00000 TON
Only
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount
38 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives -LSGS 0.00000 TON
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
39 Sandstone Modified Abrasives -LSGS 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
40 Cinders 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 16, 2025 Page: 9 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
41 Pea Gravel -LSGS 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
42 #11 Limestone Abrasives -LSGS 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
43 Quarry Waste -LSGS 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
44 Rip Rap -LSGS 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
45 Shot Rock -Limestone Only 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 16, 2025 Page: 10 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
46 Shot Rock -LSGS 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
47 Imbricated Stone 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
48 Spreading Surcharge/Tailgating 0.00000 TON

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

78121601

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
49 Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract ltems 1-43) 0.00000 MILE

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

78121601

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
50 Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract Items 0.00000 MILE
1-43)
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
78121601

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 16, 2025 Page: 11 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price
51

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract ltems 44-47) 0.00000 MILE

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification Model #

78121601

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
52 Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract Items 0.00000 MILE
44-47)
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
78121601

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Jul 16, 2025 Page: 12 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05



State of West Virginia
Agency Request for Quote
Highways

Proc Folder: 1704952

Doc Description: Stone & Agg Material & Delivery to Non-Established Locations

Reason for Modification:

Proc Type: Agency Master Agreement

Date Issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation No Version
2025-06-19 2025-07-16 ARFQ 0803 DOT2500000068 1

BID RECEIVING LOCATION

PROCUREMENT DIVISION

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

BLDG 6 RM 340A

1900 KANAWHA BLVD E
CHARLESTON WV 25305
us

VENDOR

Vendor Customer Code:

Vendor Name :
Address :
Street :

City :

State :

Principal Contact :

000000201143

R B S Inc., Greystone Quarry

PO Box 490
White Sulphur Springs, WV 24986

William Snyder 304.645.2277
bill@rbsinc.com

Vendor Contact Phone:

Extension:

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER

Jeromie F Lanham
304-720-7383

jeromie.f.lanham@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X

rens 5004 )N TG e (YA 2025

Date Printed: Jun 19, 20

Page 1

All offers subject to all terl\s and conditions contained in this solicitation
25

FORM ID: WV-PRC-ARFQ-0022020/05

Lbs | /6



Stone Aggregate Delivery to Non-Established Locations
Attachment A (ATT A) Pricing Pages

VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: Vendor shall provide their Source Plant address and bid pricing for the Contract Item listed

below. Failure to provide Source Plant locations will result in the disqualification of the entire bid. If Vendor needs

additional space to list their plants, please use the Supplemental to ATT A. This is a multiple vendor award contract.

Vendor may bid any or all Contract ltems. All qualifying vendors meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a

contract. The low bid vendor per project will be determined at the time of need, as per Section 4 of the Contract

Specifications. No future use of this Contract is guaranteed or implied. Estimated quantities are not available.

VENDOR NAME: RBSiInc, G

reystone Quarry

Source Plant Names & Addresses:
(Please provide a negative (-) with the longitudes.)

NOTE: lis d

Name: R B S Inc., Greystone Quarry Latitude: 37°53'04"N

Address: 2790 Unus RD, Lewisburg, WV 24901 Longitude: 80°26'49"W
Name: Latitude:

Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:

Address: Lon@de:
Name: Latitude:

Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:

Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:

Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:

Address: Longitude:

C(;l:e“:“ Description Composition* Unit of Measure Bid Price
1 Class 1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons 59.72
2 Class 1 Aggregate LSGS Tons $9.72
3 Class 1 Aggregate Slag Tons NO BID
4 Class 2 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $9.72
5 Class 2 Aggregate LSGS Tons $9.72
6 Class 2 Aggregate Slag Tons NO BID
7 Class 10 Aggregate LSGS Tons $9.72
8 AASHTO #1 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $12.99
9 AASHTO #1 Aggregate LSGS Tons $12.99
10 AASHTO #3 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $12.99
11 AASHTO #3 Aggregate LSGS Tons $12.99
12 AASHTO #4 Aggregate LSGS Tons 512.99
13 AASHTO #467 Aggregate LSGS Tons $14.95
14 AASHTO #57 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $13.75
15 AASHTO #57 Aggregate LSGS Tons 513.75
16 AASHTO #67 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $13.99
17 AASHTO #67 Aggregate LSGS Tons 513.99
18 AASHTO #7 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons 515.99
19 AASHTO #7 Aggregate LSGS Tons 515.99
20 AASHTO #8 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons 13.45
21 AASHTO #8 Aggregate LSGS Tons $13.45
22 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons 13.90
23 AASHTO #8 MODIFIED LSGS Tons $13.90
24 AASHTO #9 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $14.90
25 AASHTO #9 Aggregate LSGS Tons 514.90
26 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED Limestone Only Tons $15.50
27 AASHTO #9 MODIFIED LSGS Tons $15.50
28 AASHTO #10 Aggregate Limestone Only Tons $10.50
29 Stone for Gabions Limestone Only Tons $13.75
30 Stone for Gabions LSGS Tons $13.75
31 Fine Aggregate (PCC or Mortar Sand) LSGS Tons $16.20
32 Trail Surface Aggregate LSGS Tons No Bid
33 Limestone Standard Abrasives Limestone Only Tons $14.45
34 Limestone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons $14.45
35 Sandstone Standard Abrasives LSGS Tons NO BID

L85 2/6
Delivery to Non-Established Locations Page1 of2

6625C020



VENDOR NAME:

Stone Aggregate Delivery to Non-Established Locations

Attachment A (ATT A) Pricing Pages

R B S Inc., Greystone Quarry

Source Plant Names & Addresses:

(Please provide a negative (-) with the longitudes.)

NOTE: lse Sunplemental attachment. d
Name: R B S Inc., Greystone Quarry Latitude: 37°53'04"N

Address: 2790 Unus RD, Lewisburg, WV 24901 Longitude: 80°26'49"W
Name: Latitude:

Address: Longitude:

Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:
Address: Longitude:
Name: Latitude:

Address: Longitude:

C‘:'t'::“ Description Composition* | Unit of Measure |  Bid Price
36 Steel Slag for SRIC Slag Tons NO BID
37 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives Limestone Only Tons $14.65
38 Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Tons $14.65
39 Sandstone MODIFIED Abrasives LSGS Tons NO BID
40 Cinders Cinders Tons NO BID
41 Pea Gravel LSGS Tons NO BID
42 #11 Limestone Abrasives LSGS Tons $14.25
43 Quarmy Waste LSGS Tons NO BID
44 Rip Rap LSGS Tons $18.00
45 Shot Rock Limestone Only Tons $16.00
46 Shot Rock LSGS Tons $16.00
47 Imbricated Stone LSGS Tons NO BID
48 Spreading Surcharge/Tailgating Tons $1.10
49 Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract Iltems 1-43) Mile $12.50
50 Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract Items 1-43) Mile $8.50
51 Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract Items 44-47) Mile $42.00
52 Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract Items 44-47) Mile $8.50

*LSGS: Limestone, Sandstone, Gravel or Sand
Delivery to Non-Established Locations Page2 of2
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ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM
SOLICITATION NO.: ARFQ DOT2500000068

Instructions: Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by
completing this addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum
received and sign below. Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification.

Acknowledgment: I hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the
necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc.

Addendum Numbers Received:
(Check the box next to each addendum received)

Addendum No. 1 [[] Addendum No. 6
[] Addendum No. 2 [] Addendum No. 7
[] Addendum No. 3 [ ]Addendum No. 8
[] Addendum No. 4 [] Addendum No. 9
[] Addendum No. 5 [ ] Addendum No. 10

I understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid.
I further understand that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral
discussion held between Vendor’s representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only
the information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is
binding.

ST .

Tl 1

Authorized Si§n ture
|4 Wt” 2005
Date A

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite
document processing.

RN

Revised 11/1/2022



wao State of West Virginia
wnse . VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE

Certification and application is hereby made for Preference in accordance with West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37. (Does notapply to
construction contracts). West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37, provides an opportunity for qualifying vendors to request (at the time of bid)
preference for their residency status. Such preference is an evaluation method only and will be applied only to the cost bid in
accordance with the West Virginia Code. This certificate for application is to be used to request such preference. The Purchasing
Division will make the determination of the Vendor Preference, if applicable.

Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked: ) o
Bidder is an individual resident vendor and has resided continuously in West Virginia, or bidder is a partnership, ass_ocnatxon
or corporation resident vendor and has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business continuously in West
Virginia, for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or,

Bidder is a resident vendor partnership, association, or corporation with at least eighty percent of ownership interest
of bidder held by another entity that meets the applicable four year residency requirement; or,

Bidder is a nonresident vendor which has an affiliate or subsidiary which employs a minimum of one hundred state residents
and which has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia continuously for the four (4)
years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or,

Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a resident vendor who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the employees
working on the project being bid are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two years
immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,

Uo 0

Dso

Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked: )
Bidder is a nonresident vendor that employs a minimum of one hundred state residents, or a nonresident vendor which
has an affiliate or subsidiary which maintains its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia and
employs aminimum of one hundred state residents, and for purposes of producing or distributing the commodities or
completing the project which is the subject of the bidder's bid and continuously over the entire term of the project, on
average at least seventy-five percent of the bidder's employees or the bidder’s affiliate’s or subsidiary’s employees are
residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years and the
vendor's bid; or,

Application is made for 5% vendor preference for the reason checked:
Bidder meets either the requirement of both subdivisions (1) and (2) or subdivision (1) and (3) as stated above; or,

Application is made for 3.5% vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked: ]

Bidder is an individual resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the N_atlonal Gga(d
and has resided in West Virginia continuously for the four years immediately preceding the date on which the bid is
submitted; or,

Application is made for 3.5% vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:

Bidder is a resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard, if, for
purposes of producing or distributing the commaodities or completing the project which is the subject of the vendor’s bid and
continuously over the entire term of the project, on average at least seventy-five percent of the vendor's employees are
residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years.

Application is made for preference as a non-resident small, women- and minority-owned business, in accor-
dance with West Virginia Code §5A-3-59 and West Virginia Code of State Rules.

(1 Bidderhas been orexpects to be approved prior to contract award by the Purchasing Division as a certified small, women-
and minority-owned business.

8. Application is made for reciprocal preference.
[ Bidderis a West Virginia resident and is requesting reciprocal preference to the extent that it applies.

Bidder understands if the Secretary of Revenue determines that a Bidder receiving preference has failed to continue to meet the
requirements for such preference, the Secretary may order the Director of Purchasing to: (a) rescind the contract or purchase order;
or (b) assess a penalty against such Bidder in an amount not to exceed 5% of the bid amount and that such penalty will be paid to
the contracting agency or deducted from any unpaid balance on the contract or purchase order.

By submission of this certificate, Bidder agrees to disclose any reasonably requested information to the Purchasing Division and
authorizes the Department of Revenue to disclose to the Director of Purchasing appropriate information verifying that Bidder has paid
the required business taxes, provided that such information does not contain the amounts of taxes paid nor any other information
deemed by the Tax Commissioner to be confidential.

Bidder hereby certifies that this certificate is true and accurate in all respects; and that if a contract is issued to Bidder
and if anything contained within this certificate changes during the term of thé contract, Bidder will notify the Purchas-
ing Division in writing immediately.

Bidder: § B S Inc. Signed:

Date: Z“\' /&/\V\(/ ’Z/"‘/ Title: VP R B S Inc. ‘

*Check any combination of preference consideration(s) indicated above, which you are entitled to receive. ﬂ % S S’ / /@
/ ‘\
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ACORD. CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE " a0

THIS CERTIRICATE (S ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

[ IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder Is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions o be endorsed.
if SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terma and conditions of the policy, certaln pollcies may require an endorsemant. A statemant on
ﬂxfseerﬂﬂmdoesnmmm!!@hmmoummmmmmmmma

PRODUCER
McGriff Insurance Services LLC ONE . 304 346-0800 Im” )
300 Summers Street, Sulto 150 MAL. CortificatosVAWV@mcgrif.com
Chartoston, WV 25301 INSURERIS) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #
304 346-0808 INSURER A : Fnoenlthmeonw;ny ~ 250623
INSURED INSURER B ; Travelers Propesty Casusity Co of Amer 25674
RBS, nc. [ suren ¢ ; Traveters Casually na. Co. of America 18046
P O Box 480 INSURER b - Travelers Indemnity Co of America 25666
White Sulphur Springs, WV 24986 P—
INSURERE :
INSURER P :
_COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: REVISION NUMBER:

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE SSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN (S SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.
ADOLISUBRI IV BF R 5rv

@F JVPE OF INSURANCE NSR JeVA POLICY NUMBER RNV RV | LTS
A | X| COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY X | X |esotLe26379P 0/01/2024|10/01/20285 EACH OCCURRENCE $1,000,000
X| PD Ded:10,000 MED EXP (Any onsperson) _| $5,000
PERSONAL & ADV INURY | £1,000,000
| GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: GENERAL AGGREGATE 52,000,000
|| Pomvr_’—(lfgcof l:lwc PRODUCTS - COMPOP 4GS | $2,000,000
OTHER;
D | AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY X | X |8101L5769492
| X! anvauto
|| S oy S
= ONLY AUTOS ONLY
B | X|UMBRELLALIAB | X | ocoun CUP1L8477812 10/01/2024|10/01/2025) EACH OCCURRENCE $5,000,000
EXCESS LIAB mmnei AGGREGATE $5,000,000
0 | X Nst __1s
C | ¥onKens couPENBATION el | X |UBILSS17a24 1001/2024[1001/2028 X [Eoine | IS8
%WWE NIA Includes mployoraLLialmﬂy E.L. EACH ACCIDENT 1,000,000
g%% Broad Section |eL pisEase-EA 1 060
oESEAITION O GPERATIONS betow 2342 WV |Code |e: misease-poucywwr 51,000,600

DESCRIPTION OF GPERATIONS / LGCATIONS / VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Addional Remarks Schadue, may bo attechod I more speco i3 required)
** Workers Comp Information **

Otheor States Coverage
Broad Form Employers Liability
Blanket Walver of Subrogation (WV)
(See Attached Descriptions)
CERTIFICATE HOLDER CELLATION
SHOULD ABOV IES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
State of West Virginia THE  EXPIRATION DATE  THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED N
Division of Highways ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.
1800 Kanawha Bivd East
Charleston, WV 25305-0330 AUTHORZED REPRESENTATIVE
' 4‘” ‘ * S'M

© 1563-2016 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reservog.
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