

State of West Virginia **Agency Request for Quote Highways**

Proc Folder:

1704952

Reason for Modification:

Doc Description: Addendum 1 Stone&Agg Mat. & Delivery to Non-Estab.Location

ADDENDUM 01

TO ATTACH RESPONSES TO QUESTIONS FROM VENDORS

Proc Type:

Agency Master Agreement

Date Issued

Solicitation Closes

Solicitation No.

Version

2025-07-01

2025-07-16 10:30

ARFQ

0803

DOT2500000068

2

BID RECEIVING LOCATION

PROCUREMENT DIVISION

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

BLDG 6 RM 340A

1900 KANAWHA BLVD E

CHARLESTON

WV 25305

US

JUL 15 '25 AM11:01 REC'D BUDGET - PROCURE

VENDOR

Vendor Customer Code: 000000208466e
Vendor Name: 5hriver Trucking Company Inc

Address: PO ROX 1171

Street:

city: Westor

State: \\\

Country: 115A

zip: 26452

Principal Contact: Steve Shrivel

Vendor Contact Phone: 304-546-4385

Extension:

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER

Jeromie F Lanham 304-720-7383

jeromie.f.lanham@wv.gov

Vendor

Signature X

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Date Printed: Jul 1, 2025 Page 1

FORM ID: WV-PRC-ARFQ-002 2020/05

ADDITIONAL INFORMATION

ADDENDUM 1 IS ISSUED FOR THE FOLLOWING REASONS:

1. TO ATTACH RESPONSES TO QUESTIONS FROM VENDORS

NO OTHER CHANGES

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS		VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS	
AS INDICATED BY	ORDER	AS INDICATED BY ORDER	
No City	WV	No City	WV
US		US	

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
1	Class 1 Aggregate -Limestone Only	0.00000	TON		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
11111600				

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO		
VARIOUS AGENC' LOCATIONS	Y	VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS		
AS INDICATED BY	ORDER	AS INDICATED BY ORDER	₹	
No City	WV	No City	WV	
US		US		

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
2	Class 1 Aggregate -LSGS	0.00000	TON		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
11111600				

Extended Description:

INVOICE TO			SHIP TO		
VARIOUS A			VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS		
AS INDICAT	ED BY ORDE	R	AS INDICATED BY ORDER		
No City		WV	No City	WV	
US			US		

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
3	Class 1 Aggregate -Slag	0.00000	TON		
1					

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
11111600				

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS		VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS	
AS INDICATED BY ORDER		AS INDICATED BY ORDER	
No City US	WV	No City US	WV

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
4	Class 2 Aggregate -Limestone Only	0.00000	TON		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
11111600				

Extended Description:

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS		VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS	
AS INDICATED BY	DRDER	AS INDICATED BY ORDER	
No City	WV	No City WV	
US		US	

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
5	Class 2 Aggregate -LSGS	0.00000	TON		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
11111600				

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO		
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS		VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS		
AS INDICATED BY ORDER		AS INDICATED BY ORDER		
No City US	WV	No City US	WV	
00		00		

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
6	Class 2 Aggregate -Slag	0.00000	TON		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model#	
11111600				

Extended Description:

INVOICE TO	SHIP TO	
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER	VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER	
No City WV	No City WV	

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
7	Class 10 Aggregate -LSGS	0.00000	TON		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
11111600				
1				

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER		VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY OF	RDER
No City US	WV	No City US	WV

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
8	AASHTO #1 Aggregate -Limestone Only	0.00000	TON		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
11111600				

Extended Description:

INVOICE TO	SHIP TO		
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS	VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS		
AS INDICATED BY ORDER	AS INDICATED BY O	RDER	
No City WV	No City	WV	
US	US		

tal Price

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
11111600				

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO	- A	SHIP TO	
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS		VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS	_
AS INDICATED BY	ORDER	AS INDICATED BY ORDER	
No City US	WV	No City US	WV

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
10	AASHTO #3 Aggregate -Limestone Only	0.00000	TON		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
11111600				

Extended Description:

INVOICE TO	SHIP TO	
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER	VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY OF	RDER
No City WV US	No City US	WV

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
11	AASHTO #3 Aggregate -LSGS	0.00000	TON		
1					

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
11111600				

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS		VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS	
AS INDICATED BY ORDER		AS INDICATED BY ORDER	
No City US	WV	No City US	WV

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
12	AASHTO #4 Aggregate -LSGS	0.00000	TON		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
11111600				

Extended Description:

INVOICE TO	SHIP TO
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER	VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER
No City WV	No City WV

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
13	AASHTO #467 Aggregate -LSGS	0.00000	TON		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
11111600				

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	SHIP TO		
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER		VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY O			
No City US	WV	No City US	WV		

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
14	AASHTO #57 Aggregate -Limestone Only	0.00000	TON		
1					

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
11111600				

Extended Description:

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	SHIP TO		
VARIOUS AG LOCATIONS		VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS	D		*
AS INDICATE	ED BY ORDER	AS INDICATED BY ORDE	К		
No City	WV	No City	WV		

US

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
15	AASHTO #57 Aggregate -LSGS	0.00000	TON		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
11111600	1			

Extended Description:

US

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO			
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER		VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY C			
No City US	WV	No City US	WV		

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
16	AASHTO #67 Aggregate -Limestone Only	0.00000	TON		

Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
	Manufacturer	Manufacturer Specification	Manufacturer Specification Model #

Page 9

Extended Description:

Date Printed:

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO		
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS	(VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS		
AS INDICATED BY ORDER		AS INDICATED BY ORDER		
No City	WV	No City	WV	
US		US		

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
17	AASHTO #67 Aggregate -LSGS	0.00000	TON		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
11111600		<u> </u>		

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS	ENCY VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS		
AS INDICATED BY	ORDER	AS INDICATED BY ORDER	
No City US	WV	No City WV US	

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
1,8	AASHTO #7 Aggregate -Limestone Only	0.00000	TON		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
11111600				

Extended Description:

Date Printed: Jul 1, 2025

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS		VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS	
AS INDICATED BY ORDER		AS INDICATED BY ORDER	
No City US	WV	No City US	WV

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
19	AASHTO #7 Aggregate -LSGS	0.00000	TON		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
11111600				

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO		
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS		VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS		
AS INDICATED BY O	PRDER	AS INDICATED BY ORDER		
No City US	WV	No City US	WV	

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
20	AASHTO #8 Aggregate -Limestone Only	0.00000	TON		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
11111600				

Extended Description:

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO		
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY		VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER		
No City US	WV	No City US	WV	

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
21	AASHTO #8 Aggregate -LSGS	0.00000	TON		
1					

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
11111600				

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER		VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORD	DER
No City US	WV	No City US	WV

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
22	AASHTO #8 MODIFIED -Limestone Only	0.00000	TON		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
11111600				

Extended Description:

Jul 1, 2025

Date Printed:

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS		VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS	
AS INDICATED BY ORDER		AS INDICATED BY ORDER	
No City	WV	No City WV	
US		US	

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
23	AASHTO #8 MODIFIED -LSGS	0.00000	TON		
1					

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
11111600				

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER		VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY OF	RDER
No City US	WV	No City US	WV

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
24	AASHTO #9 Aggregate -Limestone Only	0.00000	TON		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
11111600				
11111000				

Extended Description:

INVOICE TO	SHIP TO
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER	VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER
No City WV	No City WV

Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
AASHTO #9 Aggregate -LSGS	0.00000	TON		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
11111600				

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO		
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS		VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS		
AS INDICATED BY	ORDER	AS INDICATED BY ORDE	ER .	
No City US	WV	No City US	WV	

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
26	AASHTO #9 MODIFIED -Limestone Only	0.00000	TON		

Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
	Manuracturer	manufacturer Specification	manufacturer Specification model#

Extended Description:

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS		VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS	
AS INDICATED BY ORDER	₹	AS INDICATED BY ORDER	
No City	WV	No City WV	
US		US	

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
27	AASHTO #9 MODIFIED -LSGS	0.00000	TON		
1					

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
11111600				

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS	***	VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS	
AS INDICATED BY ORDER		AS INDICATED BY ORDER	
No City US	WV	No City US	WV

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
28	AASHTO #10 Aggregate -Limestone Only	0.00000	TON		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
11111600				

Extended Description:

Date Printed:

Jul 1, 2025

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS		VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS	
AS INDICATED BY ORDER		AS INDICATED BY ORDER	
No City US	WV	No City US	WV

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
29	Stone for Gabions -Limestone Only	0.00000	TON		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
11111600				

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO	and the second second second second	SHIP TO	
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS		VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS	-
AS INDICATED BY ORDER		AS INDICATED BY ORDER	
No City	WV	No City	WV
US		US	

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
30	Stone for Gabions -LSGS	0.00000	TON		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
11111600				

Extended Description:

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS		VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS	-
AS INDICATED BY ORDER		AS INDICATED BY ORDER	
No City	WV	No City WV	
US		US	

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
31	Fine Aggregate (PCC or Mortar Sand) -LSGS	0.00000	TON		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
11111600				

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS		VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS	
AS INDICATED BY ORDER		AS INDICATED BY ORDER	
No City US	WV	No City US	WV

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
32	Trail Surface Aggregate -LSGS	0.00000	TON		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
11111600				

Extended Description:

INVOICE TO	SHIP TO
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER	VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER
No City WV	No City WV

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
33	Limestone Standard Abrasives -Limestone	0.00000	TON		
	Only				

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
11111600				

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO		
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS	,	VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS		
AS INDICATED BY	ORDER	AS INDICATED BY ORD	DER	
No City	WV	No City	WV	
US		US		

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
34	Limestone Standard Abrasives -LSGS	0.00000	TON		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
11111600				

Extended Description:

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY		VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER	
No City US	WV	No City WY	/

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
35	Sandstone Standard Abrasives -LSGS	0.00000	TON		
1					

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
11111600				

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
VARIOUS AGENC LOCATIONS	Y	VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS	
AS INDICATED BY	ORDER	AS INDICATED BY ORDER	
No City US	WV	No City US	WV

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
36	Steel Slag for SRIC	0.00000	TON		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
11111600				

Extended Description:

INVOICE TO	SHIP TO
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER	VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER
No City WV	No City WV

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
37	Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives -Limestone Only	0.00000	TON		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
11111600				
1				

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS		VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS	
AS INDICATED BY ORDER		AS INDICATED BY ORDER	
No City US	WV	No City US	WV

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
38	Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives -LSGS	0.00000	TON		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
11111600				

Extended Description:

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO		
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER		VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER		
No City US	WV	No City US	WV	

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
39	Sandstone Modified Abrasives -LSGS	0.00000	TON		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
11111600				

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS		VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS	
AS INDICATED BY ORDER		AS INDICATED BY ORDER	
No City US	WV	No City US	WV

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
40	Cinders	0.00000	TON		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
11111600				

Extended Description:

INVOICE TO	8, 10	SHIP TO		
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER	}	VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORD	DER	
No City US	WV	No City US	WV	

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
41	Pea Gravel -LSGS	0.00000	TON		
1					

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
11111600			`	

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO		
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS		VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS		
AS INDICATED BY O	RDER	AS INDICATED BY OF	RDER	
No City US	WV	No City US	WV	

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
42	#11 Limestone Abrasives -LSGS	0.00000	TON		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model#	
11111600				

Extended Description:

INVOICE TO	SHIP TO
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS	VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS
AS INDICATED BY ORDER	AS INDICATED BY ORDER
No City WV US	No City WV

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
43	Quarry Waste -LSGS	0.00000	TON		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
11111600				

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER		VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER	
No City US	WV	No City US	WV

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
44	Rip Rap -LSGS	0.00000	TON		
l					

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model#
11111600			***

Extended Description:

INVOICE TO	SHIP TO		
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS	VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS		
AS INDICATED BY ORDER	AS INDICATED BY ORD	ER	
No City WV	No City US	WV	

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
45	Shot Rock -Limestone Only	0.00000	TON		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
11111600				

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS		VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS	
AS INDICATED BY C	ORDER	AS INDICATED BY ORDER	
No City US	WV	No City WV US	

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
46	Shot Rock -LSGS	0.00000	TON		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
11111600				

Page 24

Extended Description:

INVOICE TO	SHIP TO
VARIOUS AGENCY	VARIOUS AGENCY
LOCATIONS	LOCATIONS
AS INDICATED BY ORDER	AS INDICATED BY ORDER
No City WV	No City WV
US	US

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
47	Imbricated Stone	0.00000	TON		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
11111600				

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Ł	INVOICE TO		SHIP TO	
	VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS		VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS	
	AS INDICATED BY ORDER		AS INDICATED BY ORDER	
	No City	WV	No City	WV
	US		US	

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
48	Spreading Surcharge/Tailgating	0.00000	TON		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
78121601				

Extended Description:

INVOICE TO	SHIP TO
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS	VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS
AS INDICATED BY ORDER	AS INDICATED BY ORDER
No City WV US	No City WV

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
49	Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract Items 1-43)	0.00000	MILE		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
78121601				

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO		
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS		VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS		
AS INDICATED BY ORDER		AS INDICATED BY ORDER		
No City	WV	No City	WV	
US		US		

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
50	Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract Items	0.00000	MILE		
	1-43)				

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
78121601				

Extended Description:

INVOICE TO	SHIP TO	
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS	VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS	
AS INDICATED BY ORDER	AS INDICATED BY ORDER	

No City WV No City WV US US

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
51	Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract Items 44-47)	0.00000	MILE		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
78121601				

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

INVOICE TO		SHIP TO		
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS		VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS		
AS INDICATED BY ORDER		AS INDICATED BY ORDER		
No City US	WV	No City US	WV	

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Total Price
52	Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract Items 44-47)	0.00000	MILE		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #	
78121601				

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

SCHEDULE OF EVENTS

<u>Line</u>	<u>Event</u>	Event Date
1	TECHNICAL QUESTION DEADLINE 10 AM EST	2025-07-01

	Document Phase	Document Description	Page 28
DOT2500000068		Addendum 1 Stone&Agg Mat. & Delivery to Non-Estab.Location	

ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS

See attached document(s) for additional Terms and Conditions

ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM SOLICITATION NO.: ARFQ DOT2500000068

Instructions: Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by completing this addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum received and sign below. Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification.

Acknowledgment: I hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc.

Addendum Numbers Received: (Check the box next to each addendum	received)
✓ Addendum No. 1 ☐ Addendum No. 2 ☐ Addendum No. 3 ☐ Addendum No. 4 ☐ Addendum No. 5	☐ Addendum No. 6 ☐ Addendum No. 7 ☐ Addendum No. 8 ☐ Addendum No. 9 ☐ Addendum No. 10
I further understand that any verbal repridiscussion held between Vendor's repre-	receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid resentation made or assumed to be made during any oral esentatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only ided to the specifications by an official addendum is
Shriver Trucking Company) Inc.
Authorized Signature	
7/14/2025	
Date	

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite document processing.

SOLICITATION NUMBER: ARFQ DOT2500000068 Addendum Number: 1

The purpose of this addendum is to modify the solicitation identified as ("Solicitation") to reflect the change(s) identified and described below.

ĺ]	Modify bid opening date and time
[]	Modify specifications of product or service being sought
[🗸	/	Attachment of vendor questions and responses
[Attachment of pre-bid sign-in sheet
[1	Correction of error
ſ	1	Other

Description of Modification to Solicitation:

ADDENDUM 1 IS ISSUED FOR THE FOLLOWING REASONS:

1. TO ATTACH RESPONSES TO QUESTIONS FROM VENDORS

NO OTHER CHANGES

Additional Documentation: Documentation related to this Addendum (if any) has been included herewith as Attachment A and is specifically incorporated herein by reference.

Terms and Conditions:

- 1. All provisions of the Solicitation and other addenda not modified herein shall remain in full force and effect.
- 2. Vendor should acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued for this Solicitation by completing an Addendum Acknowledgment, a copy of which is included herewith. Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification. The addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite document processing.

ATTACHMENT A

Stone & Aggregate (Pick Up CRFQ DOT25*75; Delivery to Established Locations CRFQ DOT25*76; Delivery to Non-Established Locations ARFQ DOT25*68)

Responses to Questions from Vendors

Question 1

Non-Conforming Sub-lots (Section 3.2.3.3 on the Pickup by Agency): Within the section two different methods of price reduction is detailed... the first outlines a method of reducing the number of tons to be paid at the full price, the second outlines a method which reduces the cost paid. Just curious why the necessity for both to be described and which method is actually being used.

Answer 1

The first method described in Section 3.2.3.3 (Non-Conforming Sub-lots) determines the total adjusted price for the specific quantity picked up from a stockpile with a single non-conforming sub-lot. The second method described is to be used in addition to the first method in the event there are two or more non-conforming sub-lots within the stockpile.

Example: if there are two sub-lots of non-conforming material within the stockpile, the adjusted payment on the quantity to be picked up is to be determined separately for each non-conforming sub-lot using the first method described above. Add the two adjusted payments together and subtract from the total price to be paid before the adjustment for tonnage picked up.

Question 2

Section 4.4 – Contract Award Transition: Why was the language changed? As written, the DOH can essentially hold a vendor to an indefinite amount of time.

Answer 2

Our Contract Transition language changed as it was contradictory to the Delivery Order Limitations language in Section 3 of the Terms and Conditions. An ADO can be valid for up to one year from the issued date.

VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: Vendor shall provide their Source Plant address and bid pricing for the Contract Item listed below. **Failure to provide Source Plant locations will result in the disqualification of the entire bid.** If Vendor needs additional space to list their plants, please use the Supplemental to ATT A. This is a multiple vendor award contract. Vendor may bid any or all Contract Items. All qualifying vendors meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a contract. The low bid vendor per project will be determined at the time of need, as per Section 4 of the Contract Specifications. No future use of this Contract is guaranteed or implied. Estimated quantities are not available.

VENDOR NAME: SHRIVER TRUCKING CO INC

Source Plant Names & Addresses:

(Please provide a negative (-) with the longitudes.)

Name:	SHILOH QUARRY	Latitude:	
Address:	90 QUARRY DR PARSONS, WV 26287	Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	

Contract Item	Description	Composition*	Unit of Measure	Bid Price
1	Class 1 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	\$11.00
2	Class 1 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
3	Class 1 Aggregate	Slag	Tons	NO BID
4	Class 2 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	\$11.25
5	Class 2 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
6	Class 2 Aggregate	Slag	Tons	NO BID
7	Class 10 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
8	AASHTO #1 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	\$13.00
9	AASHTO #1 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
10	AASHTO #3 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	\$13.50
11	AASHTO #3 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
12	AASHTO #4 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	\$15.50
13	AASHTO #467 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
14	AASHTO #57 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	\$17.50
15	AASHTO #57 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
16	AASHTO #67 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
17	AASHTO #67 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
18	AASHTO #7 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
19	AASHTO #7 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
20	AASHTO #8 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	\$17.50
21	AASHTO #8 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
22	AASHTO #8 MODIFIED	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
23	AASHTO #8 MODIFIED	LSGS	Tons	NO BID

VENDOR NAME:

SHRIVER TRUCKING CO INC

Source Plant Names & Addresses:

(Please provide a negative (-) with the longitudes.)

Name:	SHILOH QUARRY	Latitude:	
Address:	90 QUARRY DR PARSONS, WV 26287	Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	

Contract Item	Description	Composition*	Unit of Measure	Bid Price
24	AASHTO #9 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
25	AASHTO #9 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
26	AASHTO #9 MODIFIED	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
27	AASHTO #9 MODIFIED	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
28	AASHTO #10 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
29	Stone for Gabions	Limestone Only	Tons	\$15.00
30	Stone for Gabions	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
31	Fine Aggregate (PCC or Mortar Sand)	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
32	Trail Surface Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
33	Limestone Standard Abrasives	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
34	Limestone Standard Abrasives	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
35	Sandstone Standard Abrasives	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
36	Steel Slag for SRIC	Slag	Tons	NO BID
37	Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
38	Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
39	Sandstone MODIFIED Abrasives	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
40	Cinders	Cinders	Tons	NO BID
41	Pea Gravel	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
42	#11 Limestone Abrasives	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
43	Quarry Waste	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
44	Rip Rap	LSGS	Tons	\$16.00
45	Shot Rock	Limestone Only	Tons	\$17.00
46	Shot Rock	LSGS	Tons	\$18.00
47	Imbricated Stone	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
48	Spreading Surcharge/Tailgating		Tons	\$1.00/TON
49	Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract Items 1-43)		Mile	\$1.50/MILE
50	Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract Items 1-43)		Mile	\$0.20
51	Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract Items 44-47)		Mile	\$2.00
52	Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract Items 44-47)		Mile	\$0.25
LSGS: L	imestone, Sandstone, Gravel or Sand			

VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: Vendor shall provide their Source Plant address and bid pricing for the Contract Item listed below. **Failure to provide Source Plant locations will result in the disqualification of the entire bid.** If Vendor needs additional space to list their plants, please use the Supplemental to ATT A. This is a multiple vendor award contract. Vendor may bid any or all Contract Items. All qualifying vendors meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a contract. The low bid vendor per project will be determined at the time of need, as per Section 4 of the Contract Specifications. No future use of this Contract is guaranteed or implied. Estimated quantities are not available.

VENDOR NAME: SHRIVER TRUCKING CO INC

Source Plant Names & Addresses:

(Please provide a negative (-) with the longitudes.)

Name:	J.F. ALLEN COMPANY AGGREGATES QUARRY	Latitude:	
Address:	3105 HARRISON AVE. ELKINS, WV 26241	Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	

Contract Item	Description	Composition*	Unit of Measure	Bid Price
1	Class 1 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	\$16.25
2	Class 1 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	\$15.75
3	Class 1 Aggregate	Slag	Tons	NO BID
4	Class 2 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	\$16.25
5	Class 2 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	\$15.75
6	Class 2 Aggregate	Slag	Tons	NO BID
7	Class 10 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	\$16.25
8	AASHTO #1 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	\$20.40
9	AASHTO #1 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	\$19.90
10	AASHTO #3 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	\$20.40
11	AASHTO #3 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	\$19.90
12	AASHTO #4 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	\$21.50
13	AASHTO #467 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	\$21.50
14	AASHTO #57 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	\$21.50
15	AASHTO #57 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	\$21.00
16	AASHTO #67 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	\$21.50
17	AASHTO #67 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	\$21.00
18	AASHTO #7 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
19	AASHTO #7 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
20	AASHTO #8 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	\$23.50
21	AASHTO #8 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	\$23.00
22	AASHTO #8 MODIFIED	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
23	AASHTO #8 MODIFIED	LSGS	Tons	NO BID

VENDOR NAME: SHRIVER TRUCKING CO INC

Source Plant Names & Addresses:

(Please provide a negative (-) with the longitudes.)

Name:	J.F. ALLEN COMPANY AGGREGATES QUARRY	Latitude:	
Address:	3105 HARRISON AVE. ELKINS, WV 26241	Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	

Contract Item	Description	Composition*	Unit of Measure	Bid Price
24	AASHTO #9 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	\$21.50
25	AASHTO #9 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	\$21.00
26	AASHTO #9 MODIFIED	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
27	AASHTO #9 MODIFIED	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
28	AASHTO #10 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
29	Stone for Gabions	Limestone Only	Tons	\$20.00
30	Stone for Gabions	LSGS	Tons	\$20.00
31	Fine Aggregate (PCC or Mortar Sand)	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
32	Trail Surface Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
33	Limestone Standard Abrasives	Limestone Only	Tons	\$21.50
34	Limestone Standard Abrasives	LSGS	Tons	\$21.00
35	Sandstone Standard Abrasives	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
36	Steel Slag for SRIC	Slag	Tons	NO BID
37	Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
38	Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
39	Sandstone MODIFIED Abrasives	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
40	Cinders	Cinders	Tons	NO BID
41	Pea Gravel	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
42	#11 Limestone Abrasives	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
43	Quarry Waste	LSGS	Tons	\$16.25
44	Rip Rap	LSGS	Tons	\$24.00
45	Shot Rock	Limestone Only	Tons	\$22.00
46	Shot Rock	LSGS	Tons	\$22.00
47	Imbricated Stone	LSGS	Tons	\$75.00
48	Spreading Surcharge/Tailgating		Tons	\$1.00/TON
49	Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract Items 1-43)		Mile	\$1.50/MILE
50	Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract Items 1-43)		Mile	\$0.20
51	Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract Items 44-47)		Mile	\$2.00
52	Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract Items 44-47)		Mile	\$0.25
LSGS: Li	mestone, Sandstone, Gravel or Sand			

VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: Vendor shall provide their Source Plant address and bid pricing for the Contract Item listed below. **Failure to provide Source Plant locations will result in the disqualification of the entire bid.** If Vendor needs additional space to list their plants, please use the Supplemental to ATT A. This is a multiple vendor award contract. Vendor may bid any or all Contract Items. All qualifying vendors meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a contract. The low bid vendor per project will be determined at the time of need, as per Section 4 of the Contract Specifications. No future use of this Contract is guaranteed or implied. Estimated quantities are not available.

VENDOR NAME: SHRIVER TRUCKING CO INC

Source Plant Names & Addresses:

(Please provide a negative (-) with the longitudes.)

Name:	J.F. ALLEN COMPANY MASHEY GAP	Latitude:	
Address:	5254 CHENOWETH CREEK RD ELKINS, WV 26241	Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	·

Contract Item	Description	Composition*	Unit of Measure	Bid Price
1	Class 1 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	\$12.00
2	Class 1 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
3	Class 1 Aggregate	Slag	Tons	NO BID
4	Class 2 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	\$12.00
5	Class 2 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
6	Class 2 Aggregate	Slag	Tons	NO BID
7	Class 10 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	\$12.00
8	AASHTO #1 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
9	AASHTO #1 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
10	AASHTO #3 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	\$15.50
11	AASHTO #3 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
12	AASHTO #4 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
13	AASHTO #467 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	\$16.50
14	AASHTO #57 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	\$16.50
15	AASHTO #57 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
16	AASHTO #67 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	\$16.50
17	AASHTO #67 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
18	AASHTO #7 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
19	AASHTO #7 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
20	AASHTO #8 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	\$20.00
21	AASHTO #8 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
22	AASHTO #8 MODIFIED	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
23	AASHTO #8 MODIFIED	LSGS	Tons	NO BID

VENDOR NAME: SHRIVER TRUCKING CO INC

Source Plant Names & Addresses:

(Please provide a negative (-) with the longitudes.)

Name:	J.F. ALLEN COMPANY MASHEY GAP	Latitude:	
Address:	5254 CHENOWETH CREEK RD ELKINS, WV 26241	Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	

Contract Item	Description	Composition*	Unit of Measure	Bid Price
24	AASHTO #9 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
25	AASHTO #9 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
26	AASHTO #9 MODIFIED	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
27	AASHTO #9 MODIFIED	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
28	AASHTO #10 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
29	Stone for Gabions	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
30	Stone for Gabions	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
31	Fine Aggregate (PCC or Mortar Sand)	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
32	Trail Surface Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
33	Limestone Standard Abrasives	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
34	Limestone Standard Abrasives	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
35	Sandstone Standard Abrasives	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
36	Steel Slag for SRIC	Slag	Tons	NO BID
37	Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
38	Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
39	Sandstone MODIFIED Abrasives	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
40	Cinders	Cinders	Tons	NO BID
41	Pea Gravel	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
42	#11 Limestone Abrasives	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
43	Quarry Waste	LSGS	Tons	\$12.00
44	Rip Rap	LSGS	Tons	\$21.00
45	Shot Rock	Limestone Only	Tons	\$20.00
46	Shot Rock	LSGS	Tons	\$20.00
47	Imbricated Stone	LSGS	Tons	\$75.00
48	Spreading Surcharge/Tailgating		Tons	\$1.00/TON
49	Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract Items 1-43)		Mile	\$1.50/MILE
50	Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract Items 1-43)		Mile	\$0.20
51	Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract Items 44-47)		Mile	\$2.00
52	Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract Items 44-47)		Mile	\$0.25

VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: Vendor shall provide their Source Plant address and bid pricing for the Contract Item listed below. **Failure to provide Source Plant locations will result in the disqualification of the entire bid.** If Vendor needs additional space to list their plants, please use the Supplemental to ATT A. This is a multiple vendor award contract. Vendor may bid any or all Contract Items. All qualifying vendors meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a contract. The low bid vendor per project will be determined at the time of need, as per Section 4 of the Contract Specifications. No future use of this Contract is guaranteed or implied. Estimated quantities are not available.

VENDOR NAME: SHRIVER TRUCKING CO INC

Source Plant Names & Addresses:

(Please provide a negative (-) with the longitudes.)

Name:	APPALACHIAN AGGREGATES	Latitude:	
Address:	400 STAMPING CREEK RD HILLSBORO, WV 24946	Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	

Contract Item	Description	Composition*	Unit of Measure	Bid Price
1	Class 1 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	\$13.25
2	Class 1 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	\$13.25
3	Class 1 Aggregate	Slag	Tons	NO BID
4	Class 2 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	\$13.10
5	Class 2 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	\$13.10
6	Class 2 Aggregate	Slag	Tons	NO BID
7	Class 10 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
8	AASHTO #1 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	\$16.80
9	AASHTO #1 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	\$16.80
10	AASHTO #3 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	\$16.80
11	AASHTO #3 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	\$16.80
12	AASHTO #4 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	\$16.80
13	AASHTO #467 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	\$17.00
14	AASHTO #57 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	\$17.00
15	AASHTO #57 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	\$17.00
16	AASHTO #67 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	\$17.00
17	AASHTO #67 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	\$17.00
18	AASHTO #7 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
19	AASHTO #7 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
20	AASHTO #8 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	\$20.30
21	AASHTO #8 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	\$20.30
22	AASHTO #8 MODIFIED	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
23	AASHTO #8 MODIFIED	LSGS	Tons	NO BID

VENDOR NAME:

SHRIVER TRUCKING CO INC

Source Plant Names & Addresses:

(Please provide a negative (-) with the longitudes.)

Name:	APPALACHIAN AGGREGATES	Latitude:	
Address:	400 STAMPING CREEK RD HILLSBORO, WV 24946	Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	

Contract Item	Description	Composition*	Unit of Measure	Bid Price
24	AASHTO #9 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
25	AASHTO #9 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
26	AASHTO #9 MODIFIED	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
27	AASHTO #9 MODIFIED	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
28	AASHTO #10 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
29	Stone for Gabions	Limestone Only	Tons	\$17.20
30	Stone for Gabions	LSGS	Tons	\$17.20
31	Fine Aggregate (PCC or Mortar Sand)	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
32	Trail Surface Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
33	Limestone Standard Abrasives	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
34	Limestone Standard Abrasives	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
35	Sandstone Standard Abrasives	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
36	Steel Slag for SRIC	Slag	Tons	NO BID
37	Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
38	Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
39	Sandstone MODIFIED Abrasives	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
40	Cinders	Cinders	Tons	NO BID
41	Pea Gravel	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
42	#11 Limestone Abrasives	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
43	Quarry Waste	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
44	Rip Rap	LSGS	Tons	\$16.80
45	Shot Rock	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
46	Shot Rock	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
47	Imbricated Stone	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
48	Spreading Surcharge/Tailgating		Tons	\$1.00/TON
49	Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract Items 1-43)		Mile	\$1.50/MILE
50	Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract Items 1-43)		Mile	\$0.20
51	Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract Items 44-47)		Mile	\$2.00
52	Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract Items 44-47)		Mile	\$0.25

VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: Vendor shall provide their Source Plant address and bid pricing for the Contract Item listed below. Failure to provide Source Plant locations will result in the disqualification of the entire bid. If Vendor needs additional space to list their plants, please use the Supplemental to ATT A. This is a multiple vendor award contract. Vendor may bid any or all Contract Items. All qualifying vendors meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a contract. The low bid vendor per project will be determined at the time of need, as per Section 4 of the Contract Specifications. No future use of this Contract is guaranteed or implied. Estimated quantities are not available.

VENDOR NAME: SHRIVER TRUCKING CO INC

Source Plant Names & Addresses:

(Please provide a negative (-) with the longitudes.)

Name:	APPALACHIAN AGGREGATES	Latitude:	
Address:	RT 33 KELLY MOUNTAIN RD ELKINS, WV 26241	Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	

Contract Item	Description	Composition*	Unit of Measure	Bid Price
1	Class 1 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	\$11.90
2	Class 1 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	\$11.90
3	Class 1 Aggregate	Slag	Tons	NO BID
4	Class 2 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	\$11.90
5	Class 2 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	\$11.90
6	Class 2 Aggregate	Slag	Tons	NO BID
7	Class 10 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
8	AASHTO #1 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	\$15.60
9	AASHTO #1 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
10	AASHTO #3 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	\$15.60
11	AASHTO #3 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
12	AASHTO #4 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	\$15.75
13	AASHTO #467 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	\$16.50
14	AASHTO #57 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	\$15.75
15	AASHTO #57 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	\$15.75
16	AASHTO #67 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
17	AASHTO #67 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
18	AASHTO #7 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
19	AASHTO #7 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
20	AASHTO #8 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	\$17.25
21	AASHTO #8 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
22	AASHTO #8 MODIFIED	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
23	AASHTO #8 MODIFIED	LSGS	Tons	NO BID

VENDOR NAME: SHRIVER TRUCKING CO INC

Source Plant Names & Addresses:

(Please provide a negative (-) with the longitudes.)

Name:	APPALACHIAN AGGREGATES	Latitude:	
Address:	RT 33 KELLY MOUNTAIN RD ELKINS, WV 26241	Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name: _		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	

25	AASHTO #9 Aggregate			Bid Price
25	/Violitio #5 /iggicgate	Limestone Only	Tons	\$17.25
	AASHTO #9 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
26	AASHTO #9 MODIFIED	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
27	AASHTO #9 MODIFIED	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
28	AASHTO #10 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
	Stone for Gabions	Limestone Only	Tons	\$15.75
30	Stone for Gabions	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
31	Fine Aggregate (PCC or Mortar Sand)	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
32	Trail Surface Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
33	Limestone Standard Abrasives	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
34	Limestone Standard Abrasives	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
35	Sandstone Standard Abrasives	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
36	Steel Slag for SRIC	Slag	Tons	NO BID
37	Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
38	Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
39	Sandstone MODIFIED Abrasives	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
40	Cinders	Cinders	Tons	NO BID
41	Pea Gravel	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
42	#11 Limestone Abrasives	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
43	Quarry Waste	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
44	Rip Rap	LSGS	Tons	\$17.25
45	Shot Rock	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
46	Shot Rock	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
47	Imbricated Stone	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
48	Spreading Surcharge/Tailgating	7	Tons	\$1.00/TON
49	Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract Items 1-43)		Mile	\$1.50/MILE
50	Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract Items 1-43)		Mile	\$0.20
51	Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract Items 44-47)		Mile	\$2.00
52	Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract Items 44-47)		Mile	\$0.25

VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: Vendor shall provide their Source Plant address and bid pricing for the Contract Item listed below. Failure to provide Source Plant locations will result in the disqualification of the entire bid. If Vendor needs additional space to list their plants, please use the Supplemental to ATT A. This is a multiple vendor award contract. Vendor may bid any or all Contract Items. All qualifying vendors meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a contract. The low bid vendor per project will be determined at the time of need, as per Section 4 of the Contract Specifications. No future use of this Contract is guaranteed or implied. Estimated quantities are not available.

VENDOR NAME: SHRIVER TRUCKING CO INC

Source Plant Names & Addresses:

(Please provide a negative (-) with the longitudes.)

Name:	ACE AGGREGATES	Latitude:	
Address:	9989 MOUNTAINEER HWY PARSONS, WV 26278	Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:	·	Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	

Contract Item	Description	Composition*	Unit of Measure	Bid Price
1	Class 1 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	\$12.50
2	Class 1 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	\$12.50
3	Class 1 Aggregate	Slag	Tons	NO BID
4	Class 2 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	\$13.20
5	Class 2 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	\$13.20
6	Class 2 Aggregate	Slag	Tons	NO BID
7	Class 10 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
8	AASHTO #1 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	\$14.00
9	AASHTO #1 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
10	AASHTO #3 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
11	AASHTO #3 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
12	AASHTO #4 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	\$17.00
13	AASHTO #467 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
14	AASHTO #57 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	\$19.25
15	AASHTO #57 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	\$19.25
16	AASHTO #67 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
17	AASHTO #67 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
18	AASHTO #7 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
19	AASHTO #7 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
20	AASHTO #8 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	\$23.00
21	AASHTO #8 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	\$23.00
22	AASHTO #8 MODIFIED	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
23	AASHTO #8 MODIFIED	LSGS	Tons	NO BID

VENDOR NAME: SHRIVER TRUCKING CO INC

Source Plant Names & Addresses:

(Please provide a negative (-) with the longitudes.)

Name:	ACE AGGREGATES	Latitude:	
Address:	9989 MOUNTAINEER HWY PARSONS, WV 26278	Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	
Name:		Latitude:	
Address:		Longitude:	

Contract Item	Description	Composition*	Unit of Measure	Bid Price
24	AASHTO #9 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
25	AASHTO #9 Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
26	AASHTO #9 MODIFIED	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
27	AASHTO #9 MODIFIED	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
28	AASHTO #10 Aggregate	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
29	Stone for Gabions	Limestone Only	Tons	\$16.50
30	Stone for Gabions	LSGS	Tons	\$16.50
31	Fine Aggregate (PCC or Mortar Sand)	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
32	Trail Surface Aggregate	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
33	Limestone Standard Abrasives	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
34	Limestone Standard Abrasives	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
35	Sandstone Standard Abrasives	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
36	Steel Slag for SRIC	Slag	Tons	NO BID
37	Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives	Limestone Only	Tons	NO BID
38	Limestone MODIFIED Abrasives	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
39	Sandstone MODIFIED Abrasives	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
40	Cinders	Cinders	Tons	NO BID
41	Pea Gravel	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
42	#11 Limestone Abrasives	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
43	Quarry Waste	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
44	Rip Rap	LSGS	Tons	\$17.50
45	Shot Rock	Limestone Only	Tons	\$18.50
46	Shot Rock	LSGS	Tons	\$19.50
47	Imbricated Stone	LSGS	Tons	NO BID
48	Spreading Surcharge/Tailgating		Tons	\$1.00/TON
49	Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract Items 1-43)		Mile	\$1.50/MILE
50	Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract Items 1-43)		Mile	\$0.20
51	Haul, First Ton-Mile (Contract Items 44-47)		Mile	\$2.00
52	Haul, Additional Ton-Mile (Contract Items 44-47)		Mile	\$0.25
	mestone, Sandstone, Gravel or Sand			

WEST VIRGINIA STATE TAX DEPARTMENT BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE

ISSUED TO:
SHRIVER TRUCKING COMPANY INC
686 US HIGHWAY 33 W
WESTON, WV 26452-7311

BUSINESS REGISTRATION ACCOUNT NUMBER:

1043-2113

This certificate is issued on:

08/20/2014

This certificate is issued by the West Virginia State Tax Commissioner in accordance with Chapter 11, Article 12, of the West Virginia Code

The person or organization identified on this certificate is registered to conduct business in the State of West Virginia at the location above.

This certificate is not transferrable and must be displayed at the location for which issued

This certificate shall be permanent until cessation of the business for which the certificate of registration was granted or until it is suspended, revoked or cancelled by the Tax Commissioner.

Change in name or change of location shall be considered a cessation of the business and a new certificate shall be required.

TRAVELING/STREET VENDORS: Must carry a copy of this certificate in every vehicle operated by them. CONTRACTORS, DRILLING OPERATORS, TIMBER/LOGGING OPERATIONS: Must have a copy of this certificate displayed at every job site within West Virginia.

atL006 v.4 L1318283840

REVISION NUMBER:

JBURNSIDE

ACORD

COVERAGES

CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

7/10/2025

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed. If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on this certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

PRODUCER G.J. Garton Insurance Agency, Inc. 400 U.S. Highway 33 East Weston, WV 26452		CONTACT NAME:					
		PHONE (A/C, No, Ext): (304) 269-3095 FAX (A/C, No)	:				
		E-MAIL ADDRESS:					
		INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE	NAIC #				
INSURED		INSURER A : Erie Insurance Company	26263				
		INSURER B : Progressive	42994				
Shriver Truckin	g Company Inc.	INSURER C : Erie Ins Property & Casualty	26830				
PO Box 1171		INSURER D : Erie Ins Co of New York	16233				
Weston, WV 26	452	INSURER E :					
		INSURER F:					

NSR	TYPE OF INSURANCE	ADDL SUBI	POLICY NUMBER	POLICY EFF (MM/DD/YYYY)	POLICY EXP (MM/DD/YYYY)	LIMIT	s	4 000 00
В	X COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY CLAIMS-MADE X OCCUR GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: POLICY PRO- DIHER: AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY ANY AUTO OWNED AUTOS ONLY HIRED AUTOS ONLY	x .	Q61-0479185 990398056		12/12/2025		s s s	1,000,00 1,000,00 10,00 1,000,00 2,000,00 2,000,00
С	X UMBRELLA LIAB OCCUR EXCESS LIAB CLAIMS-MADE DED RETENTION S	x	Q36-6270025	12/12/2024	12/12/2025	EACH OCCURRENCE AGGREGATE	s s	1,000,00
D	WORKERS COMPENSATION AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY ANY PROPRIETOR/PARTNER/EXECUTIVE OFFICER/MEMBER EXCLUDED? (Mandatory in Wri) If yes, describe under DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below	N/A	Q91-7400272	7/24/2025	7/24/2026	PER OTH- STATUTE ER EL EACH ACCIDENT EL DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE EL DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT	S S	1,000,00 1,000,00 1,000,00

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, may be attached if more space is required)

CERTIFICATE NUMBER:

C	EK	۱ŀ	<u>IC</u>	ÝΪ	<u></u>	М	Û	L	11	. [ζ

CANCELLATION

STATE OF WV 1900 KANAWHA BLVD EAST BUILDING 5 Charleston, WV 25305 SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

© 1988-2015 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.

Form (Rev. October 2018) Department of the Treasury Internal Revenue Service

Request for Taxpayer Identification Number and Certification

► Go to www.irs.gov/FormW9 for instructions and the latest information.

Give Form to the requester. Do not send to the IRS.

	1 Name (as shown on your income tax return). Name is required on this line; do not leave this line blank SHRIVER TRUCKING COMPANY, INC	•													
	2 Business name/disregarded entity name, if different from above														
ne, nns on page 3.	3 Check appropriate box for federal tax classification of the person whose name is entered on line 1. C following seven boxes. Individual/sole proprietor or C C Corporation S Corporation Partnership single-member LLC	Exemptions (codes apply only to certain entities, not individuals; see instructions on page 3): Exempt payee code (if any)													
Print or type, Specific Instructions on page	Limited liability company. Enter the tax classification (C=C corporation, S=S corporation, P=Partne Note: Check the appropriate box in the line above for the tax classification of the single-member LLC if the LLC is classified as a single-member LLC that is disregarded from the owner unless the another LLC that is not disregarded from the owner for U.S. federal tax purposes. Otherwise, a single-member LLC that is not disregarded from the owner for U.S. federal tax purposes. Otherwise, a single-member LLC that is not disregarded from the owner should check the appropriate box for the tax classification of its owner should check the appropriate box for the tax classification of its owner should check the appropriate box for the tax classification of its owner should check the appropriate box for the tax classification of its owner should check the appropriate box for the tax classification of its owner should check the appropriate box for the tax classification of the single-member and the limited should be a second to the limited should be appropriate box for the tax classification of the single-member and the limited should be appropriate box for the tax classification of its owner should check the appropriate box for the tax classification of its owner should be appropriate box for the tax classification of the limited should be appropriate box for th	C is	S code (if anu)												
See Spe	Other (see instructions) ► 5 Address (number, street, and apt. or suite no.) See instructions. PO BOX 1171	ame	1	ddress	-		9 00 00								
ഗ്	6 City, state, and ZIP code WESTON, WV 26452														
	7 List account number(s) here (optional)														
Par				_											
Enter	your TIN in the appropriate box. The TIN provided must match the name given on line 1 to a	L	Soci	al se	ecurity number										
reside	up withholding. For individuals, this is generally your social security number (SSN). However, ant alien, sole proprietor, or disregarded entity, see the instructions for Part I, later. For other is, it is your employer identification number (EIN). If you do not have a number, see How to g					-		-							
71N, 1			r												
Note:	If the account is in more than one name, see the instructions for line 1. Also see What Name	and L	Emp	loye	r ider	tificati	on nu	mber							
Number To Give the Requester for guidelines on whose number to enter. 5 5							3	5 3	4	8					
Pai	t II Certification														
Unde	r penalties of perjury, I certify that:														
1. The number shown on this form is my correct taxpayer identification number (or I am waiting for a number to be issued to me); and 2. I am not subject to backup withholding because: (a) I am exempt from backup withholding, or (b) I have not been notified by the Internal Revenue Service (IRS) that I am subject to backup withholding as a result of a failure to report all interest or dividends, or (c) the IRS has notified me that I am no longer subject to backup withholding; and								e am							
	m a U.S. citizen or other U.S. person (defined below); and														
4. Th	e FATCA code(s) entered on this form (if any) Indicating that I am exempt from FATCA repor														
_	and the state of t			hieri	hight	to bac	burn u	ithhe	dine	i bers	92118				

Gertification instructions. You must cross out item 2 above if you have been notified by the IRS that you are currently subject to backup withholding because you have failed to report all interest and dividends on your tax return. For real estate transactions, item 2 does not apply. For mortgage interest paid, acquisition or abandonment of secured property, cancellation of debt, contributions to an individual retirement arrangement (IRA), and generally, payments other than interest and dividends, you are not required to sign the certification, but you must provide your correct TIN. See the instructions for Part II, later.

Sign Here

Signature of U.S. person ▶

2+

Date▶

General Instructions

Section references are to the Internal Revenue Code unless otherwise noted.

Future developments. For the latest information about developments related to Form W-9 and its instructions, such as legislation enacted after they were published, go to www.irs.gov/FormW9.

Purpose of Form

An individual or entity (Form W-9 requester) who is required to file an information return with the IRS must obtain your correct taxpayer identification number (TIN) which may be your social security number (SSN), individual taxpayer identification number (ITIN), adoption taxpayer identification number (ATIN), or employer identification number (EIN), to report on an information return the amount paid to you, or other amount reportable on an information return. Examples of information returns include, but are not limited to, the following.

Form 1099-INT (interest earned or paid)

- Form 1099-DIV (dividends, including those from stocks or mutual funds)
- Form 1099-MISC (various types of income, prizes, awards, or gross proceeds)
- Form 1099-B (stock or mutual fund sales and certain other transactions by brokers)
- Form 1099-S (proceeds from real estate transactions)
- Form 1099-K (merchant card and third party network transactions)
- Form 1098 (home mortgage interest), 1098-E (student loan interest), 1098-T (tuition)
- Form 1099-C (canceled debt)
- Form 1099-A (acquisition or abandonment of secured property)

Use Form W-9 only if you are a U.S. person (including a resident alien), to provide your correct TIN.

if you do not return Form W-9 to the requester with a TIN, you might be subject to backup withholding. See What is backup withholding, later.