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Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder: 1886497

Solicitation Description: Steel Inventory - Org. 0122, 0124, 0123, 0173, and 0170

Proc Type: Agency Purchase Order

Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

2026-02-10 10:30 SR 0803 ESR02102600000004624 1

VENDOR

VS0000045819
SWIPE RESOURCES LLC

Solicitation Number: ARFQ 0803 DOT2600000053

Total Bid: 32258 Response Date: 2026-02-10 Response Time: 10:23:32

Comments:  

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Kristine E James
304-558-0408
kristy.e.james@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X                                                                     FEIN#                                                       DATE
All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 ANGLE BAR 1" X 1"  X 3/16" X 20'

Org- 0122
1.00000 EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
ANGLE BAR 1" X 1"  X 3/16" X 20'
Org- 0122

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2 ANGLE BAR 2" X 2"  X 5/16" X 20'

Org- 0122
1.00000 EA 357.000000 357.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 2"X2"X5/16" A-36 STEEL ANGLE

Extended Description:
ANGLE BAR 2" X 2"  X 5/16" X 20'
Org- 0122

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
3 ANGLE STR 3" X 3"  X 3/8" X 20'

Org- 0122
1.00000 EA 294.000000 294.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 3" X 3" X 3/8" A-36 STEEL ANGLE
G7/4-1

Extended Description:
ANGLE STR 3" X 3"  X 3/8" X 20'
Org- 0122

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
4 BAR CF ROUND C1045 1/2" X 20'

Org- 0122
1.00000 EA 2717.000000 2717.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 1/2" C1045 COLD DRAWN ROUND PRECISION SHAFT TGP
E38 / 20-C / 29
*** (1) PC @ 240 INCHES

Extended Description:
BAR CF ROUND C1045 1/2" X 20'
Org- 0122

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
5 BAR CF ROUND C1045 5/8" X 20'

Org- 0122
1.00000 EA 255.000000 255.00
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Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 5/8" DIA. C1045 TGP PRECISION SHAFTING
E-38 / 20-C
*** (1) PC @ 240 INCHES

Extended Description:
BAR CF ROUND C1045 5/8" X 20'
Org- 0122

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
6 BAR CF ROUND C1045  3/4" X 20'

Org- 0122
1.00000 EA 290.000000 290.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 3/4" DIA. C1045 TGP PRECISION SHFT
E-38/28
*** (1) PC @ 240 INCHES

Extended Description:
BAR CF ROUND C1045  3/4" X 20'
Org- 0122

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
7 BAR CF ROUND C1045  7/8" X 20'

Org- 0122
1.00000 EA 497.000000 497.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 7/8" DIA. C1045 TGP SHAFTING
E-38
*** (1) PC @ 240 INCHES

Extended Description:
BAR CF ROUND C1045  7/8" X 20'
Org- 0122

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
8 STRIP HR  3/16" X 2"  X  20'

Org- 0122
1.00000 EA 89.000000 89.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 3/16" X 2" HR STEEL FLAT
C28 / 2-19

Extended Description:
STRIP HR  3/16" X 2"  X  20'
Org- 0122

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
9 BAR HR Flat  5/16" x 2" x  20'

Org- 0122
1.00000 EA   
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Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
BAR HR Flat  5/16" x 2" x  20'
Org- 0122

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
10 STRIP HR 3/16" X 1"  X  20'

Org- 0122
1.00000 EA 60.000000 60.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 3/16" X 1" HR STEEL FLAT
C26 / 2-16

Extended Description:
STRIP HR 3/16" X 1"  X  20'
Org- 0122

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
11 2" x 2" x 1/8" x 24 '

Org- 0124
5.00000 EA 94.000000 470.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 2" X 2" X 1/8" A-36 STEEL ANGLE
C76 / 3-10

Extended Description:
2" x 2" x 1/8" x 24 '
Org- 0124

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
12 3/16" x 48" x 120" ( cut 30" x 120")

Org- 0124
1.00000 EA 876.000000 876.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 3/16" A-36 HR STEEL PLATE
T-8/Y-47
4X10/5X10-W70
*** (1) PC @ 30 INCHES X 120 INCHES

Extended Description:
3/16" x 48" x 120" ( cut 30" x 120")
Org- 0124

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
13 4'x8'  1/4" thick sheets

Org-0123
2.00000 EA 682.000000 1364.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    
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Commodity Line Comments: 1/4" A-36 HR STEEL PLATE
T10/Y48
4'X10'-W69
5'X10'-W69

Extended Description:
4'x8'  1/4" thick sheets
Org-0123

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
14 4' x 8' 18 gauge Sheet

Org-0123
2.00000 EA 355.000000 710.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 18 GA. (.048") COLD ROLLED STEEL SHEET A1008-B
S-2/Y-41
*** (2) PCS @ 48 INCHES X 96 INCHES

Extended Description:
4' x 8' 18 gauge Sheet
Org-0123

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
15 Hot Roll Round Bar, Full Stick,  1/4"

Org-0173
1.00000 EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Hot Roll Round Bar, Full Stick,  1/4"
Org-0173

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
16 Hot Roll Round Bar, Full Stick,  3/8" 

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA 65.000000 65.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 3/8" HR A-36 STEEL ROUND
F19/1-28

Extended Description:
Hot Roll Round Bar, Full Stick,  3/8" 
Org- 0173

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
17 Hot Roll Round Bar, Full Stick,  1/2"

Org-0173
1.00000 EA 60.000000 60.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 1/2" HR A-36 STEEL ROUND
F20/1-29
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Extended Description:
Hot Roll Round Bar, Full Stick,  1/2"
Org-0173

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
18 Hot Roll Round Bar, Full Stick,  5/8"

Org-0173
1.00000 EA 99.000000 99.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 5/8" HR A-36 STEEL ROUND
F20/1-30

Extended Description:
Hot Roll Round Bar, Full Stick,  5/8"
Org-0173

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
19 Hot Roll Round Bar, Full Stick,   3/4"

Org-0173
1.00000 EA 93.000000 93.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 3/4" HR A-36 STEEL ROUND
F20/1-31

Extended Description:
Hot Roll Round Bar, Full Stick,   3/4"
Org-0173

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
20 Hot Roll Round Bar, Full Stick,   7/8"

Org-0173
1.00000 EA 99.000000 99.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 7/8" HR A36 STEEL ROUND BAR
F21/1-35

Extended Description:
Hot Roll Round Bar, Full Stick,   7/8"
Org-0173

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
21 Hot Roll Round Bar, Full Stick,  1"

Org-0173
1.00000 EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Hot Roll Round Bar, Full Stick,  1"
Org-0173
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
22 Hot Roll Round Bar, Full Stick,  1 1/8"

Org-0173
1.00000 EA   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
Hot Roll Round Bar, Full Stick,  1 1/8"
Org-0173

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
23 Hot Roll Round Bar, Full Stick,   1 1/14"

Org-0173
1.00000 EA 327.000000 327.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 1-1/4" HR A-36 STEEL ROUND
M-3/1-38

Extended Description:
Hot Roll Round Bar, Full Stick,   1 1/14"
Org-0173

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
24 Hot Roll Round Bar, Full Stick,  1 1/2"

Org-0173
1.00000 EA 283.000000 283.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 1-1/2" HR A-36 STEEL ROUND
M-3/1-39

Extended Description:
Hot Roll Round Bar, Full Stick,  1 1/2"
Org-0173

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
25 Angle, Full Joint, 1/4" T   2" x 2"

Org.-0173
1.00000 EA 165.000000 165.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 2" X 2" X 1/4" A-36 STEEL ANGLE
G6 / 3-14 / MDX-C

Extended Description:
Angle, Full Joint, 1/4" T   2" x 2"
Org.-0173

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
26 Angle, Full Joint, 1/4" T    3" x 3"

Org.-0173
1.00000 EA 432.000000 432.00
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Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 3" X 3" X 1/4" A-36 STEEL ANGLE
G3/4-15

Extended Description:
Angle, Full Joint, 1/4" T    3" x 3"
Org.-0173

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
27 Angle, Full Joint, 1/4" T   4" x 4"

Org.-0173
1.00000 EA 390.000000 390.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 4" X 4" X 1/4" A-36 STEEL ANGLE
G-2/31

Extended Description:
Angle, Full Joint, 1/4" T   4" x 4"
Org.-0173

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
28 Angle, Full Joint, 1/2" T   3" x 3"

Org.-0173
1.00000 EA 543.000000 543.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 3" X 3" X 1/2" A-36 STEEL ANGLE
G6/31 / 4-13

Extended Description:
Angle, Full Joint, 1/2" T   3" x 3"
Org.-0173

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
29 Angle, Full Joint, 1/2" T    4" x 4"

Org.-0173
1.00000 EA 765.000000 765.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 4" X 4" X 1/2" A-36 STEEL ANGLE
G2/31

Extended Description:
Angle, Full Joint, 1/2" T    4" x 4"
Org.-0173

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
30 Sq Tube, Full Joint,  1/8" T   1"x1" 

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA 162.000000 162.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    



Date Printed: Feb 10, 2026 Page: 9 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05

Commodity Line Comments: 1" X 1" X 11GA. (.120") A513 SQUARE STEEL TUBE
F38/21-

Extended Description:
Sq Tube, Full Joint,  1/8" T   1"x1" 
Org- 0173

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
31 Sq Tube, Full Joint,  1/8" T   2"x2"

Org-0173
1.00000 EA 354.000000 354.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 2" X 2" X 11GA. (.120") A500 SQUARE STEEL TUBE
F52/22-9

Extended Description:
Sq Tube, Full Joint,  1/8" T   2"x2"
Org-0173

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
32 Sq Tube, Full Joint,  1/4"  2"x2"

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA 534.000000 534.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 2" X 2" X 1/4" A500 SQUARE STEEL TUBE
F54/22-1

Extended Description:
Sq Tube, Full Joint,  1/4"  2"x2"
Org- 0173

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
33 Plate 4' x 10' Sheets  1/8 T

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA 453.000000 453.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 11 GA. (.120") HOT ROLLED STEEL SHEET
P11/Y-45
W67=5'X10

Extended Description:
Plate 4' x 10' Sheets  1/8 T
Org- 0173

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
34 Plate 4' x 10' Sheets   3/16  T

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA 658.000000 658.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 3/16" A-36 HR STEEL PLATE
T-8/Y-47
4X10/5X10-W70
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Extended Description:
Plate 4' x 10' Sheets   3/16  T
Org- 0173

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
35 Plate 4' x 10' Sheets   1/4  T

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA 877.000000 877.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 1/4" A-36 HR STEEL PLATE
T10/Y48
4'X10'-W69
5'X10'-W69

Extended Description:
Plate 4' x 10' Sheets   1/4  T
Org- 0173

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
36 Plate 4' x 10' Sheets   3/8  T

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA 1412.000000 1412.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 3/8" A-36 HR STEEL PLATE
T-FLOOR
CUT PLATE J1

Extended Description:
Plate 4' x 10' Sheets   3/8  T
Org- 0173

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
37 Plate 4' x 10' Sheets   1/2  T

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA 1955.000000 1955.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 1/2" A-36 HR STEEL PLATE
T-FLOOR/32
CUT PLATE J-

Extended Description:
Plate 4' x 10' Sheets   1/2  T
Org- 0173

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
38 Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/8 T   1"

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA 55.000000 55.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 1/8" X 1" C1018 COLD FINISHED FLAT
B14
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Extended Description:
Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/8 T   1"
Org- 0173

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
39 Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/8 T    2"

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA 67.000000 67.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 1/8" X 2" C1018 COLD FINISHED FLAT
B14

Extended Description:
Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/8 T    2"
Org- 0173

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
40 Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/8 T   3"

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA 92.000000 92.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 1/8" X 3" C1018 COLD FINISHED FLAT
B15

Extended Description:
Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/8 T   3"
Org- 0173

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
41 Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/8 T   4"

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA 191.000000 191.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 1/8" X 4" C1018 COLD FINISHED FLAT
B

Extended Description:
Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/8 T   4"
Org- 0173

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
42 Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/8 T   6"

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA 275.000000 275.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 1/8" X 6" C1018 COLD FINISHED FLAT
B85

Extended Description:
Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/8 T   6"
Org- 0173
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
43 Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/4 T   1"

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA 60.000000 60.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 1/4" X 1" C1018 COLD FINISHED FLAT
B17/20B

Extended Description:
Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/4 T   1"
Org- 0173

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
44 Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/4 T   1 1/2"

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA 82.000000 82.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 1/4" X 1-1/2" C1018 COLD FINISHED FLAT
B18

Extended Description:
Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/4 T   1 1/2"
Org- 0173

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
45 Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/4 T   2"

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA 95.000000 95.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 1/4" X 2" C1018 COLD FINISHED FLAT
B18/20-B

Extended Description:
Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/4 T   2"
Org- 0173

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
46 Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/4 T   2 1/2"

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA 99.000000 99.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 1/4" X 2-1/2" C1018 COLD FINISHED FLAT
B18/20-B

Extended Description:
Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/4 T   2 1/2"
Org- 0173

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
47 Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/4 T   3"

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA 142.000000 142.00
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Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 1/4" X 3" C1018 COLD FINISHED FLAT
B-73

Extended Description:
Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/4 T   3"
Org- 0173

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
48 Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/4 T   4"

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA 208.000000 208.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 1/4" X 4" C1018 COLD FINISHED FLAT
B85

Extended Description:
Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/4 T   4"
Org- 0173

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
49 Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/4 T   5"

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA 237.000000 237.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 1/4" X 5" C1018 COLD FINISHED FLAT
B73

Extended Description:
Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/4 T   5"
Org- 0173

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
50 Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/4 T   6"

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA 265.000000 265.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 1/4" X 6" C1018 COLD FINISHED FLAT
B-88

Extended Description:
Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/4 T   6"
Org- 0173

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
51 Plate 1 Each 2" T x 16" x 48"

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA 2147.000000 2147.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    
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Commodity Line Comments: 2" A-36 HR STEEL PLATE
J

Extended Description:
Plate 1 Each 2" T x 16" x 48"
Org- 0173

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
52 Cod Rolled Pin 1" X 10'

Org-0170
2.00000 EA 99.000000 198.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 1" C1018 COLD FINISHED ROUND
B28

Extended Description:
Cod Rolled Pin 1" X 10'
Org-0170

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
53 Cod Rolled Pin 1 1/4" X 10'

Org-0170
2.00000 EA 202.000000 404.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 1-1/4" C1018 COLD FINISHED ROUND
B29

Extended Description:
Cod Rolled Pin 1 1/4" X 10'
Org-0170

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
54 Cod Rolled Pin 1 1/2"  X 10'

Org-0170
4.00000 EA 259.000000 1036.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 1-1/2" C1018 COLD FINISHED ROUND
12'-B30/20'-D37

Extended Description:
Cod Rolled Pin 1 1/2"  X 10'
Org-0170

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
55 Steel Angle 1/4" X 2" X 2" X 10'

Org-0170
4.00000 EA 98.000000 392.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 2" X 2" X 1/4" A-36 STEEL ANGLE
G6 / 3-14 / MDX-C

Extended Description:
Steel Angle 1/4" X 2" X 2" X 10'
Org-0170
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
56 Steel Angle 1/4" X 2 1/2" X 2 1/2" X 10'

Org-0170
4.00000 EA 99.000000 396.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 2-1/2" X 2-1/2" X 1/4" A-36 STEEL ANGLE
G2/3-16

Extended Description:
Steel Angle 1/4" X 2 1/2" X 2 1/2" X 10'
Org-0170

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
57 Steel Angle 1/4" X  3" X  3" X 10'

Org-0170
4.00000 EA 182.000000 728.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 3" X 3" X 1/4" A-36 STEEL ANGLE
G3/4-15

Extended Description:
Steel Angle 1/4" X  3" X  3" X 10'
Org-0170

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
58 Steel Channel 1/4" X  3" X 10'

Org-0170
4.00000 EA 195.000000 780.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 3" X 5.0# A-36 STRUCTURAL STEEL CHANNEL
3" X 1.498" X .258" WEB (HEAVY WEIGHT)
M1 / 4-12

Extended Description:
Steel Channel 1/4" X  3" X 10'
Org-0170

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
59 Steel Channel 1/4" X  4" X 10'

Org-0170
4.00000 EA 254.000000 1016.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 4" X 6.25# A36 STRUCTURAL STEEL CHANNEL
4" X .247" WEB X 1.647" FLANGE
H-6/27

Extended Description:
Steel Channel 1/4" X  4" X 10'
Org-0170
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
60 Steel Box Tubing 1/4" X  2" X 2" X 12'

Org-0170
4.00000 EA 262.000000 1048.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 2" X 2" X 1/4" A500 SQUARE STEEL TUBE
F54/22-

Extended Description:
Steel Box Tubing 1/4" X  2" X 2" X 12'
Org-0170

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
61 Steel Box Tubing 1/4" X  3" X 3" X 12'

Org-0170
4.00000 EA 351.000000 1404.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 3" X 3" X 1/4" A500 B SQUARE STEEL TUBE
I6/28,29

Extended Description:
Steel Box Tubing 1/4" X  3" X 3" X 12'
Org-0170

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
62 Steel Box Tubing 1/4" X 4" X 4" X 12'

Org-0170
4.00000 EA 429.000000 1716.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 4" X 4" X 1/4" A500 SQUARE STEEL TUBE
I5 / 29

Extended Description:
Steel Box Tubing 1/4" X 4" X 4" X 12'
Org-0170

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
63 Steel Flat Bar 1/4" X  2"  X 10'

Org-0170
4.00000 EA 60.000000 240.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 1/4" X 2" HR A-36 STEEL FLAT
C-36/ 2 -31

Extended Description:
Steel Flat Bar 1/4" X  2"  X 10'
Org-0170

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
64 Steel Flat Bar 1/4" X  4"  X 10'

Org-0170
4.00000 EA 81.000000 324.00
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Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 1/4" X 4" HR A-36 STEEL FLAT
C40/ 2-35

Extended Description:
Steel Flat Bar 1/4" X  4"  X 10'
Org-0170

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
65 Steel Flat Bar 1/2" X  4"  X 10'

Org-0170
4.00000 EA 214.000000 856.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Commodity Line Comments: 1/2" X 4" HR A-36 STEEL FLAT
C58 / 1-20

Extended Description:
Steel Flat Bar 1/2" X  4"  X 10'
Org-0170



Date Printed: Jan 30, 2026 Page:1 FORM ID: WV-PRC-ARFQ-002 2020/05

State of West Virginia
Agency Request for Quote

Highways

Proc Folder: 1886497 Reason for Modification:
Doc Description: Steel Inventory - Org. 0122, 0124, 0123, 0173, and 0170  

Proc Type: Agency Purchase Order

Date Issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation No Version

2026-01-30 2026-02-10     10:30 ARFQ     0803     DOT2600000053 1

BID RECEIVING LOCATION

PROCUREMENT DIVISION
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

BLDG 6 RM 340A

1900 KANAWHA BLVD E

CHARLESTON          WV     25305

US

VENDOR

Vendor Customer Code:

Vendor Name :

Address :

Street :

City :

State : Country : Zip :

Principal Contact :

Vendor Contact Phone: Extension:

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Kristine E James
304-558-0408
kristy.e.james@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X                                                                     FEIN#                                                       DATE
All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Swipe Resources LLC

7491 Flag Point Ct.

Manassas

VA USA 20109

Hamza Masud

(703) 870-6182

85-1143501 2/10/2026
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ADDITIONAL INFORMATION

THE WEST VIRGINIA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION -  PROCUREMENT DIVISION - SOLICITATION OF A ONE TIME 
PURCHASE CONTRACT OF STEEL FOR INVENTORY AT VARIOUS ORGS FOR DISTRICT 1PER THE ATTACHED 

DOCUMENTS.

QUESTIONS REGARDING THE SOLICITATION MUST BE SUBMITTED IN WRITING TO  
DOTPROCUREMENTTECHQUES@WV.GOV PRIOR TO THE QUESTION PERIOD DEADLINE CONTAINED IN THE 

INSTRUCTIONS TO VENDORS SUBMITTING BIDS.

*********NOTICE*********

WE DO NOT ACCEPT EMAIL BIDS 

MUST USE ONE OF THE FOLLOWING TO SUBMIT A BID:

  * UPLOAD TO OASIS 
  * HAND DELIVERY

  * MAIL IN HARD COPY
  * FAX TO 304-558-0047

MAKE SURE YOU DOWNLOAD ALL INFORMATION - THE COMPLETE SOLICITATION - PRICING PAGES - SIGN THE PAGES 
THAT NEED SIGNED

PLEASE NOTE THAT TO BE AWARDED THIS CONTRACT YOU WILL NEED TO BE REGISTERED WITH WV STATE 
PURCHASING DIVISION, AND COMPLIANT WITH SEVERAL AGENCIES SUCH AS THE WVSOS, TAX DEPARTMENT, 

WORKER'S COMPENSATION, AND UNEMPLOYMENT INSURANCE.

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
1 ANGLE BAR 1" X 1"  X 3/16" X 20'

Org- 0122
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
ANGLE BAR 1" X 1"  X 3/16" X 20'
Org- 0122
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
2 ANGLE BAR 2" X 2"  X 5/16" X 20'

Org- 0122
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
ANGLE BAR 2" X 2"  X 5/16" X 20'
Org- 0122

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
3 ANGLE STR 3" X 3"  X 3/8" X 20'

Org- 0122
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
ANGLE STR 3" X 3"  X 3/8" X 20'
Org- 0122
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
4 BAR CF ROUND C1045 1/2" X 20'

Org- 0122
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
BAR CF ROUND C1045 1/2" X 20'
Org- 0122

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
5 BAR CF ROUND C1045 5/8" X 20'

Org- 0122
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
BAR CF ROUND C1045 5/8" X 20'
Org- 0122
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
6 BAR CF ROUND C1045  3/4" X 20'

Org- 0122
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
BAR CF ROUND C1045  3/4" X 20'
Org- 0122

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
7 BAR CF ROUND C1045  7/8" X 20'

Org- 0122
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
BAR CF ROUND C1045  7/8" X 20'
Org- 0122
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
8 STRIP HR  3/16" X 2"  X  20'

Org- 0122
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
STRIP HR  3/16" X 2"  X  20'
Org- 0122

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
9 BAR HR Flat  5/16" x 2" x  20'

Org- 0122
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
BAR HR Flat  5/16" x 2" x  20'
Org- 0122
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
10 STRIP HR 3/16" X 1"  X  20'

Org- 0122
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
STRIP HR 3/16" X 1"  X  20'
Org- 0122

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
11 2" x 2" x 1/8" x 24 '

Org- 0124
5.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
2" x 2" x 1/8" x 24 '
Org- 0124
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
12 3/16" x 48" x 120" ( cut 30" x 120")

Org- 0124
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
3/16" x 48" x 120" ( cut 30" x 120")
Org- 0124

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
13 4'x8'  1/4" thick sheets

Org-0123
2.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
4'x8'  1/4" thick sheets
Org-0123
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
14 4' x 8' 18 gauge Sheet

Org-0123
2.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
4' x 8' 18 gauge Sheet
Org-0123

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
15 Hot Roll Round Bar, Full Stick,  1/4"

Org-0173
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Hot Roll Round Bar, Full Stick,  1/4"
Org-0173
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
16 Hot Roll Round Bar, Full Stick,  3/8" 

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Hot Roll Round Bar, Full Stick,  3/8" 
Org- 0173

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
17 Hot Roll Round Bar, Full Stick,  1/2"

Org-0173
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Hot Roll Round Bar, Full Stick,  1/2"
Org-0173
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
18 Hot Roll Round Bar, Full Stick,  5/8"

Org-0173
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Hot Roll Round Bar, Full Stick,  5/8"
Org-0173

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
19 Hot Roll Round Bar, Full Stick,   3/4"

Org-0173
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Hot Roll Round Bar, Full Stick,   3/4"
Org-0173
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
20 Hot Roll Round Bar, Full Stick,   7/8"

Org-0173
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Hot Roll Round Bar, Full Stick,   7/8"
Org-0173

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
21 Hot Roll Round Bar, Full Stick,  1"

Org-0173
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Hot Roll Round Bar, Full Stick,  1"
Org-0173
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
22 Hot Roll Round Bar, Full Stick,  1 1/8"

Org-0173
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Hot Roll Round Bar, Full Stick,  1 1/8"
Org-0173

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
23 Hot Roll Round Bar, Full Stick,   1 1/14"

Org-0173
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Hot Roll Round Bar, Full Stick,   1 1/14"
Org-0173
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
24 Hot Roll Round Bar, Full Stick,  1 1/2"

Org-0173
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Hot Roll Round Bar, Full Stick,  1 1/2"
Org-0173

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
25 Angle, Full Joint, 1/4" T   2" x 2"

Org.-0173
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Angle, Full Joint, 1/4" T   2" x 2"
Org.-0173
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
26 Angle, Full Joint, 1/4" T    3" x 3"

Org.-0173
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Angle, Full Joint, 1/4" T    3" x 3"
Org.-0173

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
27 Angle, Full Joint, 1/4" T   4" x 4"

Org.-0173
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Angle, Full Joint, 1/4" T   4" x 4"
Org.-0173
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
28 Angle, Full Joint, 1/2" T   3" x 3"

Org.-0173
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Angle, Full Joint, 1/2" T   3" x 3"
Org.-0173

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
29 Angle, Full Joint, 1/2" T    4" x 4"

Org.-0173
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Angle, Full Joint, 1/2" T    4" x 4"
Org.-0173
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
30 Sq Tube, Full Joint,  1/8" T   1"x1" 

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Sq Tube, Full Joint,  1/8" T   1"x1" 
Org- 0173

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
31 Sq Tube, Full Joint,  1/8" T   2"x2"

Org-0173
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Sq Tube, Full Joint,  1/8" T   2"x2"
Org-0173
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
32 Sq Tube, Full Joint,  1/4"  2"x2"

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Sq Tube, Full Joint,  1/4"  2"x2"
Org- 0173

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
33 Plate 4' x 10' Sheets  1/8 T

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Plate 4' x 10' Sheets  1/8 T
Org- 0173
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
34 Plate 4' x 10' Sheets   3/16  T

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Plate 4' x 10' Sheets   3/16  T
Org- 0173

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
35 Plate 4' x 10' Sheets   1/4  T

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Plate 4' x 10' Sheets   1/4  T
Org- 0173
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
36 Plate 4' x 10' Sheets   3/8  T

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Plate 4' x 10' Sheets   3/8  T
Org- 0173

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
37 Plate 4' x 10' Sheets   1/2  T

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Plate 4' x 10' Sheets   1/2  T
Org- 0173
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
38 Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/8 T   1"

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/8 T   1"
Org- 0173

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
39 Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/8 T    2"

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/8 T    2"
Org- 0173
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
40 Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/8 T   3"

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/8 T   3"
Org- 0173

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
41 Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/8 T   4"

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/8 T   4"
Org- 0173
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
42 Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/8 T   6"

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/8 T   6"
Org- 0173

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
43 Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/4 T   1"

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/4 T   1"
Org- 0173
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
44 Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/4 T   1 1/2"

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/4 T   1 1/2"
Org- 0173

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
45 Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/4 T   2"

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/4 T   2"
Org- 0173
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
46 Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/4 T   2 1/2"

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/4 T   2 1/2"
Org- 0173

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
47 Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/4 T   3"

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/4 T   3"
Org- 0173
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
48 Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/4 T   4"

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/4 T   4"
Org- 0173

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
49 Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/4 T   5"

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/4 T   5"
Org- 0173



Date Printed: Jan 30, 2026 Page:27 FORM ID: WV-PRC-ARFQ-002 2020/05

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
50 Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/4 T   6"

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Flat Bar, Full Stick, 1/4 T   6"
Org- 0173

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
51 Plate 1 Each 2" T x 16" x 48"

Org- 0173
1.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Plate 1 Each 2" T x 16" x 48"
Org- 0173
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
52 Cod Rolled Pin 1" X 10'

Org-0170
2.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Cod Rolled Pin 1" X 10'
Org-0170

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
53 Cod Rolled Pin 1 1/4" X 10'

Org-0170
2.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Cod Rolled Pin 1 1/4" X 10'
Org-0170
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
54 Cod Rolled Pin 1 1/2"  X 10'

Org-0170
4.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Cod Rolled Pin 1 1/2"  X 10'
Org-0170

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
55 Steel Angle 1/4" X 2" X 2" X 10'

Org-0170
4.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Steel Angle 1/4" X 2" X 2" X 10'
Org-0170
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
56 Steel Angle 1/4" X 2 1/2" X 2 1/2" X 10'

Org-0170
4.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Steel Angle 1/4" X 2 1/2" X 2 1/2" X 10'
Org-0170

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
57 Steel Angle 1/4" X  3" X  3" X 10'

Org-0170
4.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Steel Angle 1/4" X  3" X  3" X 10'
Org-0170
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
58 Steel Channel 1/4" X  3" X 10'

Org-0170
4.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Steel Channel 1/4" X  3" X 10'
Org-0170

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
59 Steel Channel 1/4" X  4" X 10'

Org-0170
4.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Steel Channel 1/4" X  4" X 10'
Org-0170
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
60 Steel Box Tubing 1/4" X  2" X 2" X 12'

Org-0170
4.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Steel Box Tubing 1/4" X  2" X 2" X 12'
Org-0170

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
61 Steel Box Tubing 1/4" X  3" X 3" X 12'

Org-0170
4.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Steel Box Tubing 1/4" X  3" X 3" X 12'
Org-0170



Date Printed: Jan 30, 2026 Page:33 FORM ID: WV-PRC-ARFQ-002 2020/05

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
62 Steel Box Tubing 1/4" X 4" X 4" X 12'

Org-0170
4.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Steel Box Tubing 1/4" X 4" X 4" X 12'
Org-0170

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
63 Steel Flat Bar 1/4" X  2"  X 10'

Org-0170
4.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Steel Flat Bar 1/4" X  2"  X 10'
Org-0170
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
64 Steel Flat Bar 1/4" X  4"  X 10'

Org-0170
4.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Steel Flat Bar 1/4" X  4"  X 10'
Org-0170

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

DISTRICT ONE HQ DISTRICT ONE HQ

1340 SMITH ST 1340 SMITH ST

CHARLESTON WV CHARLESTON WV

US US

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
65 Steel Flat Bar 1/2" X  4"  X 10'

Org-0170
4.00000 EA

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11101704    

Extended Description:
Steel Flat Bar 1/2" X  4"  X 10'
Org-0170

SCHEDULE OF EVENTS
Line Event Event Date
1 TECH QUES DUE AT 10AM ET 2026-02-05
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