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Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder: 1864060

Solicitation Description: Addendum 01: Ready Mixed Portland Cement Concrete and CLSM

Proc Type: Agency Master Agreement

Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version

2026-02-19 10:30 SR 0803 ESR02182600000004904 1

VENDOR

VS0000042215
AB&L CONCRETE & SUPPLY INC

Solicitation Number: ARFQ 0803 DOT2600000058

Total Bid: 0 Response Date: 2026-02-18 Response Time: 10:20:25

Comments:  

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Jeromie F Lanham
304-720-7383
jeromie.f.lanham@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X                                                                     FEIN#                                                       DATE
All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Class A Concrete 2-2.99 0.00000 CY   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111505    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2 Class A Concrete 3-3.99 0.00000 CY   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111505    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
3 Class A Concrete 4-4.99 0.00000 CY   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111505    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
4 Class A Concrete 5 or more 0.00000 CY   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111505    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
5 Class B Concrete 2-2.99 0.00000 CY 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111505    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
6 Class B Concrete 3-3.99 0.00000 CY 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111505    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
7 Class B Concrete 4-4.99 0.00000 CY 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111505    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
8 Class B Concrete 5 or more 0.00000 CY 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111505    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
9 Class C Concrete 2-2.99 0.00000 CY   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111505    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
10 Class C Concrete 3-3.99 0.00000 CY   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111505    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST



Date Printed: Feb 19, 2026 Page: 4 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
11 Class C Concrete 4-4.99 0.00000 CY   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111505    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
12 Class C Concrete 5 or more 0.00000 CY   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111505    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
13 Class D Concrete 2-2.99 0.00000 CY   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111505    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
14 Class D Concrete 3-3.99 0.00000 CY   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111505    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
15 Class D Concrete 4-4.99 0.00000 CY   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111505    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
16 Class D Concrete 5 or more 0.00000 CY   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111505    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
17 Class DC Concrete 2-2.99 0.00000 CY 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111505    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
18 Class DC Concrete 3-3.99 0.00000 CY 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111505    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
19 Class DC Concrete 4-4.99 0.00000 CY 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111505    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
20 Class DC Concrete 5 or more 0.00000 CY 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111505    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
21 Class H Concrete 2-2.99 0.00000 CY 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111505    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
22 Class H Concrete 3-3.99 0.00000 CY 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111505    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
23 Class H Concrete 4-4.99 0.00000 CY 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111505    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
24 Class H Concrete 5 or more 0.00000 CY 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111505    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
25 Class K Concrete 2-2.99 0.00000 CY 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111505    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
26 Class K Concrete 3-3.99 0.00000 CY 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111505    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
27 Class K Concrete 4-4.99 0.00000 CY 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111505    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
28 Class K Concrete 5 or more 0.00000 CY 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111505    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
29 Mod Class K Concrete 2-2.99 0.00000 CY   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111505    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
30 Mod Class K Concrete 3-3.99 0.00000 CY   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111505    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
31 Mod Class K Concrete 4-4.99 0.00000 CY   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111505    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
32 Mod Class K Concrete 5 or more 0.00000 CY   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111505    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
33 CLSM Type A 2-2.99 0.00000 CY   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
34 CLSM Type A 3-3.99 0.00000 CY   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
35 CLSM Type A 4-4.99 0.00000 CY   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
36 CLSM Type A 5 or more 0.00000 CY   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
37 CLSM Type B 2-2.99 0.00000 CY 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
38 CLSM Type B 3-3.99 0.00000 CY 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
39 CLSM Type B 4-4.99 0.00000 CY 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
40 CLSM Type B 5 or more 0.00000 CY 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
41 CLSM Type B WVDOH Custom Mix 2-2.99 0.00000 CY   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
42 CLSM Type B WVDOH Custom Mix 3-3.99 0.00000 CY   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
43 CLSM Type B WVDOH Custom Mix 4-4.99 0.00000 CY   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
44 CLSM Type B WVDOH Custom Mix 5 or more 0.00000 CY   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
45 CLSM Type C 2-2.99 0.00000 CY 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
46 CLSM Type C 3-3.99 0.00000 CY 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
47 CLSM Type C 4-4.99 0.00000 CY 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
48 CLSM Type C 5 or more 0.00000 CY 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
49 Additional Haul per Loaded Truck over 5 miles 0.00000 MILE 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
78121601    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
50 Penalty Charge per truck Truck each minute 0.00000 TRKM 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
78121601    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
51 Class B Using Silica Sand 0.00000 CY   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111701    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
52 Increased Cement in LBS of a CY Mix Design 0.00000 LB 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111601    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
53 Water Reducing Set Retarder 0.00000 OZ 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
12162303    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
54 Water Reducer 0.00000 OZ 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
12164801    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
55 Accelerating Admixtures 0.00000 OZ 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
12164801    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
56 Type G Water Reducing High Range and 

Retarding Admixtures
0.00000 OZ   

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
12162303    

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
57 Type F Water Reducing High Range 

Admixtures
0.00000 OZ 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
12162303    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
58 Fiber per LB in a CY Mix Design 0.00000 LB 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
12162305    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
59 Heated Concrete 0.00000 CY 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
60 Ice 0.00000 LB 0.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
12162305    

Commodity Line Comments: SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST































































































































Ready Mixed Portland Cement Concrete and CLSM
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE  (ATT A)

Boone Cabell Calhoun Doddridge Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendleton Fayette McDowell
Clay Lincoln Jackson Harrison Grant Hancock Braxton Pocahontas Greenbrier Mercer
Kanawha Logan Pleasants Marion Hampshire X Marshall Gilmer Randolph Monroe Raleigh
Mason Mingo Ritchie Monongalia Hardy  Ohio Lewis Tucker Nicholas Wyoming
Putnam Wayne Roane Preston Jefferson Tyler Upshur Summers

Wirt Taylor Mineral Wetzel Webster
Wood Morgan

       ** Contract Items 53-57 are components of a CY mix design added as oz. per 100# of cementitious material.

Contract 
Item #

1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29
30
31
32
33
34
35
36
37
38
39
40
41
42
43
44
45
46
47
48
49
50
51
52
53
54
55 Accelerating Admixtures **

56

57
58
59
60

2-2.99
3-3.99
4-4.99

District 9

3-3.99

Class D Concrete*

Class C Concrete*

CY

5 or more

AB&L CONCRETE & SUPPLY, INC.

CLSM Type B* - WVDOH Custom Pipe Slurry Mix

District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7 District 8

Class A Concrete*

Class B Concrete*

3-3.99CLSM Type B*

Class DC Concrete*

CY

CY

CY

CY

CY

5 or more

District 10

4-4.99
3-3.99

5 or more
2-2.99
3-3.99
4-4.99

5 or more

CY

CY

2-2.99

CLSM Type A*

Mod Class K Concrete*

Class K Concrete*

Class H Concrete*

5 or more

$460.00

4-4.99
3-3.99

2-2.99

Size of 
Project

2-2.99
3-3.99
4-4.99

5 or more
2-2.99
3-3.99
4-4.99

5 or more
2-2.99
3-3.99
4-4.99

4-4.99
5 or more

2-2.99
3-3.99
4-4.99

3-3.99
4-4.99

Vendor Instructions:  Vendor shall mark with an "X" beside the counties that correspond with the Source Plant(s) bid prices on 
this page.  If Vendor has varied pricing per county or per plant, Vendor shall complete a separate set of Pricing Pages (ATT A) for 
each county pricing set or each plant's pricing.  

This is a multiple vendor award contract. All qualifying vendors meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a contract. 
The low bid vendor per project will be determined at the time of need, as per Section 4 of the contract specifications. Estimated 
quantities are not available.

List Price

5 or more $240.00
2-2.99

$440.00
$370.00
$300.00

Unit of 
Measure

* Contract Items 1-48 Includes materials plus delivery within 5 miles of Supplier Plant Location

CY

$525.00

5 or more
2-2.99

District 1 District 2

------ $10.00CYHeated Concrete
------ $10.25

OZ
LB

Type F Water Reducing, High Range Adxmixtures **
Fiber, per pound in a CY mix design

------ $0.24

Class B using Silica Sand 
Increased cement in pounds of a CY Mix Design
Water-reducing set retarder **

5 or more $195.00
------ $17.00MileAdditional Haul per Loaded Truck over 5 miles

------
------ $0.24
------ $0.25

CY
LB
OZ

CLSM Type C*

$405.00

------ $3.25MinutePenalty Charge per truck, each minute

------ $0.17
------ $0.20

------OZ

Water reducer **

Type G Water Reducing, High Range and Retarding 
Admixtures **

OZ
OZ

CY

4-4.99
5 or more

57033 FERRY LANDING ROAD
SHADYSIDE, OH 43947

$380.00

$395.00
$320.00

Contract Item Description

$415.00
$350.00
$285.00
$210.00

Source Plant Name & Location(s): 

Vendor Name:

Ice LB ------ $2.50

$450.00
$380.00
$320.00
$240.00

$335.00
4-4.99 $260.00

2-2.99
3-3.99

CY

CY

$310.00
$245.00
$165.00

2-2.99

ATT A -Pricing Pages Page 1 of 1 AMA 6626C018



Ready Mixed Portland Cement Concrete and CLSM
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE  (ATT A)

Boone Cabell Calhoun Doddridge Berkeley Brooke Barbour Pendleton Fayette McDowell
Clay Lincoln Jackson Harrison Grant Hancock Braxton Pocahontas Greenbrier Mercer
Kanawha Logan Pleasants Marion Hampshire Marshall Gilmer Randolph Monroe Raleigh
Mason Mingo Ritchie Monongalia Hardy X Ohio Lewis Tucker Nicholas Wyoming
Putnam Wayne Roane Preston Jefferson Tyler Upshur Summers

Wirt Taylor Mineral Wetzel Webster
Wood Morgan

       ** Contract Items 53-57 are components of a CY mix design added as oz. per 100# of cementitious material.

Contract 
Item #

1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29
30
31
32
33
34
35
36
37
38
39
40
41
42
43
44
45
46
47
48
49
50
51
52
53
54
55 Accelerating Admixtures **

56

57
58
59
60

Source Plant Name & Location(s): 

Vendor Name:

Ice LB ------ $2.50

$470.00
$405.00
$345.00
$260.00

$350.00
4-4.99 $290.00

2-2.99
3-3.99

CY

CY

$325.00
$265.00
$185.00

2-2.99

CY

4-4.99
5 or more

57033 FERRY LANDING ROAD
SHADYSIDE, OH 43947

$395.00

$410.00
$330.00

Contract Item Description

$435.00
$375.00
$310.00
$230.00

------ $0.17
------ $0.20

------OZ

Water reducer **

Type G Water Reducing, High Range and Retarding 
Admixtures **

OZ
OZ

Class B using Silica Sand 
Increased cement in pounds of a CY Mix Design
Water-reducing set retarder **

5 or more $220.00
------ $17.00MileAdditional Haul per Loaded Truck over 5 miles

------
------ $0.24
------ $0.25

CY
LB
OZ

CLSM Type C*

$415.00

------ $3.25MinutePenalty Charge per truck, each minute

------ $10.00CYHeated Concrete
------ $10.25

OZ
LB

Type F Water Reducing, High Range Adxmixtures **
Fiber, per pound in a CY mix design

------ $0.24

Vendor Instructions:  Vendor shall mark with an "X" beside the counties that correspond with the Source Plant(s) bid prices on 
this page.  If Vendor has varied pricing per county or per plant, Vendor shall complete a separate set of Pricing Pages (ATT A) for 
each county pricing set or each plant's pricing.  

This is a multiple vendor award contract. All qualifying vendors meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a contract. 
The low bid vendor per project will be determined at the time of need, as per Section 4 of the contract specifications. Estimated 
quantities are not available.

List Price

5 or more $260.00
2-2.99

$465.00
$395.00
$320.00

Unit of 
Measure

* Contract Items 1-48 Includes materials plus delivery within 5 miles of Supplier Plant Location

CY

$540.00

5 or more
2-2.99

District 1 District 2

Size of 
Project

2-2.99
3-3.99
4-4.99

5 or more
2-2.99
3-3.99
4-4.99

5 or more
2-2.99
3-3.99
4-4.99

4-4.99
5 or more

2-2.99
3-3.99
4-4.99

3-3.99
4-4.99

5 or more

$475.00

4-4.99
3-3.99

2-2.99

CY

CY

2-2.99

CLSM Type A*

Mod Class K Concrete*

Class K Concrete*

Class H Concrete*

District 10

4-4.99
3-3.99

5 or more
2-2.99
3-3.99
4-4.99

5 or more

Class D Concrete*

Class C Concrete*

CY

5 or more

AB&L CONCRETE & SUPPLY, INC.

CLSM Type B* - WVDOH Custom Pipe Slurry Mix

District 3 District 4 District 5 District 6 District 7 District 8

Class A Concrete*

Class B Concrete*

3-3.99CLSM Type B*

Class DC Concrete*

CY

CY

CY

CY

CY

5 or more

2-2.99
3-3.99
4-4.99

District 9

3-3.99
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Ready Mixed Portland Cement Concrete and CLSM
Source Plant Information - Attachment B (ATT B)

Vendor Name:

Plant Name Plant Location 
(911 Physical Address) Plant Approval Status (mark one) MCS&T Approval

 (Facility) Code

1

AB&L CONCRETE 
& SUPPLY, INC.

57033 FERRY LANDING 
ROAD, SHADYSIDE, OH 

43947 
ABL 1.01.601

2

HEIDELBERG 
MATEIALS UNION BRIDGE, MD LPC2.01.701

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

AB&L CONCRETE & SUPPLY, INC.

Vendor Instructions: ATT B must be submitted prior to award and shall correspond with the source 
plants listed on the Pricing Pages, ATT A.  ATT B must be completed in its entirety. Failure to 
submit ATT B prior to award will result in the disqualification of the entire bid.

Not Approved/Pending

Approved- Provide Facility Code 

Not Approved/Pending

Approved- Provide Facility Code

Not Approved/Pending

Approved- Provide Facility Code 

Not Approved/Pending

Approved- Provide Facility Code

Not Approved/Pending

Approved- Provide Facility Code

Not Approved/Pending

Approved- Provide Facility Code 

Not Approved/Pending

Approved- Provide Facility Code 

Not Approved/Pending

Approved- Provide Facility Code 

Not Approved/Pending

Approved- Provide Facility Code 

Not Approved/Pending

Approved- Provide Facility Code 

ATT B - Source Plant Information 1 AMA 6626C018
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