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VENDOR
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Solicitation Number: ARFQ 0803 DOT2600000058

Total Bid: 0

Comments:

Response Date:

2026-02-18 Response Time: 17:02:15

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Jeromie F Lanham

304-720-7383

jeromie.f.lanham@wv.gov

Vendor
Signature X

FEIN#

DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Date Printed:  Feb 19, 2026
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 Class A Concrete 2-2.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2 Class A Concrete 3-3.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
3 Class A Concrete 4-4.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
4 Class A Concrete 5 or more 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
5 Class B Concrete 2-2.99 0.00000 CY 455.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Feb 19, 2026 Page: 2 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




30111505

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

6 Class B Concrete 3-3.99 0.00000 CY 380.000000

0.00

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification

Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

7 Class B Concrete 4-4.99 0.00000 CY 305.000000

0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification

Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
8 Class B Concrete 5 or more 0.00000 CY 230.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

9 Class C Concrete 2-2.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code
30111505

Manufacturer Specification

Model #

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

10 Class C Concrete 3-3.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification

Model #

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Feb 19, 2026

Page: 3
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

11 Class C Concrete 4-4.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification

Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

12 Class C Concrete 5 or more 0.00000 CY

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification

Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
13 Class D Concrete 2-2.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

14 Class D Concrete 3-3.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code
30111505

Manufacturer Specification

Model #

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

15 Class D Concrete 4-4.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification
30111505

Model #

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Feb 19, 2026 Page: 4
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
16 Class D Concrete 5 or more 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
17 Class DC Concrete 2-2.99 0.00000 CY 470.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
18 Class DC Concrete 3-3.99 0.00000 CY 395.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
19 Class DC Concrete 4-4.99 0.00000 CY 320.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
20 Class DC Concrete 5 or more 0.00000 CY 245.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Feb 19, 2026 Page: 5 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
21 Class H Concrete 2-2.99 0.00000 CY 575.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price
22 Class H Concrete 3-3.99

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

0.00000 CY 500.000000

0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification
30111505

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
23 Class H Concrete 4-4.99 0.00000 CY 425.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
24 Class H Concrete 5 or more 0.00000 CY 350.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

25 Class K Concrete 2-2.99 0.00000 CY 460.000000

Ln Total Or Contract Amount
0.00

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification
30111505

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Feb 19, 2026 Page: 6
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
26 Class K Concrete 3-3.99 0.00000 CY 385.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

27 Class K Concrete 4-4.99

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

0.00000 CY 310.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification
30111505

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
28 Class K Concrete 5 or more 0.00000 CY 235.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
29 Mod Class K Concrete 2-2.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

30 Mod Class K Concrete 3-3.99 0.00000 CY

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification
30111505

Model #

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Feb 19, 2026 Page: 7
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Comm Code
30111500

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
31 Mod Class K Concrete 4-4.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111505

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount
32 Mod Class K Concrete 5 or more

0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification

Model #
30111505

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
33 CLSM Type A 2-2.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
34 CLSM Type A 3-3.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc
35 CLSM Type A 4-4.99

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price
0.00000 CY

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

Manufacturer Specification Model #

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Feb 19, 2026

Page: 8 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
36 CLSM Type A 5 or more 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount
37 CLSM Type B 2-2.99

0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification

Model #
30111500

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
38 CLSM Type B 3-3.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
39 CLSM Type B 4-4.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
40 CLSM Type B 5 or more 0.00000 cCY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Feb 19, 2026

Page: 9 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
41 CLSM Type B WVDOH Custom Mix 2-2.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
42 CLSM Type B WVDOH Custom Mix 3-3.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
43 CLSM Type B WVDOH Custom Mix 4-4.99 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
44 CLSM Type B WVDOH Custom Mix 5 or more 0.00000 CY
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111500

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc
45 CLSM Type C 2-2.99

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount
0.00000 CY 425.000000 0.00

Comm Code
30111500

Manufacturer Specification Model #

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Feb 19, 2026

Page: 10 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
46 CLSM Type C 3-3.99 0.00000 CY 350.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc

47 CLSM Type C 4-4.99

Qty Unit Issue Unit Price

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

0.00000 CY 275.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer

Specification
30111500

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
48 CLSM Type C 5 or more 0.00000 CY 200.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
49 Additional Haul per Loaded Truck over 5 miles 0.00000 MILE 15.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

78121601
Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
50 Penalty Charge per truck Truck each minute  0.00000 TRKM 1.500000 0.00

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification
78121601

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Feb 19, 2026 Page: 11
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
51 Class B Using Silica Sand 0.00000 CY

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111701

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
52 Increased Cement in LBS of a CY Mix Design 0.00000 LB 20.000000 0.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
30111601
Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:
SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
53 Water Reducing Set Retarder 0.00000 Oz 0.750000 0.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
12162303

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
54 Water Reducer 0.00000 0Oz 0.750000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

12164801

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
55 Accelerating Admixtures 0.00000 Oz 0.500000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

12164801

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Feb 19, 2026 Page: 12 FORM ID: WV-PRC-SR-001 2020/05




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
56 Type G Water Reducing High Range and 0.00000 Oz 3.000000 0.00
Retarding Admixtures
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
12162303

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
57 Type F Water Reducing High Range 0.00000 Oz 3.000000 0.00
Admixtures
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
12162303

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
58 Fiber per LB in a CY Mix Design 0.00000 LB 8.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

12162305

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
59 Heated Concrete 0.00000 CY 9.000000 0.00

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

30111500

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price
60 Ice

Ln Total Or Contract Amount

0.00000 LB 0.850000

0.00

Comm Code

Manufacturer Specification
12162305

Model #

Commodity Line Comments:
Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Date Printed:  Feb 19, 2026 Page: 13
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State of West Virginia
Agency Request for Quote

Proc Folder: 1864060 Reason for Modification:
Doc Description: Ready Maed Portland Cement Concrete and CLSM

Proc Type: Agency Masior Agreormont

Date Issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation No Version

20260203 20260219 10X ARFQ (0803 DOT2800000058 1

PROCUREMENT DIVISION DIVISION OF
BLDG 6 RM 340A
1900 KANAYWHA BLVD E CHARLESTON

AL R i
o ety S - e e
e [ -

N e - e TR
el R e i -

HIGHWAYS

WY 25305

Country : United States Tip : 24844
Principal Contact : Joseph Salyers
Vendor Contact Phone: 304-938-3656 Extension:
FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Jeromee F Lanham
304-720-7383
jeromie | mrham@wy gov
Vendor
X FEING 20-824-0984 DATE 2-18-26
ternés and conditions contained In this solicitation
Dote Primded:  Fon 3 2005 Page * BN Iy WA PR AREO B0 SO s



DESIGNATED CONTACT: Vendor appoints the individual identified in this Section as
the Contract Administrator and the initial point of contact for matters relating to this
Contract.

Joseph Sy lyers
(Printed f\'urﬁe and Title) - - o

262 Coal Heri ige Road —acgcr, WV ZHEH
(Address)

S0H- 93£-35 v 926 52773

(Phone Number) / (Fax Number)

1oworstores (8 hotmail. éoyn
(E-mail address)

CERTIFICATION AND SIGNATURE: By signing below, or submitting documentation
through wvOASIS, | certify that | have reviewed this Solicitation in its entirety; that [ undersiand
the requirements, rerms and conditions. and other information contained herein; that this bid,
offer or proposal constilutes an offer to the Stare that cannot be unilaterally withdrawn; that the
product or service proposed inects the mandatory requirements contained in the Solicitation for
that product or scrvice, unless otherwise stated herein: that the Vendor accepts the terms and
conditions contained in the Solicitation. unless otherwise stated herein: that | am submitting this
bid. offer or proposal for review and consideration: ; that this bid or offer was made without prior
understanding, agreemenr, or connection with any entity submitting a bid or ofTer for the same
material, supplies, equipment or services: that this bid or offer is in all respects fair and without
collusion or fraud: that this Contract is accepted or entered into without any prior understanding,
agregment, or connection o any other entity that could be considered a violation of law: that 1 aimn
authorized by the Vendor to execute and submit this bid. offer, or propesal. or any documenls
related thereto on Vendor's behalf; that 1 am authorized to bind the vendor in a contractual
relationship: and that to the best of my knowledge, the Vendor has properly registered with any
State agency that may require registration,

By signing below, [ further certitv thai | understand this Contract is subject to the

provisions of West Virginia Code § 34-3-62_ which automatically voids certain contiraot
clauses that vilate State law.

owar Ready Mix

(Company)
A
AL

. ; -
(51 gnﬂ'ﬂ:re of Au

7

7ed Representative)

o Stph Solyerc O wner
rinted Ndme

and Title of Authorized Representative)

~_kbnany |8, 202

i Date) 4

S0Y-938 35k B0y 38 2073

(Phone Number) (Fax Number)

(P

Revised ¥/24/2023



REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
Ready Mixed Portland Cement Concrete and CLSM

8.3 Vendor Name Change: It is the Vendor's responsibility to notify the WVDOH of
name changes or acquisition by another company during the term of the contract.
The WVDOH must be notified in writing of the change acquisition and intention
tor the contract’s ownership within 10 days of the change. Failure to do so may
result in payment delayvs,

8.4 Reports:  Vendor shall provide the Agency with quarterly reports, annual
summmarics, and/or monthly reports as requested by the A gency and'or the West
Virginia Purchasing Division showing quantities, total dollar value of the Contract
Items purchased, ordered, shipped & invoiced with dates in spreadsheet format as
defined by the Agency. Failure 1o supply such reports may be grounds for
cancellation of this Contract.

8.5 Contract Manager: During its performance of this Contract, Vendor miust
designate and maintain a primary contract manager responsible for overseeing
Vendor's responsibilities under this Contract.  The Contract Manager must he
available during normal business hours to address any customer service or other
Issucs related to this Contract. Vendor should list its Contract Manager and his or
her contact information below.

Contract Manager: J o k :
Telephone Number: SM-M2g- 36 :
Fax Number: A -43¢-2273

Email Address: REETYs storesd hotmail om

Vendor shall inform the Agency in writing of any changes to the information
provided above within 10 calendar days of such changes. Failure to comply may
be grounds for cancellation of this contract.

Form Rewvised 10/27/2014 14 AMA BB26C01E8



Ready Mixed Portland Cement Concrete and CLSM
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Vendor Instructions: Vendor shall mark with an "X" beside the counties that correspond with the Source Plant(s) bid prices on

this page. If Vendor has varied pricing per county or per plant, Vendor shall complete a separate set of Pricing Pages (ATT A) for
each county pricing set or each plant's pricing.

This is a multiple vendor award contract. All qualifying vendors meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with & contract.
The low bid vendor per project will be determined at the ime of need, as per Section 4 of the contract specifications. Estimated
guanfities are nat available.

Source Plan

Vendaor Name:

Jowar Ready Mix

t Name & Location(s):

Jowar Ready Mix

laeger, West Virginia

District 1 Distnct 2 District 3 District 4 Distrnct 5 District 8 District 7 Distnct 8 District 9 District 10
Boone | |Cabell | |Calhoun Deddridge : Berkelay Brooke | |Barbour Pendleton Fayatte
Clay [ |Lincoin | _|Jackson Harmison | |Grant Hancock | |Braxten Pocahontas Greenbrier
Kanawha . Logan | |Pleasants Marion Hampshire Marshall | |Gilmer Randolph Monroe
Mason Mingo | |Ritchie Monongalia : Hardy Oy [ Lewis Tucker Micholas
Putnam . Wayne | |Roans Preston | [Jefferson Tyler ] Upshur Surmmans
| [wirt Taylor Mineral Watzel | |webster
| |Woed | |Margan

* Confract lfams 1-48 Includes matenals plus aalivery wilhin 5 miles of Supplier Flant Location

™ Contract items 53-57 are components of a CY mix design added as oz. per 100# of cementitious material.

Contract - Unit of Size of B

o Contract ltem Description Measure Project List Price
y 2-2.99
E ) 3-3.99
3 Class A Concrete cY 4-4 99
A 5 or more
3 2-2.99 $455.00
5 ) 3-3.99 $380.00
z Class B Concrete CY A-4 99 $305.00
3 5or more | $230.00
g 2-2.99
10 3-3.99

Cl *

¥ ass C Concrete cY 4-4.99
12 5 or more
13 2-2.99
14 . 3-3.99
15 Claze D Coancraete oY 4-4 99
16 5 or more
e 2.2 09 5470.00
18 ) 3-3 09 $395.00
g Clazz DC Concrete cY 4-4 99 $320.00
>0 5 or more 3245.00

ATT A -Pricing Pages
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Ready Mixed Portland Cement Concrete and CLSM

ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

" Confract lfems 1-48 Includes materials plus delivery within 5 miles of Suppliar Flan! Localion

* Conltract llerns 53-57 are components of a CY mix design added as oz. per 100# of comantitious material

21 2-2.99 $575.00

22 | cjass H Concrete* Cy 3-3.99 $000.00

23 4-4 99 3425.00

24 5 ormore | $350.00

25 2-2.99 $460.00

3? Class K Concrete” CY jjgg :g?zgg

28 5ormore | $235.00

29 2-2.99

g? Mad Class K Concrate® cY jjgg

32 5 or more

33 2-2.99

:; CLSM Type A* CY Ejgg

36 5 or more

av 2-2.99

2: CLEM Type B* CY ijgg

40 5 or more

41 2-2.99

jg CLSM Type B* - WVDOH Custom Pipe Slurry Mix CY ijgg

44 5 or more

45 2-2.88 $425.00

46 . 3-3.89 $350.00

a7 |CHSMType C cY 4499 | $275.00

48 S Or more $200.00

49  |Additional Haul per Loaded Truck over 5 miles Mile —_— $15.00

50 |Penalty Charge per fruck, each minute Minute e $1.50

51  |Class B using Silica Sand cY |

52 |Increased cement in pounds of a CY Mix Design B | $20.00

53  |Water-reducing set retarder ** 0Z | - $0.75

54  |Water reducer ** oz | — 30.75

55  |Accelerating Admixtures ™ 0Z $0.50

56 T],rpg (5 Water Reducing, High Range and Retarding oz | $3.00
Admixtures **

57  |Type F Water Reducing, High Range Adxmixtures ** OZ —_— $3.00

58  [Fiber, per pound in a CY mix design LB — $8.00

5%  |Heated Concrete CY - $9.00

60 |lce LB —_— $0.85

ATT A -Pricing Pages
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Ready Mixed Portland Cement Concrete and CLSM
Source Plant Information - Attachment B (ATT B)

Vendor Name: \bkﬁiﬂr Rfﬂd*}jf W]‘I}'{

Vendor Instructions: ATT B must be submitted prior to award and shall correspond with the source
piants.hsted on the Pricing Pages, ATT A. ATT B must be completed in its entirety. Failure to
submit ATT B prior to award will result in the disqualification of the entire bid.

Plant Name Plant Location
. Plant Approval Status (mark one MCS&T Approval
(311 Physical Address) ( ) (Facility) Code
JU'H"JLLII" Rﬂild'kl,l' Mfﬂ Hﬂﬂ. Coal Hﬁrllﬁf‘ﬂf rEE.ier EI Approved- Provide Facility Code dﬁm ,l: Dt {ﬂﬂl
I' lllll — i i

| o ﬂﬂ Erl W 345'51“4’ U Mot Approved/Pending
. P Approved. Provide Fariliny Code

y [ 1 Mot Approved/Pending
'_' Approved- Provide Faolity Codse

9 : Mol Approved/Pending
_ Approved- Provide Facility Code

4 : Mot Approved/Pending
_ Approved- Provids Facility Code

5 : Mol Approved/Pending
i _{ Approved- Provide Faality Code

g : Mot Approved/Pending
F_ Approved- Provide Faciliny Code

2 i Mot Approved/Pending
_ Approved- Provide Facility Code

a — Mol Approved/Fending
| Approved- Provide Facility Code

q — Mot Approved/Pending
[} Approved- Provids Facility Code

10 [ Mot ApprovediPerding

ATT B - Source Plant Information
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CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

DA TE [eMDOY Y Y
B30

CERTWICATE DOES MOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND.
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

THES CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY ANMD CONFERS MO RIGHTS UPONM THE CERTWICATE HOLDER. THIS

EXTEMD OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES

BELOW. THES CERTWFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES MOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED

IMPORTANT: B the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAI INSURED, the poboy(ies) mist have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions of b endorssd,
M SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject 10 the terms bnd conditiond of th policy, CHTLn pOBCE Mly regquire sn endorsemint A sialement on

ﬁhmuﬂtﬂrhﬁmmhhd-ﬁﬂ_ﬂ.

EERTIET
Cyrifas Crirers
Haaring inaursnos Geoup, LLE o 3 Fis
P_O. Box 9953 D L
Glen Allen VA 23058 T e R o]
SERERS) AFFORDm COVERAGE MAK 8
Lumnaed 6368708 pmen 4 Worteld insurance Company 21987
e ED FORSEERY| sommen s Progressive Classe: nssance Company A7e0d
Joseph Sabyers dba Jowar Ready Mix
202 Coal Heritage Rd | e
Laager WV 2 | SRR D
MR E
g ¢
COVERAGES CERTIRCATE NUMBER:- 38125572 REVISIDN NUMEBER:

INDRCATED. WOTWITHSTANDNNG ANYT RECUMEMENT. TERM OR CONDITION

THES I3 TO CERTFY THAT THE POLICIES OF BSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN SSUED TO THE BSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIDD

OF AMY COMTRACT OFf OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS

CERTWICATE MAY BE cSSUED OF MAY PERTAMN, THE MMSLURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICES DESCRBED HEREWN 15 SUBIECT TO ALL THE TERMS

BEEM REDLACE D BY Pl CLANSS

EXCLLISIONS AND CONDITIONS OF S1CH POLICE S LIRETS SH0WN MAY HAVE
PR

TYPE OF SeSURANCE mac |l ratimames | dmateie | e —
L | X | commERCI SEMESA |EAEE ITY A - T . $ 1.000,000
| cams e [ occum R T o
WEET) EXF Lo o Sata’ 5 5 Ol
| rensonas & av sy | 11,000,000
L, AGHGIRE A TE LIMNT AFPLES PER CEMER & AGGRSGLTE §.2 000 500
F
X | Fauc o Du:u FROLCTE  COMSOR AGG | 8.3 000000
OTHES 5
E | sdrTrasreem F L GsE ITY 1 9 R PR ] B N Frvy—"1 DD DO
ANY & ITD OO T AT P et |
mn{,ﬂ_r K SO-EDL ELF B v mORY P acesdare |
Ty s [m i
ALITCH O v ALITOH OB ¥
5
LR ELLA LB OCous EAlH OOCURBEWCE i
ENEEs s CLANEE. RADE AGCRETATE ]
nml infrr:nm: — — i
PR R [N A TN
G L OYERE LIABRITY v _LM"‘I !E
umrmm--ummw - Ei EMDH ACCEIENT E
by F o CelfARF  E& P OrrEE] §
¥ o, i AN Lt T s —
B SCR) o — Ei MSEASE - POLCY LT | §

CE SCREFTION OF DPERATIONS | LOCATIONS  VERECLFE (& 00 W9 doialtiewenl Suvgu, Surbiohs Sy B SE-tuit | S ifserd b s

CERTIFICATE HOLDER

CAMNCELLATION

¥V Deiviseon of
1800 Kanawha

S0LR D ANY OF THE ABROYE DESCRERFD POLICIES BE CANCELLED REFORE

Tl ExFSATESN DATE TelREof =OTCE wal B OELWERED ™
ALCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PREOWSONE.

Building & - Room 340
Charteston WY 25305

bptha. Coua
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