



Department of Administration
Purchasing Division
2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder: 1992487
Solicitation Description: Addendum 01: Tree and Arborist Services
Proc Type: Agency Master Agreement

Solicitation Closes	Solicitation Response	Version
2026-08-06 10:30	SR 0803 ESR08062600000000812	1

VENDOR
VS0000022492
LaRoche Tree Service, Inc.

Solicitation Number: ARFQ 0803 DOT2700000006
Total Bid: 0
Response Date: 2026-08-06
Response Time: 09:28:01
Comments:

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Jeromie F Lanham
304-720-7383
jeromie.f.lanham@wv.gov

Vendor Signature X **FEIN#** **DATE**

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1	Traffic Control - Pilot Truck and Driver	0.00000	DAY		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
46161500			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
2	Traffic Control - Devices	0.00000	UNIT		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
46161500			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
3	Traffic Control - Traffic Flagger	0.00000	HOURL		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
46161500			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
4	Traffic Control - Arrow Board	0.00000	DAY		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
46161500			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
5	Crew Foreman/Climber Specialist	0.00000	HOURL	100.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
76122405			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACUTAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
6	Equipment Operator	0.00000	HOUR	85.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
76122405			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
7	General Laborer	0.00000	HOUR	65.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
76122405			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
8	Debris Disposal	0.00000	CY	40.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
76122407			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
9	Altec MT66-E76 Articulating Aerial Device	0.00000	HOUR		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
22101800			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
10	Altec MT66-E76 - First Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
11	Altec MT66-E76 - Additional Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
12	Aerial Bucket Truck	0.00000	HOUR	60.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
22101800			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
13	Aerial Bucket Truck - First Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE	60.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
14	Aerial Bucket Truck - Additional Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE	2.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
15	Grapple Truck	0.00000	HOUR	60.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
21102200			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
16	Grapple Truck - First Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE	60.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
17	Grapple Truck - Additional Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE	2.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
18	Excavator, Mini/Compact	0.00000	HOUR		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
22101500			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
19	Excavator, Mini/Compact - First Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
20	Excavator, Mini/Compact - Additional Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
21	Excavator - Standard, Wheeled	0.00000	HOUR		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
22101500			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
22	Excavator - Standard, Wheeled - First Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
23	Excavator - Standard, Wheeled - Additional Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
24	Excavator - Large	0.00000	HOUR	225.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
22101500			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
25	Excavator - Large - First Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE	200.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
26	Excavator - Large - Additional Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE	6.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
27	Excavator - Long Reach	0.00000	HOUR		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
22101500			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
28	Excavator - Long Reach - First Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
29	Excavator - Long Reach - Additional Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
30	Jarraff - All Terrain	0.00000	HOUR	120.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
21102200			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
31	Jarraff All Terrain - First Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE	200.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
32	Jarraff All Terrain - Additional Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE	6.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
33	Jarraff Mini	0.00000	HOUR		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
21102200			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
34	Jarraff Mini - First Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE, ATTACHMENT A - FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
35	Jarraff Mini - Additional Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
36	Knuckle Boom Crane with Grapple Saw	0.00000	HOUR		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
24101600			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTCHED PRICING PAGE, ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
37	Knuckle Boom Crane with Grapple Saw First Mile Mobilization	0.00000	HOUR		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
38	Knuckle Boom Crane with Grapple Saw Addtl Mile Mobilization	0.00000	HOUR		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
39	Single Blade High Reach Power Tree Shear	0.00000	HOUR		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
21102200			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
40	Single Blade High Reach Tree Shear - First Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
41	Single Blade High Reach Tree Shear -Addt'l Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
42	Skid Steer - Small Frame	0.00000	HOUR	25.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
22101500			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
43	Skid Steer - Small Frame - First Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE	100.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
44	Skid Steer - Small Frame - Additional Mile Mobilization	0.00000	HOUR	1.500000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
45	Skid Steer - Mid Frame	0.00000	HOUR	75.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
22101500			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
46	Skid Steer - Mid Frame - First Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE	100.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
47	Skid Steer - Mid Frame - Additional Mile Mobilization	0.00000	HOUR	1.600000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
48	Slope Mower, Compact Tractor	0.00000	HOUR		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
21101701			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
49	Slope Mower, Compact Tractor - First Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
50	Slope Mower, Compact Tractor - Additional Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
51	Spider Lift	0.00000	HOUR	90.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
22101800			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
52	Spider Lift - First Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE	100.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
53	Spider Lift - Additional Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE	1.500000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
54	Tracked Feller Buncher	0.00000	HOUR	400.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
21102200			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
55	Tracked Feller Buncher - First Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE	200.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
56	Tracked Feller Buncher - Additional Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE	6.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATATCHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
57	Tree Handler/Harvester	0.00000	HOUR	250.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
21102200			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
58	Tree Handler/Harvester - First Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE	200.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
59	Tree Handler/Harvester - Additional Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE	6.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
60	Ride On Leaf Blower	0.00000	HOUR		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
27112701			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
61	Ride on Leaf Blower - First Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
62	Ride on Leaf Blower - Additional Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
63	Crane Mats	0.00000	UNIT	525.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
24101600			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
64	Crane Mats - First Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE	100.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
65	Crane Mats - Additional Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE	1.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
66	Boom Mower Skid Steer Attachment	0.00000	UNIT		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
22101700			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
67	Boom Mower Skid Steer Attachment - First Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
68	Boom Mower Skid Steer Attachment - Addtl Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
69	Brush Cutter Skid Steer Attachment	0.00000	UNIT		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
22101700			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
70	Brush Cutter Skid Steer Attachment - First Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
71	Brush Cutter Skid Steer Attachment -Addt'l Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
72	Excavator Disc Mulcher Attachment Mini Excavator	0.00000	UNIT		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
22101700			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
73	Disc Mulcher Attachment for Mini Excavator - First Mile Mob.	0.00000	MILE		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
74	Disc Mulcher Attachment for Mini Excavator- Addt'l Mile Mob.	0.00000	MILE		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments: No Bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
75	Excavator Disc Mulcher Attachment Standard Excavator	0.00000	UNIT		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
22101700			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
76	Disc Mulcher Attachment for Standard Ex - First Mile Mob.	0.00000	MILE		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
77	Disc Mulcher Attachment for Standard Ex - Addt'l Mile Mob.	0.00000	MILE		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
78	Excavator Disc Mulcher Attachment for Large Excavator	0.00000	UNIT		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
22101700			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
79	Disc Mulcher Attachment for Large Ex -First Mile Mob.	0.00000	MILE		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
80	Disc Mulcher Attachment for Large Ex - Addt'l Mile Mob.	0.00000	UNIT		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
81	Grapple Attachment for Standard Excavator	0.00000	UNIT		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
22101700			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
82	Grapple Attachment for Standard Excavator - First Mile Mob.	0.00000	MILE		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
83	Grapple Attachment for Standard Excavator - Add'l Mile Mob.	0.00000	MILE		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
84	Grapple Attachment for Large Excavator	0.00000	UNIT	50.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
22101700			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
85	Grapple Attachment for Large Excavator - First Mile Mob.	0.00000	MILE	100.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
86	Grapple Attachment for Large Excavator - Addt'l Mile Mob.	0.00000	MILE	1.500000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
87	Brush/Log Chipper with Chip Box (up to 12in diameter logs)	0.00000	HOUR	90.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
23231800			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
88	Brush/Log Chipper (up to 12in dia.) - First Mile Mob.	0.00000	MILE	25.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
89	Brush/Log Chipper (up to 12in dia.) - Addt'l Mile Mob.	0.00000	MILE	1.900000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
90	Brush/Log Chipper With Chip Box (whole tree)	0.00000	HOUR	125.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
23231800			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
91	Brush/Log Chipper (whole tree) First Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE	25.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
92	Brush/Log Chipper (whole tree) Additional Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE	2.100000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
93	Mulching Mower	0.00000	HOUR	325.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
23231800			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
94	Mulching Mower - First Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE	200.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
95	Mulching Mower - Additional Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE	5.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
96	Horizontal Grinder	0.00000	HOUR		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
23231800			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
97	Horizontal Grinder - First Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
98	Horizontal Grinder - Additional Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
99	Stump Grinder, Tracked	0.00000	HOUR	325.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
23231800			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
100	Stump Grinder, Tracked - First Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE	200.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
101	Stump Grinder, Tracked - Additional Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE	5.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
102	Stump Grinder, Walk-behind	0.00000	HOUR	30.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
23231800			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
103	Stump Grinder, Walk-behind - First Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE	100.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
104	Stump Grinder, Walk-behind - Additional Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE	1.500000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
105	Track Chipper	0.00000	HOUR	210.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
23231800			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
106	Track Chipper - First Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE	200.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
107	Track Chipper - Additional Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE	5.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
108	Tub Grinder	0.00000	HOUR		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
23231800			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
109	Tub Grinder - First Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
110	Tub Grinder - Additional Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE		

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments: no bid

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
111	Chip Van / Trailer	0.00000	UNIT	1000.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
25181700			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
112	Chip Van / Trailer - First Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE	100.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
113	Chip Van / Trailer - Additional Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE	2.500000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
114	Chip Trailer / Lift Truck	0.00000	UNIT	1000.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
25181700			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
115	Chip Trailer / Lift Truck - First Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE	100.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
116	Chip Trailer / Lift Truck - Additional Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE	2.500000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
117	Gooseneck Dump Trailer	0.00000	UNIT	750.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
25181700			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
118	Gooseneck Dump Trailer - First Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE	100.000000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Line	Comm Ln Desc	Qty	Unit Issue	Unit Price	Ln Total Or Contract Amount
119	Gooseneck Dump Trailer - Additional Mile Mobilization	0.00000	MILE	2.500000	0.00

Comm Code	Manufacturer	Specification	Model #
78121603			

Commodity Line Comments:

Extended Description:

SEE ATTACHED PRICING PAGE - ATTACHMENT A, FOR ACTUAL COST

Tree and Arborist Services
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Vendor Instructions: Vendor shall indicate the service area (Statewide, District, or County) that correspond with the source locations and pricing indicated on this ATT A Pricing Page. Vendor shall submit a separate ATT A Pricing Page if bid pricing differs among Districts, Counties, and Source Locations.

Vendor shall also provide the physical 911 address for each source location that will provide equipment for the District, County, or Statewide locations indicated. Please attach additional pages if needed.

This is a multiple vendor award contract. All qualifying vendor meeting the contract specifications will be awarded with a contract. The low bid vendor per project will be determined at the time of need, as per Section 4 of the contract specifications. Estimated quantities are not available.

Vendor Name: LaRoche Tree Service

Source Locations: 7 Commerce Parkway
Bellaire, OH 43906

*Please attach any additional source locations if necessary.

District 1	District 2	District 3	District 4	District 5	District 6	District 7	District 8	District 9	District 10
☐ Boone	☐ Cabell	☐ Calhoun	☐ Doddridge	☐ Berkeley	☒ Brooke	☐ Barbour	☐ Pendleton	☐ Fayette	☐ McDowell
☐ Clay	☐ Lincoln	☐ Jackson	☐ Harrison	☐ Grant	☒ Hancock	☐ Braxton	☐ Pocahontas	☐ Greenbrier	☐ Mercer
☐ Kanawha	☐ Logan	☐ Pleasants	☐ Marion	☐ Hampshire	☒ Marshall	☐ Gilmer	☐ Randolph	☐ Monroe	☐ Raleigh
☐ Mason	☐ Mingo	☐ Ritchie	☐ Monongalia	☐ Hardy	☒ Ohio	☐ Lewis	☐ Tucker	☐ Nicholas	☐ Wyoming
☐ Putnam	☐ Wayne	☐ Roane	☐ Preston	☐ Jefferson	☒ Tyler	☐ Upshur		☐ Summers	
		☐ Wirt	☐ Taylor	☐ Mineral	☒ Wetzel	☐ Webster			
		☐ Wood		☐ Morgan					

Contract Item #	Contract Item Description	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Mobilization First Mile	Mobilization Additional Mile
<i>Traffic Control Items</i>					
1	Traffic Control - Pilot Truck and Driver Description in Vendors Billing System:	Day		----	----
2	Traffic Control - Devices Description in Vendors Billing System:	Unit		----	----
3	Traffic Control - Traffic Flagger Description in Vendors Billing System:	Hour		----	----

Tree and Arborist Services
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Vendor Name: LaRoche Tree Service

Source Locations: 7 Commerce Parkway
Bellaire, OH 43906

*Please attach any additional source locations if necessary.

District 1	District 2	District 3	District 4	District 5	District 6	District 7	District 8	District 9	District 10
☐ Boone	☐ Cabell	☐ Calhoun	☐ Doddridge	☐ Berkeley	☒ Brooke	☐ Barbour	☐ Pendleton	☐ Fayette	☐ McDowell
☐ Clay	☐ Lincoln	☐ Jackson	☐ Harrison	☐ Grant	☒ Hancock	☐ Braxton	☐ Pocahontas	☐ Greenbrier	☐ Mercer
☐ Kanawha	☐ Logan	☐ Pleasants	☐ Marion	☐ Hampshire	☒ Marshall	☐ Gilmer	☐ Randolph	☐ Monroe	☐ Raleigh
☐ Mason	☐ Mingo	☐ Ritchie	☐ Monongalia	☐ Hardy	☒ Ohio	☐ Lewis	☐ Tucker	☐ Nicholas	☐ Wyoming
☐ Putnam	☐ Wayne	☐ Roane	☐ Preston	☐ Jefferson	☒ Tyler	☐ Upshur		☐ Summers	
		☐ Wirt	☐ Taylor	☐ Mineral	☒ Wetzel	☐ Webster			
		☐ Wood		☐ Morgan					

Contract Item #	Contract Item Description	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Mobilization First Mile	Mobilization Additional Mile
4	Traffic Control - Traffic Arrow Board Description in Vendors Billing System:	Day		----	----
Site Management					
5	Crew Foreman/Climber Specialist Description in Vendors Billing System:	Hour	\$100.00	----	----
6	Equipment Operator Description in Vendors Billing System:	Hour	\$85.00	----	----
7	General Laborer Description in Vendors Billing System:	Hour	\$65.00	----	----
8	Debris Disposal Description in Vendors Billing System:	CY	\$40.00	----	----

Tree and Arborist Services
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Vendor Name: LaRoche Tree Service

Source Locations: 7 Commerce Parkway
Bellaire, OH 43906

*Please attach any additional source locations if necessary.

District 1	District 2	District 3	District 4	District 5	District 6	District 7	District 8	District 9	District 10
☐ Boone	☐ Cabell	☐ Calhoun	☐ Doddridge	☐ Berkeley	☒ Brooke	☐ Barbour	☐ Pendleton	☐ Fayette	☐ McDowell
☐ Clay	☐ Lincoln	☐ Jackson	☐ Harrison	☐ Grant	☒ Hancock	☐ Braxton	☐ Pocahontas	☐ Greenbrier	☐ Mercer
☐ Kanawha	☐ Logan	☐ Pleasants	☐ Marion	☐ Hampshire	☒ Marshall	☐ Gilmer	☐ Randolph	☐ Monroe	☐ Raleigh
☐ Mason	☐ Mingo	☐ Ritchie	☐ Monongalia	☐ Hardy	☒ Ohio	☐ Lewis	☐ Tucker	☐ Nicholas	☐ Wyoming
☐ Putnam	☐ Wayne	☐ Roane	☐ Preston	☐ Jefferson	☒ Tyler	☐ Upshur		☐ Summers	
		☐ Wirt	☐ Taylor	☐ Mineral	☒ Wetzel	☐ Webster			
		☐ Wood		☐ Morgan					

Contract Item #	Contract Item Description	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Mobilization First Mile	Mobilization Additional Mile
<i>Aerial, Cutting, & Earthmoving Equipment</i>					
9	Insulated Grapple Saw Truck with a Remote Controlled Tree Timmer: Must have a minimum reach of 50 ft, Lower Boom Articulation of 0° to °120, and Upper Boom Articulation of °0 to °260. Description in Vendors Billing System:	Hour			
10	Aerial Bucket Truck: Over-center Articulated. Minimum vertical reach of 50 feet above a roadway and a minimum horizontal reach of 30 feet. Description in Vendors Billing System:	Hour	\$60.00	\$60.00	\$2.00
11	Grapple Truck Description in Vendors Billing System:	Hour	\$60.00	\$60.00	\$2.00
12	Excavator - Mini/Compact Description in Vendors Billing System:	Hour			
13	Excavator - Standard, Wheeled Description in Vendors Billing System:	Hour			

Tree and Arborist Services
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Vendor Name: LaRoche Tree Service

Source Locations: 7 Commerce Parkway
Bellaire, OH 43906

*Please attach any additional source locations if necessary.

District 1	District 2	District 3	District 4	District 5	District 6	District 7	District 8	District 9	District 10
☐ Boone	☐ Cabell	☐ Calhoun	☐ Doddridge	☐ Berkeley	☒ Brooke	☐ Barbour	☐ Pendleton	☐ Fayette	☐ McDowell
☐ Clay	☐ Lincoln	☐ Jackson	☐ Harrison	☐ Grant	☒ Hancock	☐ Braxton	☐ Pocahontas	☐ Greenbrier	☐ Mercer
☐ Kanawha	☐ Logan	☐ Pleasants	☐ Marion	☐ Hampshire	☒ Marshall	☐ Gilmer	☐ Randolph	☐ Monroe	☐ Raleigh
☐ Mason	☐ Mingo	☐ Ritchie	☐ Monongalia	☐ Hardy	☒ Ohio	☐ Lewis	☐ Tucker	☐ Nicholas	☐ Wyoming
☐ Putnam	☐ Wayne	☐ Roane	☐ Preston	☐ Jefferson	☒ Tyler	☐ Upshur		☐ Summers	
		☐ Wirt	☐ Taylor	☐ Mineral	☒ Wetzel	☐ Webster			
		☐ Wood		☐ Morgan					

Contract Item #	Contract Item Description	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Mobilization First Mile	Mobilization Additional Mile
14	Excavator - Large, full swing capability. 20-50 ton Description in Vendors Billing System:	Hour	\$225.00	\$200.00	\$6.00
15	Excavator - Long reach, full swing capability. 20-50 ton Description in Vendors Billing System:	Hour			
16	Jarraf - All Terrain: 75 ft. max telescopic boom reach. 180° saw head rotation. 360° rotation on turntable. Description in Vendors Billing System:	Hour	\$120.00	\$200.00	\$6.00
17	Jarraf - Mini: 55 ft. max telescopic boom reach. 180° saw head rotation. 360° rotation on turntable. Description in Vendors Billing System:	Hour			
18	Knuckle Boom Crane with Grapple Saw: Minimum 40 ft. vertical reach. Minimum 14 in. diameter cutting/grasping capabilities. Minimum 3,700 lb. horizontal reach lifting capacity. Rubber tire chassis with outriggers. 360° rotation on chassis. Description in Vendors Billing System:	Hour			

Tree and Arborist Services
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Vendor Name: LaRoche Tree Service

Source Locations: 7 Commerce Parkway
Bellaire, OH 43906

*Please attach any additional source locations if necessary.

District 1	District 2	District 3	District 4	District 5	District 6	District 7	District 8	District 9	District 10
☐ Boone	☐ Cabell	☐ Calhoun	☐ Doddridge	☐ Berkeley	☒ Brooke	☐ Barbour	☐ Pendleton	☐ Fayette	☐ McDowell
☐ Clay	☐ Lincoln	☐ Jackson	☐ Harrison	☐ Grant	☒ Hancock	☐ Braxton	☐ Pocahontas	☐ Greenbrier	☐ Mercer
☐ Kanawha	☐ Logan	☐ Pleasants	☐ Marion	☐ Hampshire	☒ Marshall	☐ Gilmer	☐ Randolph	☐ Monroe	☐ Raleigh
☐ Mason	☐ Mingo	☐ Ritchie	☐ Monongalia	☐ Hardy	☒ Ohio	☐ Lewis	☐ Tucker	☐ Nicholas	☐ Wyoming
☐ Putnam	☐ Wayne	☐ Roane	☐ Preston	☐ Jefferson	☒ Tyler	☐ Upshur		☐ Summers	
		☐ Wirt	☐ Taylor	☐ Mineral	☒ Wetzel	☐ Webster			
		☐ Wood		☐ Morgan					

Contract Item #	Contract Item Description	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Mobilization First Mile	Mobilization Additional Mile
19	Single Blade High Reach Power Tree Shear: Carrying vehicle should be able to traverse through rough terrain. Unit must be capable of saw cutting trees and brush vertically from as low as 6 ft. above ground, a vertical reach of 50 ft., and a horizontal reach of at least 10 ft. beyond the edge of the carrying vehicle tires. Description in Vendors Billing System:	Hour			
20	Skid Steer - Small Frame: Rated operating capacity less than 1,750 lbs. Less than 50 horsepower. Description in Vendors Billing System:	Hour	\$25.00	\$100.00	\$1.50
21	Skid Steer - Mid Frame, Wheeled/Track Loader: Rated operating capacity from 1,750 - 2,200 lbs. 50-70 horsepower. Description in Vendors Billing System:	Hour	\$75.00	\$100.00	\$1.60
22	Slope Mower - Compact Tractor: Minimum 30° slope rating Description in Vendors Billing System:	Hour			

Tree and Arborist Services
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Vendor Name: LaRoche Tree Service

Source Locations: 7 Commerce Parkway
Bellaire, OH 43906

*Please attach any additional source locations if necessary.

District 1	District 2	District 3	District 4	District 5	District 6	District 7	District 8	District 9	District 10
☐ Boone	☐ Cabell	☐ Calhoun	☐ Doddridge	☐ Berkeley	☒ Brooke	☐ Barbour	☐ Pendleton	☐ Fayette	☐ McDowell
☐ Clay	☐ Lincoln	☐ Jackson	☐ Harrison	☐ Grant	☒ Hancock	☐ Braxton	☐ Pocahontas	☐ Greenbrier	☐ Mercer
☐ Kanawha	☐ Logan	☐ Pleasants	☐ Marion	☐ Hampshire	☒ Marshall	☐ Gilmer	☐ Randolph	☐ Monroe	☐ Raleigh
☐ Mason	☐ Mingo	☐ Ritchie	☐ Monongalia	☐ Hardy	☒ Ohio	☐ Lewis	☐ Tucker	☐ Nicholas	☐ Wyoming
☐ Putnam	☐ Wayne	☐ Roane	☐ Preston	☐ Jefferson	☒ Tyler	☐ Upshur		☐ Summers	
		☐ Wirt	☐ Taylor	☐ Mineral	☒ Wetzel	☐ Webster			
		☐ Wood		☐ Morgan					

Contract Item #	Contract Item Description	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Mobilization First Mile	Mobilization Additional Mile
23	Spider Lift: Minimum 72 ft. working height. Minimum 41 ft. slide reach. Description in Vendors Billing System:	Hour	\$90.00	\$100.00	\$1.50
24	Tracked Feller Buncher: Minimum 27 ft. reach. 360° rotating bunching head. Description in Vendors Billing System:	Hour	\$400.00	\$200.00	\$6.00
25	Tree Handler/Harvester: Rubber tied undercarriage. 4 point outrigger support. Felling head with 360° capabilities. Description in Vendors Billing System:	Hour	\$250.00	\$200.00	\$6.00
26	Ride on Leaf Blower Description in Vendors Billing System:	Hour			
Accessories & Attachments					
27	Crane Mats: Must meet the minimum industry standard size of 4'x16'x8'. Description in Vendors Billing System:	Unit	\$525.00	\$100.00	\$1.00

Tree and Arborist Services
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Vendor Name: LaRoche Tree Service

Source Locations: 7 Commerce Parkway
Bellaire, OH 43906

*Please attach any additional source locations if necessary.

District 1	District 2	District 3	District 4	District 5	District 6	District 7	District 8	District 9	District 10
☐ Boone	☐ Cabell	☐ Calhoun	☐ Doddridge	☐ Berkeley	☒ Brooke	☐ Barbour	☐ Pendleton	☐ Fayette	☐ McDowell
☐ Clay	☐ Lincoln	☐ Jackson	☐ Harrison	☐ Grant	☒ Hancock	☐ Braxton	☐ Pocahontas	☐ Greenbrier	☐ Mercer
☐ Kanawha	☐ Logan	☐ Pleasants	☐ Marion	☐ Hampshire	☒ Marshall	☐ Gilmer	☐ Randolph	☐ Monroe	☐ Raleigh
☐ Mason	☐ Mingo	☐ Ritchie	☐ Monongalia	☐ Hardy	☒ Ohio	☐ Lewis	☐ Tucker	☐ Nicholas	☐ Wyoming
☐ Putnam	☐ Wayne	☐ Roane	☐ Preston	☐ Jefferson	☒ Tyler	☐ Upshur		☐ Summers	
		☐ Wirt	☐ Taylor	☐ Mineral	☒ Wetzel	☐ Webster			
		☐ Wood		☐ Morgan					

Contract Item #	Contract Item Description	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Mobilization First Mile	Mobilization Additional Mile
28	Boom Mower Skid Steer Attachment: Minimum 60 in. rotary mower head Description in Vendors Billing System:	Unit			
29	Brush Cutter Skid Steer Attachment: Minimum 3 in. Diameter cutting capacity Description in Vendors Billing System:	Unit			
30	Excavator Forestry Disc Mulcher Attachment for Mini Excavator 3 to 10 Tons Description in Vendors Billing System:	Unit			
31	Excavator Forestry Disc Mulcher Attachment for Standard Excavator 11 to 18 Tons Description in Vendors Billing System:	Unit			
32	Excavator Forestry Disc Mulcher Attachment for Large Excavator 18 + Tons Description in Vendors Billing System:	Unit			

Tree and Arborist Services
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Vendor Name: LaRoche Tree Service

Source Locations: 7 Commerce Parkway
Bellaire, OH 43906

*Please attach any additional source locations if necessary.

District 1	District 2	District 3	District 4	District 5	District 6	District 7	District 8	District 9	District 10
☐ Boone	☐ Cabell	☐ Calhoun	☐ Doddridge	☐ Berkeley	☒ Brooke	☐ Barbour	☐ Pendleton	☐ Fayette	☐ McDowell
☐ Clay	☐ Lincoln	☐ Jackson	☐ Harrison	☐ Grant	☒ Hancock	☐ Braxton	☐ Pocahontas	☐ Greenbrier	☐ Mercer
☐ Kanawha	☐ Logan	☐ Pleasants	☐ Marion	☐ Hampshire	☒ Marshall	☐ Gilmer	☐ Randolph	☐ Monroe	☐ Raleigh
☐ Mason	☐ Mingo	☐ Ritchie	☐ Monongalia	☐ Hardy	☒ Ohio	☐ Lewis	☐ Tucker	☐ Nicholas	☐ Wyoming
☐ Putnam	☐ Wayne	☐ Roane	☐ Preston	☐ Jefferson	☒ Tyler	☐ Upshur		☐ Summers	
		☐ Wirt	☐ Taylor	☐ Mineral	☒ Wetzel	☐ Webster			
		☐ Wood		☐ Morgan					

Contract Item #	Contract Item Description	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Mobilization First Mile	Mobilization Additional Mile
33	Grapple Attachment for Standard, Wheeled, Excavator: 360° rotation Description in Vendors Billing System:	Unit			
34	Grapple Attachment for Large Excavators: 360° rotation Description in Vendors Billing System:	Unit	\$50.00	\$100.00	\$1.50
Chipping & Grinding Equipment					
35	Brush/Log Chipper with Chip Box: Up to 12 in. diameter log capabilities. Must include a standard 2 ton truck with chip box (10 cubic yards). Vendor shall bid as one inclusive price. Description in Vendors Billing System:	Hour	\$90.00	\$25.00	\$1.90
36	Brush/Log Chipper with Chip Box: Whole tree chipper. Must include a standard 2 ton truck with chip box (20 cubic yards). Vendor shall bid as one inclusive price. Description in Vendors Billing System:	Hour	\$125.00	\$25.00	\$2.10

Tree and Arborist Services
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Vendor Name: LaRoche Tree Service

Source Locations: 7 Commerce Parkway
Bellaire, OH 43906

*Please attach any additional source locations if necessary.

District 1	District 2	District 3	District 4	District 5	District 6	District 7	District 8	District 9	District 10
☐ Boone	☐ Cabell	☐ Calhoun	☐ Doddridge	☐ Berkeley	☒ Brooke	☐ Barbour	☐ Pendleton	☐ Fayette	☐ McDowell
☐ Clay	☐ Lincoln	☐ Jackson	☐ Harrison	☐ Grant	☒ Hancock	☐ Braxton	☐ Pocahontas	☐ Greenbrier	☐ Mercer
☐ Kanawha	☐ Logan	☐ Pleasants	☐ Marion	☐ Hampshire	☒ Marshall	☐ Gilmer	☐ Randolph	☐ Monroe	☐ Raleigh
☐ Mason	☐ Mingo	☐ Ritchie	☐ Monongalia	☐ Hardy	☒ Ohio	☐ Lewis	☐ Tucker	☐ Nicholas	☐ Wyoming
☐ Putnam	☐ Wayne	☐ Roane	☐ Preston	☐ Jefferson	☒ Tyler	☐ Upshur		☐ Summers	
		☐ Wirt	☐ Taylor	☐ Mineral	☒ Wetzel	☐ Webster			
		☐ Wood		☐ Morgan					

Contract Item #	Contract Item Description	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Mobilization First Mile	Mobilization Additional Mile
37	Mulching Mower: Capable of grinding brush and debris into mulch that can be spread evenly over a cutting without causing a blockage to drainage areas. The unit must be safe for roadside use. Description in Vendors Billing System:	Hour	\$325.00	\$200.00	\$5.00
38	Horizontal Grinder Description in Vendors Billing System:	Hour			
39	Stump Grinder, Tracked Description in Vendors Billing System:	Hour	\$325.00	\$200.00	\$5.00
40	Stump Grinder, Walk-behind Description in Vendors Billing System:	Hour	\$30.00	\$100.00	\$1.50
41	Track Chipper Description in Vendors Billing System:	Hour	\$210.00	\$200.00	\$5.00

Tree and Arborist Services
ATTACHMENT A PRICING PAGE (ATT A)

Vendor Name: LaRoche Tree Service

Source Locations: 7 Commerce Parkway
Bellaire, OH 43906

*Please attach any additional source locations if necessary.

District 1	District 2	District 3	District 4	District 5	District 6	District 7	District 8	District 9	District 10
☐ Boone	☐ Cabell	☐ Calhoun	☐ Doddridge	☐ Berkeley	☒ Brooke	☐ Barbour	☐ Pendleton	☐ Fayette	☐ McDowell
☐ Clay	☐ Lincoln	☐ Jackson	☐ Harrison	☐ Grant	☒ Hancock	☐ Braxton	☐ Pocahontas	☐ Greenbrier	☐ Mercer
☐ Kanawha	☐ Logan	☐ Pleasants	☐ Marion	☐ Hampshire	☒ Marshall	☐ Gilmer	☐ Randolph	☐ Monroe	☐ Raleigh
☐ Mason	☐ Mingo	☐ Ritchie	☐ Monongalia	☐ Hardy	☒ Ohio	☐ Lewis	☐ Tucker	☐ Nicholas	☐ Wyoming
☐ Putnam	☐ Wayne	☐ Roane	☐ Preston	☐ Jefferson	☒ Tyler	☐ Upshur		☐ Summers	
		☐ Wirt	☐ Taylor	☐ Mineral	☒ Wetzel	☐ Webster			
		☐ Wood		☐ Morgan					

Contract Item #	Contract Item Description	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Mobilization First Mile	Mobilization Additional Mile
42	Tub Grinder Description in Vendors Billing System:	Hour			
<i>Trucks & Trailers</i>					
43	Chip Van / Trailer Description in Vendors Billing System:	Unit	\$1,000.00	\$100.00	\$2.50
44	Chip Truck / Lift Truck Description in Vendors Billing System:	Unit	\$1,000.00	\$100.00	\$2.50
45	Gooseneck Dump Trailer Description in Vendors Billing System:	Unit	\$750.00	\$100.00	\$2.50